
Sentencing Act 2020 (c. 17)
SCHEDULE 22 – Amendments of the Sentencing Code and related amendments of other legislation
Document Generated: 2024-06-14

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 22

AMENDMENTS OF THE SENTENCING CODE AND
RELATED AMENDMENTS OF OTHER LEGISLATION

PART 5

CUSTODIAL SENTENCES

Increase in magistrates’ court’s power to impose imprisonment
24 (1) Section 224 (general limit on magistrates’ court’s power to impose imprisonment or

detention in a young offender institution) is amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (1), for “6 months” substitute “12 months”.

(3) In subsection (2), for “6 months” substitute “12 months”.


