
Changes to legislation: Defence Reform Act 2014, Section 45 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 February 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made

appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Defence Reform Act 2014
2014 CHAPTER 20

PART 3

RESERVE FORCES

45 Call out of members of reserve forces

(1) In Part 4 of the Reserve Forces Act 1996 (special agreements for call out), in
section 28(3)(a) (maximum period of service), for “9 months” substitute “ 12 months ”.

(2) Part 6 of that Act (call out for permanent service) is amended as follows.

(3) In section 54(1) (call out for warlike operations), after “order” insert “ under this
section ”.

(4) In section 56 (call out for certain operations), for subsections (1) and (1A) substitute—

“(1B) The Secretary of State may make an order under this section authorising the
calling out of members of a reserve force if it appears to the Secretary of State
that it is necessary or desirable to use members of a reserve force for any
purpose for which members of the regular services may be used.”

(5) In the heading of that section, for “operations” substitute “ purposes ”.

(6) In section 57 (maximum duration of service for call out under section 56)—
(a) in subsection (4), for “9 months” substitute “ 12 months ”,
(b) in subsection (6), for “9 months” substitute “ 12 months ”,
(c) in subsection (8)(c), for “3 months” substitute “ 6 months ”, and
(d) in subsection (11), for “27 months” substitute “ 3 years ”.

(7) In section 57A (agreement to alter limits in section 57), in subsection (3), for “9
months” substitute “ 12 months ”.

(8) In section 64 (interpretation of Part 6)—
(a) number the existing text as subsection (1), and
(b) after that subsection insert—



2 Defence Reform Act 2014 (c. 20)
Part 3 – Reserve forces

Document Generated: 2024-02-29
Changes to legislation: Defence Reform Act 2014, Section 45 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or

before 29 February 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

“(2) The powers under sections 52, 54 and 56 to make a call-out order are
each to be interpreted as including power to do so in circumstances in
which an order could also be made under another of those sections.”

(9) Schedule 6 contains provision about transitional classes.

(10) In consequence of the amendments made by this section, omit section 28 of the Armed
Forces Act 2011.

Commencement Information
I1 S. 45 in force at 1.10.2014 by S.I. 2014/2370, art. 4(b)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2014/20/section/45
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/2370
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/2370/article/4/b


Defence Reform Act 2014 (c. 20)
Document Generated: 2024-02-29

3

Changes to legislation: 
Defence Reform Act 2014, Section 45 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on
or before 29 February 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date.
Changes that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– s. 25(8A) inserted by 2023 c. 54 Sch. 10 para. 13(3)
– s. 35A inserted by 2023 c. 54 Sch. 10 para. 19

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/54
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/54/schedule/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/54/schedule/10/paragraph/13/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/54
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/54/schedule/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/54/schedule/10/paragraph/19

