
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

Fraud Act 2006
2006 CHAPTER 35

Fraud

10 Participating in fraudulent business carried on by company etc.: penalty

(1) In Schedule 24 to the Companies Act 1985 (punishment of offences), in column 4 of
the entry relating to section 458 of that Act, for “7 years” substitute “10 years”.

(2) In Schedule 23 to the Companies (Northern Ireland) Order 1986 (punishment of
offences), in column 4 of the entry relating to Article 451 of that Order, for “7 years”
substitute “10 years”.


