
Changes to legislation: Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004, Section 51 is up to date with all changes known to be
in force on or before 24 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been
made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Planning and Compulsory
Purchase Act 2004

2004 CHAPTER 5

PART 4

DEVELOPMENT CONTROL

Miscellaneous

51 Duration of permission and consent

(1) Section 91 of the principal Act (limit on duration of planning permission) is amended
as follows—

(a) [F1in subsections (1)(a) and (3) for the words “five years” there is substituted
“ three years ”;]

(b) after subsection (3) there are inserted the following subsections—

“(3A) Subsection (3B) applies if any proceedings are begun to challenge the
validity of a grant of planning permission or of a deemed grant of
planning permission.

(3B) The period before the end of which the development to which the
planning permission relates is required to be begun in pursuance of
subsection (1) or (3) must be taken to be extended by one year.

(3C) Nothing in this section prevents the development being begun from
the time the permission is granted or deemed to be granted.”

(2) [F2In section 92 of that Act (outline planning permission)—
(a) in subsection (2)(b) sub-paragraph (i) is omitted;
(b) in subsection (2)(b) in sub-paragraph (ii) the words “if later” are omitted;
(c) in subsection (4) “five years” is omitted.]



2 Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004 (c. 5)
Part 4 – Development control

Document Generated: 2024-04-24
Changes to legislation: Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004, Section 51 is up to date with all changes known to be

in force on or before 24 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been
made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

(3) In section 73 of the principal Act (applications to develop land without compliance
with existing conditions) after subsection (4) there is inserted the following
subsection—

“(5) Planning permission must not be granted under this section to the extent
that it has effect to change a condition subject to which a previous planning
permission was granted by extending the time within which—

(a) a development must be started;
(b) an application for approval of reserved matters (within the meaning

of section 92) must be made.”

(4) Section 18 of the listed buildings Act (limit of duration of listed buildings consent)
is amended as follows—

(a) in subsections (1)(a) and (2) for the words “five years” there is substituted “
three years ”;

(b) after subsection (2) there are inserted the following subsections—

“(2A) Subsection (2B) applies if any proceedings are begun to challenge the
validity of a grant of listed building consent or of a deemed grant of
listed building consent.

(2B) The period before the end of which the works to which the consent
relates are required to be begun in pursuance of subsection (1) or (2)
must be taken to be extended by one year.

(2C) Nothing in this section prevents the works being begun from the time
the consent is granted.”

(5) In section 19 of that Act (variation or discharge of conditions) after subsection (4)
there is inserted the following subsection—

“(5) But a variation or discharge of conditions under this section must not—
(a) vary a condition subject to which a consent was granted by extending

the time within which the works must be started;
(b) discharge such a condition.”

(6) This section has effect only in relation to applications made under the principal Act
or the listed buildings Act which are received by the local planning authority after the
commencement of the section.

Textual Amendments
F1 S. 51(1)(a) omitted (6.9.2015 for specified purposes, 16.3.2016 in so far as not already in force) by

virtue of Planning (Wales) Act 2015 (anaw 4), ss. 35(8), 58(2)(b)(4)(b); S.I. 2016/52, art. 5(b) (with
art. 13)

F2 S. 51(2) omitted (6.9.2015 for specified purposes, 16.3.2016 in so far as not already in force) by virtue
of Planning (Wales) Act 2015 (anaw 4), ss. 36(7), 58(2)(b)(4)(b); S.I. 2016/52, art. 5(b) (with art. 13)

Commencement Information
I1 S. 51 in force at 24.8.2005 for E. by S.I. 2005/2081, art. 2(c) (with art. 4(2))
I2 S. 51(1)(b) in force at 22.6.2015 for specified purposes for W. by S.I. 2015/340, art. 3

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4/section/35/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4/section/58/2/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4/section/58/4/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2016/52
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2016/52/article/5/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2016/52/article/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4/section/36/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4/section/58/2/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/anaw/2015/4/section/58/4/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2016/52
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2016/52/article/5/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2016/52/article/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/2081
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/2081/article/2/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/2081/article/4/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/340
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/340/article/3


Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004 (c. 5)
Document Generated: 2024-04-24

3

Changes to legislation: 
Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004, Section 51 is up to date with all changes known
to be in force on or before 24 April 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force
at a future date. Changes that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with
annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to :
– specified provision(s) amendment to earlier commencing SI 2006/1061 art. 4 by S.I.

2010/321 art. 3
– specified provision(s) amendment to earlier commencing SI 2007/1369 art. 3 by S.I.

2010/321 art. 4

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– s. 15A-15LH and cross-heading substituted for s. 15-37 and cross-heading by 2023

c. 55 Sch. 7
– s. 38(2A) substituted for s. 38(2)(3) by 2023 c. 55 s. 92(3)
– s. 38(5A)-(5C) inserted by 2023 c. 55 s. 93(2)
– s. 38(9A) substituted for s. 38(9) by 2023 c. 55 s. 92(4)
– s. 38(9B) inserted by 2023 c. 55 s. 93(4)
– s. 38B(A1) inserted by 2023 c. 55 s. 98(2)
– s. 38B(2B)(2C) inserted by 2023 c. 55 s. 98(3)
– s. 38C(5)(d)(i)-(iii) and word substituted for words by 2023 c. 55 s. 99(2)
– s. 39(1)(ba) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 21(b)
– s. 39A and cross-heading inserted by 2023 c. 55 s. 100
– s. 45(A1) inserted by 2011 c. 20 Sch. 8 para. 14(2)
– s. 113(1)(bb)-(bd) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 23(2)(a)
– s. 113(9)(f)(g) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 23(3)(c)
– s. 113(13) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 23(5)
– s. 122(5)(za)(zb) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 25(a)
– Sch. A2 para. 11(2)(da) inserted by 2023 c. 55 s. 99(3)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 2(1A) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(3)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 6(1A) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(7)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZC(1A) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(11)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 7C(1A) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(14)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(7A) inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(g)
– Sch. A1 para. 1 substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(2)
– Sch. A1 para. 2(4) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(3)(c)
– Sch. A1 para. 3(1) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(4)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 5 substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(6)
– Sch. A1 para. 6(4) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(7)(c)
– Sch. A1 para. 7(1) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(8)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZB substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(10)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZC(4) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(11)(c)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZD(1) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(12)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 7B substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(13)
– Sch. A1 para. 7C(4) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(14)(c)
– Sch. A1 para. 7D(1) substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(15)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 10 substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(18)
– Sch. A2 para. 11(2)(ca) substituted for Sch. A2 para. 11(2)(c) by 2023 c. 55 s. 99(3)

(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZA word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(9)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(2)(a) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(b)(ii)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/321
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/321
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/321/article/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/321
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/321
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/321/article/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/92/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/93/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/92/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/93/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/98/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/98/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/99/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/21/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/100
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/20/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/20/schedule/8/paragraph/14/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/23/2/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/23/3/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/23/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/25/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/99/3/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/3/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/7/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/11/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/14/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/g
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/3/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/4/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/7/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/8/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/11/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/12/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/14/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/15/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/18
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/99/3/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/section/99/3/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/9
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/b/ii


4 Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004 (c. 5)
Document Generated: 2024-04-24

– Sch. A1 para. 8(3)(b) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(c)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(6) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(e)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(7) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(f)(iii)
– Sch. A1 para. 9 word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(17)
– Sch. A1 para. 13(1) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(20)(a)(iii)
– Sch. A1 para. 13(2) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(20)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 13(3) word substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(20)(c)
– Sch. A1 para. 13(1) words inserted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(20)(a)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 3(3)(a) words omitted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(4)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 7(3)(a) words omitted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(8)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZD(3)(a) words omitted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(12)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 7D(3)(a) words omitted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(15)(b)
– Sch. A1 para. 2(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(3)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 3(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(4)(c)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 3(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(4)(c)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 4 words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(5)
– Sch. A1 para. 6(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(7)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 7(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(8)(c)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 7(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(8)(c)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZC(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(11)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZD(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(12)(c)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 7ZD(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(12)(c)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 7C(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(14)(a)
– Sch. A1 para. 7D(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(15)(c)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 7D(4) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(15)(c)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(a)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(a)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(2) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(b)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(2)(a) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(b)(iii)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(5) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(d)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(5) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(d)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(5) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(d)(iii)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(7)(a) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(f)(i)
– Sch. A1 para. 8(7)(b) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(16)(f)(ii)
– Sch. A1 para. 11 words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(19)
– Sch. A1 para. 13(1) words substituted by 2023 c. 55 Sch. 8 para. 26(20)(a)(i)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/e
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/f/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/17
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/20/a/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/20/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/20/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/20/a/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/4/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/8/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/12/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/15/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/3/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/4/c/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/4/c/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/7/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/8/c/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/8/c/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/11/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/12/c/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/12/c/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/14/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/15/c/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/15/c/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/a/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/a/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/b/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/b/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/d/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/d/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/d/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/f/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/16/f/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/19
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2023/55/schedule/8/paragraph/26/20/a/i

