
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
Finance Act 2001, Cross Heading: Miscellaneous. (See end of Document for details)

Finance Act 2001
2001 CHAPTER 9

PART 5

MISCELLANEOUS AND SUPPLEMENTARY PROVISIONS

Miscellaneous

F1F2[107]Interest on unpaid tax, etc.: foot-and-mouth disease

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

Textual Amendments
F1 S. 107 omitted (21.7.2008) by virtue of Finance Act 2008 (c. 9), s. 135(13)
F2 S. 107 shall cease to have effect (prosp.) by virtue of 2001 c. 9, s. 107(5)

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C1 S. 107 applied (with modifications) (12.5.2001) by S.I. 2001/1818, reg. 2(1)

108 Trading funds

(1) Section 2C of the Government Trading Funds Act 1973 (c. 63) (limits on borrowing
and public dividend capital) is amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (3) (upper limit on aggregate of borrowing etc. maxima of trading funds),
for “£2,000 million” substitute “ £8,000 million ”.

(3) In subsection (4) (power to increase limit in subsection (3) but not above £4,000
million), for “£4,000 million” substitute “ £10,000 million ”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2008/9
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2008/9/section/135/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2001/9
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2001/9/section/107/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1818
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1818/regulation/2/1


2 Finance Act 2001 (c. 9)
Document Generated: 2024-01-18

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Finance Act 2001, Cross Heading:
Miscellaneous.


