
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
Finance Act 1995, Cross Heading: Vehicle excise duty. (See end of Document for details)

Finance Act 1995
1995 CHAPTER 4

PART I

DUTIES OF EXCISE

Vehicle excise duty

18 Increased rates on 30th November 1994.

(1) Schedule 1 to the M1Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994 (annual rates of duty)
shall be amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph 1(b) (rate for vehicle constructed after 1946 and for which no other rate
is specified) for “£130” there shall be substituted “ £135 ”.

(3) In paragraph 3(1)(a) (rate for hackney carriage with seating capacity under nine) for
“£130” there shall be substituted “ £135 ”.

(4) In paragraph 10 (trailer supplement)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£130” there shall be substituted “ £135 ”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (3) for “£360” there shall be substituted “ £370 ”.

(5) This section shall apply in relation to licences taken out on or after 30th November
1994.

Marginal Citations
M1 1994 c. 22.

19 Vehicle excise and registration: other provisions.

Schedule 4 to this Act (which contains other provisions relating to vehicle excise and
registration) shall have effect.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/22


2 Finance Act 1995 (c. 4)
Document Generated: 2024-04-20

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Finance Act 1995, Cross Heading:
Vehicle excise duty.


