
Criminal Justice Act 1991 (c. 53)
SCHEDULE 12 – Transitional Provisions and Savings
Document Generated: 2023-12-27

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 12

TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS AND SAVINGS

Supervision orders
20 (1) In relation to pre-existing failures to comply with the requirements of supervision

orders, section 15 of the 1969 Act as substituted by Schedule 7 to this Act shall apply
as if—

(a) in subsection (3)(a), for “£1,000” there were substituted “£100”;
(b) in subsection (5)(b), for “£5,000” there were substituted “£2,000”; and
(c) in subsection (5)(c), for “£5,000” there were substituted the words “£2,000

in the case of a person who has attained the age of 18 years and £400 in the
case of a person who has not attained that age”.

(2) In this paragraph “pre-existing” means occurring before the commencement of
section 66 of this Act and that Schedule.


