
Status: Point in time view as at 01/01/1996.
Changes to legislation: Criminal Law Act 1977, Section 58 is up to date with all changes known to be in force

on or before 03 June 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that
have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Criminal Law Act 1977
1977 CHAPTER 45

PART IV

MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

58 Proceedings involving persons under 17: increase of certain pecuniary limits. X1

(1) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . F1

(2) In section 2(13) of the M1Children and Young Persons Act 1969 (by virtue of which
the maximum amount for which the parent or guardian of a child or young person
can be required by an order under section 1 of that Act to enter into a recognisance to
take proper care of and exercise proper control over him is £50), for the words “fifty
pounds” there shall be substituted the words “£200”.

F2(3) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

(4) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . F1

(5) In section 15(4) of the said Act of 1969 (powers of a magistrates’ court other than a
juvenile court in respect of failure by the supervised person to comply with certain
requirements of a supervision order, if that person has attained the age of eighteen)—

(a) in paragraph (a) (under which, if the court does not discharge the supervision
order, the maximum fine which it can impose on the supervised person is £20),
for the words “twenty pounds” there shall be substituted the words “£50”; and

(b) for the words “four hundred pounds” (which specify the maximum fine which
the court can impose if it discharges the supervision order in a case where the
offence in consequence of which the order was made is of a kind which the
court has no power to try or has no power to try without appropriate consents)
there shall be substituted the words “£1,000”.

(6) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . F1



2 Criminal Law Act 1977 (c. 45)
Part IV – Miscellaneous Provisions
Document Generated: 2024-06-03

Status: Point in time view as at 01/01/1996.
Changes to legislation: Criminal Law Act 1977, Section 58 is up to date with all changes known to be in force

on or before 03 June 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that
have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Editorial Information
X1 The text of ss. 15(3), 37, 44, 53, 58, Schs. 1, 5, 6, 7, 9, 11, 12 is in the form in which it was originally

enacted: it was not reproduced in Statutes in Force and, except as specified, does not reflect any
amendments or repeals which may have been made prior to 1.2.1991.

Textual Amendments
F1 S. 58(1)(4)(6) repealed by Magistrates' Courts Act 1980 (c. 43, SIF 82), Sch. 9
F2 S. 58(3) repealed (14.10.1991) by Children Act 1989 (c. 41, SIF 20), s. 108(7) Sch. 15; S.I. 1991/828,

art. 3(2)

Marginal Citations
M1 1969 c. 54.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1977/45/section/58/1/4/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/43
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/43/schedule/9
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1977/45/section/58/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1989/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1989/41/section/108/7/schedule/15
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/828
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/828/article/3/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1969/54


Criminal Law Act 1977 (c. 45)
Document Generated: 2024-06-03

3

Status: 
Point in time view as at 01/01/1996.

Changes to legislation: 
Criminal Law Act 1977, Section 58 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 03 June 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes
that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.


