
c. 45 951

Criminal Law Act 1977
1977 CHAPTER 45

An Act to amend the law of England and Wales with
respect to criminal conspiracy; to make new provision
in that law, in place of the provisions of the common
law and the Statutes of Forcible Entry, for restricting
the use or threat of violence for securing entry into any
premises and for penalising unauthorised entry or
remaining on premises in certain circumstances; other-
wise to amend the criminal law, including the law
with respect to the administration of criminal justice;
to provide for the alteration of certain pecuniary and
other limits; to amend section 9(4) of the Adminis-
tration of Justice Act 1973, the Legal Aid Act 1974,
the Rabies Act 1974 and the Diseases of Animals
(Northern Ireland) Order 1975 and the law about
juries and coroners’ inquests; and for connected
purposes. [29th July 1977]

E IT ENACTED by the Queen’s most Excellent Majesty, by andB with the advice and consent of the Lords Spiritual and
Temporal, and Commons, in this present Parliament

assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows:—

Part I
CONSPIRACY

1.—(1) Subject to the following provisions of this Part of this The offence
Act, if a person agrees with any other person or persons that a of conspiracy.
course of conduct shall be pursued which will necessarily amount
to or involve the commission of any offence or offences by one
or more of the parties to the agreement if the agreement is
carried out in accordance with their intentions, he is guilty of
conspiracy to commit the offence or offences in question.



952

Part I

1974 c. 52.

Exemptions
from liability
for conspiracy.

1933 c, 12.

Penalties for
conspiracy.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(2) Where liability for any offence may be incurred without
knowledge on the part of the person committing it of any
particular fact or circumstance necessary for the commission of
the offence, a person shall nevertheless not be guilty of con-
spiracy to commit that offence by virtue of subsection (1) above
unless he and at least one other party to the agreement intend
or know that that fact or circumstance shall or will exist at the
time when the conduct constituting the offence is to take place.

(3) Where in pursuance of any agreement the acts in question
in relation to any offence are to be done in contemplation or
furtherance of a trade dispute (within the meaning of the Trade
Union and Labour Relations Act 1974) that offence shall be dis-
regarded for the purposes of subsection (1) above provided that
it is a summary offence which is not punishable with imprison-
ment.

(4) In this Part of this Act “ offence ” means an offence triable
in England and Wales, except that it includes murder notwith-
standing that the murder in question would not be so triable if
committed in accordance with the intentions of the parties to
the agreement.

2.—(1) A person shall not by virtue of section 1 above be guilty
of conspiracy to commit any offence if he is an intended victim
of that offence.

(2) A person shall not by virtue of section 1 above be
guilty of conspiracy to commit any offence or offences if the
only other person or persons with whom he agrees are (both
initially and at all times during the currency of the agreement)
persons of any one or more of the following descriptions, that
is to say—

(a) his spouse;
(b) a person under the age of criminal responsibility ; and
(c) an intended victim of that offence or of each of those

offences.
(3) A person is under the age of criminal responsibility for

the purposes of subsection (2)(b) above so long as it is conclu-
sively presumed, by virtue of section 50 of the Children and

Young
Persons Act 1933, that he cannot be guilty of any

offence.

3.—(1) A person guilty by virtue of section 1 above of con-
spiracy to commit any offence or offences shall be liable on
conviction on indictment—

(a) in a case falling within subsection (2) or (3) below, to
imprisonment for a term related in accordance with that
subsection to the gravity of the offence or offences in
question (referred to below in this section as the
relevant offence or offences) ; and



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 953

(b) in any other case, to a fine. Part I

Paragraph (b) above shall not be taken as prejudicing the

application of section 30(1) of the Powers of Criminal Courts 1973 c. 62.
Act 1973 (general power of court to fine offender convicted on
indictment) in a case falling within subsection (2) or (3) below.

(2) Where the relevant offence or any of the relevant offences
is an offence of any of the following descriptions, that is to
say—

(a) murder, or any other offence the sentence for which
is fixed by law;

(b) an offence for which a sentence extending to imprison-
ment for life is provided ; or

(c) an indictable offence punishable with imprisonment for
which no maximum term of imprisonment is provided,

the person convicted shall be liable to imprisonment for life.

(3) Where in a case other than one to which subsection (2)
above applies the relevant offence or any of the relevant offences
is punishable with imprisonment, the person convicted shall be
liable to imprisonment for a term not exceeding the maximum
term provided for that offence or (where more than one such
offence is in question) for any one of those offences (taking the

longer or the longest term as the limit for the purposes of this
section where the terms provided differ).

In the case of an offence triable either way the references
above in this subsection to the maximum term provided for that
offence are references to the maximum term so provided on
conviction on indictment.

4.—(1) Subject to subsection (2) below proceedings under Restrictions on

section 1 above for conspiracy to commit any offence or offences the reeling
shall not be instituted against any person except by or with for conspiracy,
the consent of the Director of Public Prosecutions if the offence
or (as the case may be) each of the offences in question is a
summary offence.

(2) In relation to the institution of proceedings under section
1 above for conspiracy to commit—

(a) an offence which is subject to a prohibition by or under
any enactment on the institution of proceedings other-
wise than by, or on behalf or with the consent of, the
Attorney General, or

(b) two or more offences of which at least one is subject
to such a prohibition,

subsection (1) above shall have effect with the substitution of a
reference to the Attorney General for the reference to the
Director of Public Prosecutions.



954

Part I

Abolitions,
savings,
transitional
provisions,
consequential
amendment
and repeals.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(3) Any prohibition by or under any enactment on the institu-
tion of proceedings for any offence which is not a summary
offence otherwise than by, or on behalf or with the consent of,
the Director of Public Prosecutions or any other person shall
apply also in relation to proceedings under section | above for
conspiracy to commit that offence.

(4) Where—
(a) an offence has been committed in pursuance of any

agreement ; and
(b) proceedings may not be instituted for that offence

because any time limit applicable to the institution
of any such proceedings has expired,

proceedings under section 1 above for conspiracy to commit
that offence shall not be instituted against any person on the
basis of that agreement.

§.—(1) Subject to the following provisions of this section, the
offence of conspiracy at common law is hereby abolished.

(2) Subsection (1) above shall not affect the offence of con-
spiracy at common law so far as relates to conspiracy to defraud,
and section 1 above shall not apply in any case where the
agreement in question amounts to a conspiracy to defraud at
common law.

(3) Subsection (1) above shall not affect the offence of con-
spiracy at common law if and in so far as it may be committed
by entering into an agreement to engage in conduct which—

(a) tends to corrupt public morals or outrages public
decency ; but

(b) would not amount to or involve the commission of an
offence if carried out by a single person otherwise than
in pursuance of an agreement.

(4) Subsection (1) above shall not affect—
(a) any proceedings commenced before the time when this

Part of this Act comes into force;
(6) any proceedings commenced after that time against a

person charged with the same conspiracy as that
charged in any proceedings commenced before that
time; or

(c) any proceedings commenced after that time in respect of
a trespass committed before that time;

but a person convicted of conspiracy to trespass in any proceed-
ings brought by virtue of paragraph (c) above shall not in respectof that conviction be liable to imprisonment for a term exceed-
ing six months.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

(5) Sections 1 and 2 above shall apply to things done before
as well as to things done after the time when this Part of this
Act comes into force, but in the application of section 3 above
to a case where the agreement in question was entered into
before that time—

(a) subsection (2) shall be read without the reference to
murder in paragraph (a); and

(b) any murder intended under the agreement shall be
treated as an offence for which a maximum term of
imprisonment of ten years is provided.

(6) The rules laid down by sections 1 and 2 above shall apply
for determining whether a person is guilty of an offence of
conspiracy under any enactment other than section 1 above, but
conduct which is an offence under any such other enactment
shall not also be an offence under section 1 above.

(7) Incitement and attempt to commit the offence of con-

spiracy (whether the conspiracy incited or attempted would be
an offence at common law or under section 1 above or any other
enactment) shall cease to be offences.

(8) The fact that the person or persons who, so far as appears
from the indictment on which any person has been convicted
of conspiracy, were the only other parties to the agreement
on which his conviction was based have been acquitted of
conspiracy by reference to that agreement (whether after being
tried with the person convicted or separately) shall not be a

ground for quashing his conviction unless under all the circum-
stances of the case his conviction is inconsistent with the

acquittal of the other person or persons in question.

(9) Any rule of law or practice inconsistent with the pre-
visions of subsection (8) above is hereby abolished.

(10) In section 4 of the Offences against the Person Act
1861—

(a) the words preceding
“ whosoever” shall cease to have

effect ; and
(b) for the words from “ be kept ” to “ years ” there shall be

substituted the words “ imprisonment for life ”.

(11) Section 3 of the Conspiracy and Protection of Property
Act 1875 shall cease to have effect.

Part II
OFFENCES RELATING TO ENTERING AND REMAINING ON PROPERTY

6.

955

Part I

1861 c, 100.

1875 c. 86.

(1) Subject to the following provisions of this section, any Violence for

person who, without lawful authority, uses or threatens violence securing entry.



956

Part II

Adverse
occupation
of residential
premises.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

for the purpose of securing entry into any premises for himself
or for any other person is guilty of an offence, provided that—

(a) there is someone present on those premises at the timewho is opposed to the entry which the violence is
intended to secure ; and

(b) the person using or threatening the violence knows that
that is the case.

(2) The fact that a person has any interest in or right to
possession or occupation of any premises shall not for the
purposes of subsection (1) above constitute lawful authority for
the use or threat of violence by him or anyone else for the
purpose of securing his entry into those premises.

(3) In any proceedings for an offence under this section it shall
be a defence for the accused to prove—

(a) that at the time of the alleged offence he or any other
person on whose behalf he was acting was a displaced
residential occupier of the premises in question; or

(b) that part of the premises in question constitutes premises
of which he or any other person on whose behalf he
was acting was a displaced residential occupier and
that the part of the premises to which he was seeking
to secure entry constitutes an access of which he or,
as the case may be, that other person is also a dis-
placed residential occupier.

(4) It is immaterial for the purposes of this section—
(a) whether the violence in question is directed against the

person or against property ; and
(b) whether the entry which the violence is intended to

secure is for the purpose of acquiring possession of the
premises in question or for any other purpose.

(5) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be
liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for a term
not exceeding six months or to a fine not exceeding £1,000 or
to both.

(6) A constable in uniform may arrest without warrant any-
one who is, or whom he, with reasonable cause, suspects to be,
guilty of an offence under this section.

(7) Section 12 below contains provisions which apply for
determining when any person is to be regarded for the purposesof this Part of this Act as a displaced residential occupier of
any premises or of any access to any premises.

7.—(1) Subject to the following provisions of this section, any
person who is on any premises as a trespasser after having
entered as such is guilty of an offence if he fails to leave those



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

premises on being required to do so by or on behalf of—
(a) a displaced residential occupier of the premises ; or
(b) an individual who is a protected intending occupier of

the premises by virtue of subsection (2) or subsection
(4) below.

(2) For the purposes of this section an individual is a pro-
tected intending occupier of any premises at any time if at that
time—

(a) he has in those premises a freehold interest or a lease-
hold interest with not less than 21 years still to run
and he acquired that interest as a purchaser for money
or money’s worth ; and

(b) he requires the premises for his own occupation as a
residence ; and

(c) he is excluded from occupation of the premises by a
person who entered them, or any access to them, as a
trespasser ; and

(d) he or a person acting on his behalf holds a written
statement—

(i) which specifies his interest in the premises ; and
(ii) which states that he requires the premises for

occupation as a residence for himself; and
(iii) with respect to which the requirements in

subsection (3) below are fulfilled.

(3) The requirements referred to in subsection (2)(d)(iii)
above are—

(a) that the statement is signed by the person whose interest
is specified in it in the presence of a justice of the peace
or commissioner for oaths ; and

(b) that the justice of the peace or commissioner for oaths
has subscribed his name as a witness to the signature;

and a person is guilty of an offence if he makes a statement for
the purposes of subsection (2)(d) above which he knows to be
false in a material particular or if he recklessly makes such a
statement which is false in a material particular.

(4) For the purposes of this section an individual is also a
protected intending occupier of any premises at any time if at
that time—

(a) he has been authorised to occupy the premises as a
residence by an authority to which this subsection
applies ; and

(b) he is excluded from occupation of the premises by a
person who entered the premises, or any access to them,
as a trespasser ; and

957

Part II



958

Part IT

1977 c. 42,

1957 c. 56.

1974 c. 44,

1975 c. 6.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(c) there has been issued to him by or on behalf of the
authority referred to in paragraph (a) above a certificate
stating that the authority is one to which this subsection
applies, being of a description specified in the certifi-
cate, and that he has been authorised by the authority
to occupy the premises concerned as a residence.

(5) Subsection (4) above applies to the following
authorities :—

(a) any body mentioned in section 14 of the Rent Act 1977
(landlord’s interest belonging to local authority etc.);

(b) the Housing Corporation ; and

(c) a housing association, within the meaning of section
189(1) of the Housing Act 1957, which is for the time
being either registered in the register of housing associa-
tions established under section 13 of the Housing Act
1974 or specified in an order made by the Secretary of
State under paragraph 23 of Schedule | to the Housing
Rents and Subsidies Act 1975.

(6) In any proceedings for an offence under subsection (1)
above it shall be a defence for the accused to prove that he
believed that the person requiring him to leave the premises
was not a displaced residential occupier or protected intending
occupier of the premises or a person acting on behalf of a dis-
placed residential occupier or protected intending occupier.

(7) In any proceedings for an offence under subsection (1)
above it shall be a defence for the accused to prove—

(a) that the premises in question are or form part of
premises used mainly for non-residential purposes ; and

(6) that he was not on any part of the premises used whollyor mainly for residential purposes.

(8) In any proceedings for an offence under subsection (1)
above where the accused was requested to leave the premises bya person claiming to be or to act on behalf of a protected
intending occupier of the premises—

(a) it shall be a defence for the accused to prove that,
although asked to do so by the accused at the time the
accused was requested to leave, that person failed at
that time to produce to the accused such a statement
as is referred to in subsection (2)(d) above or such a

certificate
as is referred to in subsection (4)(c) above;an



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

(b) any document purporting to be a certificate under sub-
section (4)(c) above shall be received in evidence and,
unless the contrary is proved, shall be deemed to have
been issued by or on behalf of the authority stated in
the certificate.

(9) Any reference in the preceding provisions of this section
other than subsections (2) to (4) above, to any premises includes
a reference to any access to them, whether or not any such
access itself constitutes premises, within the meaning of this
Part of this Act; and a person who is a protected intending
occupier of any premises shall be regarded for the purposes of
this section as a protected intending occupier also of any access
to those premises.

(10) A person guilty of an offence under subsection (1) or (3)
above shall be liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for
a term not exceeding six months or to a fine not exceeding
£1,000 or to both.

(11) A constable in uniform may arrest without warrant

anyone who is, or whom he, with reasonable cause, suspects to

be, guilty of an offence under subsection (1) above.

8.

959

Part II

(i) A person who is on any premises as a trespasser, Trespassing
after having entered as such, is guilty of an offence if, without with a

lawful authority or reasonable excuse, he has with him on the

premises any weapon of offence.

(2) In subsection (1) above “ weapon of offence” means any
article made or adapted for use for causing injury to or

incapacitating a person, or intended by the person having it
with him for such use.

(3) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be
liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for a term
not exceeding three months or to a fine not exceeding £1,000 or
to both.

(4) A constable in uniform may arrest without warrant any-
one who is, or whom he, with reasonable cause, suspects to be,
in the act of committing an offence under this section.

weapon of
offence.

9.—(1) Subject to subsection (3) below, a person who enters or Trespassing
is on any premises to which this section applies as a trespasser is on°
guilty of an offence.

premises
foreign

missions, etc.



960

Part II

1964 c, 81.

1968 c. 18.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(2) This section applies to any premises which are or form
part of—

(a) the premises of a diplomatic mission within the meaning
of the definition in Article 1() of the Vienna Con-
vention on Diplomatic Relations signed in 1961 as
that Article has effect in the United Kingdom by virtue
of section 2 of and Schedule 1 to the Diplomatic
Privileges Act 1964 ;

(b) consular premises within the meaning of the definition
in paragraph 1(j) of Article 1 of the Vienna Conven-
tion on Consular Relations signed in 1963 as that
Article has effect in the United Kingdom by virtue of
section 1 of and Schedule 1 to the Consular Relations
Act 1968;

(c) any other premises in respect of which any organisation
or body is entitled to inviolability by or under any
enactment ; and

(d) any premises which are the private residence of a diplo-
matic agent (within the meaning of Article I(e) of
the Convention mentioned in paragraph (a) above) or
of any other person who is entitled to inviolability of
residence by or under any enactment.

(3) In any proceedings for an offence under this section it
shall be a defence for the accused to prove that he believed that
the premises in question were not premises to which this section
applies.

(4) In any proceedings for an offence under this section a
certificate issued by or under the authority of the Secretary of
State stating that any premises were or formed part of premises
of any description mentioned in paragraphs (a) to (d) of sub-
section (2) above at the time of the alleged offence shall be
conclusive evidence that the premises were or formed part of
premises of that description at that time.

(5) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be
liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for a term not
exceeding six months or to a fine not exceeding £1,000 or to
both

(6) Proceedings for an offence under this section shall not
be instituted against any person except by or with the consent
of the Attorney General.

(7) A constable in uniform may arrest without warrant anyone
who is, or whom he, with reasonable cause, suspects to be, in
the act of committing an offence under this section.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 961

10.—(1) Without prejudice to section 8(2) of the Sheriffs Part II
Act 1887 but subject to the following provisions of this section, Obstruction of
a person is guilty of an offence if he resists or intentionally court officers
obstructs any person who is in fact an officer of a court executing
engaged in executing any process issued by the High Court or process for
by any county court for the purpose of enforcing any judgment against
or order for the recovery of any premises or for the delivery of unauthorised
possession of any premises. occupiers.

(2) Subsection (1) above does not apply unless the judgment or
1887 c. 55.

order in question was given or made in proceedings brought
under any provisions of rules of court applicable only in
circumstances where the person claiming possession of any
premises alleges that the premises in question are occupied solely
by a person or persons (not being a tenant or tenants holding
over after the termination of the tenancy) who entered into or
remained in occupation of the premises without the licence or
consent of the person claiming possession or any predecessor
in title of his.

(3) In any proceedings for an offence under this section it shall
be a defence for the accused to prove that he believed that
the person he was resisting or obstructing was not an officer
of a court.

(4) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be
liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for a term not
exceeding six months or to a fine not exceeding £1,000 or to both.

(5) A constable in uniform or any officer of a court may arrest
without warrant anyone who is, or whom he, with reasonable
cause, suspects to be, guilty of an offence under this section.

(6) In this section “ officer of a court ” means—

(a) any sheriff, under sheriff, deputy sheriff, bailiff or officer
of a sheriff ; and

(b) any bailiff or other person who is an officer of a county
court within the meaning of the County Courts Act 1959 c. 22.

1959.

11. For the purpose of arresting a person under any power Power of
conferred by any provision of this Part of this Act other than entry for

section 9(7) above a constable in uniform may enter (if need be, the parposrs
by force) and search any premises where that person is or where of this Act.
the constable, with reasonable cause, suspects him to be.

12.—(1) In this Part of this Act— Supplementary

(a) “ premises
” means any building, any part of a building Prows10PS-

under separate occupation, any land ancillary to a
building, the site comprising any building or buildings
together with any land ancillary thereto, and (for the
purposes only of sections 10 and 11 above) any other
place; and



962

Part II

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(b) “ access” means, in relation to any premises, any part
of any site or building within which those premises
are situated which constitutes an ordinary means of
access to those premises (whether or not that is its sole
or primary use).

(2) References in this section to a building shall apply also
to any structure other than a movable one, and to any movable
structure, vehicle or vessel designed or adapted for use for
residential purposes; and for the purposes of subsection (1)
above—

(a) part of a building is under separate occupation if anyone
is in occupation or entitled to occupation of that part
as distinct from the whole; and

(b) land is ancillary to a building if it is adjacent to it and
used (or intended for use) in connection with the
occupation of that building or any part of it.

(3) Subject to subsection (4) below, any person who was
occupying any premises as a residence immediately before
being excluded from occupation by anyone who entered those
premises, or any access to those premises, as a trespasser is a
displaced residential occupier of the premises for the purposes
of this Part of this Act so long as he continues to be excluded
from occupation of the premises by the original trespasser or
by any subsequent trespasser.

(4) A person who was himself occupying the premises in
question as a trespasser immediately before being excluded from
occupation shall not by virtue of subsection (3) above be a
displaced residential occupier of the premises for the purposes
of this Part of this Act.

(5) A person who by virtue of subsection (3) above is a
displaced residential occupier of any premises shall be regarded
for the purposes of this Part of this Act as a displaced residential
occupier also of any access to those premises.

(6) Anyone who enters or is on or in occupation of any
premises by virtue of—

(a) any title derived from a trespasser ; or

(b) any licence or consent given by a trespasser or by a
person deriving title from a trespasser,

shall himself be treated as a trespasser for the purposes of this
Part of this Act (without prejudice to whether or not he would
be a trespasser apart from this provision); and references in this
Part of this Act to a person’s entering or being on or occupying
any premises as a trespasser shall be construed accordingly.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 963

(7) Anyone who is on any premises as a trespasser shall not Part I
cease to be a trespasser for the purposes of this Part of this Act
by virtue of being allowed time to leave the premises, nor shall
anyone cease to be a displaced residential occupier of any
premises by virtue of any such allowance of time to a trespasser.

(8) No rule of law ousting the jurisdiction of magistrates’
courts to try offences where a dispute of title to property is
involved shall preclude magistrates’ courts from trying offences
under this Part of this Act.

13.—(1) The offence of forcible entry and any offence of Abolitions
forcible detainer at common law are hereby abolished for all pur- and repeals.

poses not relating to offences committed before the coming into
force of this Part of this Act.

(2) The following enactments shall cease to have effect—
(a) the Forcible Entry Act 1381; 1381 c. 7.

(b) chapter 2 of 15 Ric.2 (1391);
(c) the Forcible Entry Act 1429; 1429 c. 9.

(d) the Forcible Entry Act 1588 ; and 1588 c. 11.

(e) the Forcible Entry Act 1623. 1623 c. 15.

Part III
CRIMINAL PROCEDURE, PENALTIES, ETC.

Preliminary
14. The provisions of this Part of this Act down to the end of Preliminary

section 24 shall have effect for the purpose of securing that, as
regards mode of trial, there are only three classes of offence,
namely—

(a) offences triable only on indictment ;

(b) offences triable only summarily ; and
(c) offences triable either way,

for laying down a single procedure applicable to all cases where
a person who has attained the age of seventeen appears or is
brought before a magistrates’ court on an information charging
him with an offence which is triable either way, and for related
purposes.

Allocation of offences to classes as regards mode of trial
15.—(1) The following offences shall be triable only summarily Offenceswhich

(instead of either way), namely— areto become
(a) the offences mentioned (and broadly described) in summarily.

column 1 of Schedule 1 to this Act; and
(b) any offence consisting in the incitement to commit a

summary offence.



964

Part III

1952 ¢. 55,

1875 c. 86,

1876 c. 77.

1892 c. 64.

: 58. 69.

Offences
which are to
become triable
either way.

1953 c. 36.

Offence which
is to become
triable only
on indictment.
1881 c. 60.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(2) The provisions mentioned in subsection (3) below (which
confer a right to claim trial by jury for certain offences triable
summarily, thereby making triable either way such of those
offences as would otherwise be triable only summarily) shalt
cease to have effect.

(3) The said provisions are—
(a) section 25 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952;
(b) sections 9 and 19(1) and (2) of the Conspiracy and Pro-

tection of Property Act 1875;
(c) in the Cruelty to Animals Act 1876, section 15 and, in

section 17, the words from “or if” to “ Justiciary ” ;
(d) in the Witnesses (Public Inquiries) Protection Act 1892,

in section 3 the words from “
provided that ” onwards

and, in section 6, paragraph (2).
(4) The following offences under the Night Poaching Act

1828 shall be triable only summarily (instead of only on indict-
ment), namely—

(a) offences under section 2 of that Act (assaults by persons
committing offences under the Act) ;

(b) offences under section 9 of that Act (entering land, with
others, armed and for the purpose of taking or destroy-
ing game or rabbits).

(5) Subsections (1) and (4) above are without prejudice to
any other enactment by virtue of which any offence is triable
only summarily.

16.—(1) The offences mentioned in Schedule 2 to this Act
shall be triable either way (instead of only on indictment).

(2) The offences which by virtue of section 19 of the Magi-
strates’ Courts Act 1952 are triable either way (excluding offences
under section 56 of the Post Office Act 1953 and any other
offence which by virtue of section 15(1) above is triable
only summarily) shall be triable either way by virtue of this sub-
section; and the said section 19 shall cease to have effect.

(3) The offences triable either way by virtue of subsections
(1) and (2) above are, for convenience of reference, listed in
Schedule 3 to this Act.

(4) Subsections (1) and (2) above are without prejudice to any
enactment by virtue of which any offence is (otherwise than
under the said section 19) triable either way.

17. Section 5 of the Newspaper Libel and Registration Act
1881 (which provides for the summary trial, with the consent of
the accused, of charges against newspaper proprietors and others
responsible for the publication of newspapers for libels pub-
lished in them) shall cease to have effect.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

Limitation of time

18.—(1) Nothing in—
(a) section 104 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 (limita-

tion of time for trial of information) ; or

(b) subject to subsection (3) below, any other enactment
(however framed or worded) which, as regards any
offence to which it applies, would but for this section

impose a time-limit on the power of a magistrates’
court to try an information summarily or impose a
limitation on the time for taking summary proceedings,

shall apply in relation to any indictable offence.

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of paragraph (b) of
subsection (1) above, that paragraph includes enactments which

impose a time-limit that applies only in certain circumstances
(for example, where the proceedings are not instituted by or
with the consent of the Director of Public Prosecutions or some

other specified authority).

(3) Where, as regards any indictable offence, there is

imposed by any enactment (however framed or worded, and
whether failing within subsection (1)(b) above or not) a limitation
on the time for taking proceedings on indictment for that offence
no summary proceedings for that offence shall be taken after
the latest time for taking proceedings on indictment.

Procedure for determining mode of trial of offences
triable either way

19.—(1) Sections 20 to 24 below shall have effect where a

person who has attained the age of seventeen appears or is

brought before a magistrates’ court on an information charging
him with an offence triable either way.

(2) Without prejudice to section 15 of the Magistrates’ Courts
Act 1952 (non-appearance of accused for trial), everything that
the court is required to do under sections 20 to 23 below must
be done before any evidence is called and, subject to the follow-

ing subsection and section 24 below, with the accused present in
court.

(3) The court may proceed in the absence of the accused in
accordance with such of the provisions of sections 20 to 23 below
as are applicable in the circumstances if they consider that by
reason of his disorderly conduct before them it is not practicable
for the proceedings to be conducted in his presence; and sub-
sections (3) to (5) of section 24 below, so far as applicable, shall
have effect in relation to proceedings conducted in the absence
of the accused by virtue of this subsection (references in those
subsections to the person representing the accused being for this

parpose
read as references to the person, if any, representing

m).

965

Part III
Provisions as
to time-limits
on summary
proceedings
for indictable
offences.
1952 c. 55.

Initial
procedure on
information
for offence
triable either
way.



966 c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Part III (4) A magistrates’ court proceeding under sections 20 to 24
below may adjourn the proceedings at any time, and on doing
so on any occasion when the accused is present may remand
the accused, and shall remand him if—

(a) on the occasion on which he first appeared, or was
brought, before the court to answer to the information
he was in custody or, having been released on bail,
surrendered to the custody of the court; or

(b) if he has been remanded at any time in the course of
proceedings on the information;

and where the court remands the accused, the time fixed for
the resumption of the proceedings shall be that at which he is
required to appear or be brought before the court in pursuance
of the remand.

(5) The functions of a magistrates’ court under sections 20 to
24 below may be discharged bya single justice, but the foregoing
provision shall not be taken to authorise the summary trial of an
information by a magistrates’ court composed of less than two
justices,

Court to 20.—(1) The court shall consider whether, having regard to the
beginey.

matters mentioned in subsection (3) below and any representa-consiceting ~—_tions made by the prosecutor or the accused, the offence appearshi
oF ich mode to the court more suitable for summary trial or for trial on
appears more indictment.
suitable.

(2) Before so considering, the court—
(a) shall cause the charge to be written down, if this has not

already been done, and read to the accused ; and
(b) shail afford first the prosecutor and then the accused an

opportunity to make representations as to which mode
of trial would be more suitable.

(3) The matters to which the court is to have regard under
subsection (1) above are the nature of the case; whether the
circumstances make the offence one of serious character ; whether
the punishment which a magistrates’ court would have power
to inflict for it would be adequate; and any other circumstances
which appear to the court to make it more suitable for the
offence to be tried in one way rather than the other.

(4) If the prosecution is being carried on by the Attorney
General, the Solicitor General or the Director of Public Prosecu-
tions and he applies for the offence to be tried on indictment, the
preceding provisions of this section and sections 21 and 22
below shall not apply, and the court shall proceed to inquire into
the information as examining justices.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 967

21.—(1) If, where the court has considered as required by Parr III
section 20(1) above, it appears to the court that the offence is Procedure

more suitable for summary trial, the following provisions of this were

section shall apply (unless excluded by section 24 below). summarytrial appears
(2) The court shall explain to the accused in ordinary more

language— suitable.

(a) that it appears to the court more suitable for him to be
tried summarily for the offence, and that he can either
consent to be so tried or, if he wishes, be tried by a

jury ; and
(b) that if he is tried summarily and is convicted by the

court, he may be committed for sentence to the Crown
Court under section 29 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 c. 55.

1952 if the convicting court, on obtaining information
about his character and antecedents, is of opinion
that they are such that greater punishment should be
inflicted than the convicting court has power to inflict
for the offence.

(3) After explaining to the accused as provided by the pre-
ceding subsection the court shall ask him whether he consents to
be tried summarily or wishes to be tried by a jury, and—

(a) if he consents to be tried summarily, shall proceed to
the summary trial of the information ;

(b) if he does not so consent, shall proceed to inquire into
the information as examining justices.

22. If, where the court has considered as required by section Procedure
20(1) above, it appears to the court that the offence is more where trial on

suitable for trial on indictment, the court shall tell the accused indictment se
that the court has decided that it is more suitable for him to be othable.
tried for the offence by a jury, and shall proceed to inquire into
the information as examining justices.

23,—(1) If the offence charged by the information is one of Certain
those mentioned in the first column of Schedule 4 to this Act offences
(in this section referred to as “ scheduled offences ”) then, subject triablecither
to subsection (7) below, the court shall, before proceeding in surmarily
accordance with section 20 above, consider whether, having if value
regard to any representations made by the prosecutor or the involved
accused, the value involved (as defined in subsection (10) below) small.
appears to the court to exceed the relevant sum.

For the purposes of this section the relevant sum is £200.

(2) If, where subsection (1) above applies, it appears to the
court clear that, for the offence charged, the value involved
does not exceed the relevant sum, the court shall proceed as
if the offence were triable only summarily, and sections 20 to 22
above shall not apply.



968

Part IIT

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(3) If, where subsection (1) above applies, it appears to the
court clear that, for the offence charged, the value involved
exceeds the relevant sum, the court shall thereupon proceed in
accordance with section 20 above in the ordinary way without
further regard to the provisions of this section.

(4) If, where subsection (1) above applies, it appears to the
court for any reason not clear whether, for the offence charged,
the value involved does or does not exceed the relevant sum,
the provisions of subsections (5) and (6) below shall apply.

(5) The court shall cause the charge to be written down, if
this has not already been done, and read to the accused, and
shall explain to him in ordinary language—

(a) that he can, if he wishes, consent to be tried summarily
for the offence and that if he consents to be so tried,
he will definitely be tried in that way; and

(b) that if he is tried summarily and is convicted by the
court, his liability to imprisonment or a fine will be
limited as provided in section 29 below.

(6) After explaining to the accused as provided by the
preceding subsection the court shall ask him whether he consents
to be tried summarily and—

(a) if he so consents, shall proceed in accordance with
subsection (2) above as if that subsection applied ;

(b) if he does not so consent, shall proceed in accordance
with subsection (3) above as if that subsection applied.

(7) Subsection (1) above shall not apply where the offence
charged—

(a) is one of two or more offences with which the accused
is charged on the same occasion and which appear to
the court to constitute or form part of a series of two
or more offences of the same or a similar character: or

(6) consists in the incitement to commit two or more
scheduled offences.

(8) Where a person is convicted by a magistrates’ court of a
scheduled offence, it shall not be open to him to appeal to the
Crown Court against the conviction on the ground that the
convicting court’s decision as to the value involved was
mistaken; and where a person is convicted before the Crown
Court of such an offence, it shall not be open to him to appealto the Court of Appeal against the conviction on the ground
that the decision of the court which committed him for trial
as to the value involved was mistaken.

_
(9) If, where subsection (1) above applies, the offence chargedis one with which the accused is charged jointly with a person



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 969

who has not attained the age of seventeen, the reference in that Part III
subsection to any representations made by the accused shall be
read as including any representations made by the person under
seventeen.

(10) In this section “ the value involved ”, in relation to any
scheduled offence, means the value indicated in the second
column of Schedule 4 to this Act, measured as indicated in the
third column of that Schedule; and in that Schedule “ the
material time ” means the time of the alleged offence.

24.—(1) Where— Power of

(a) the accused is represented by counsel or a solicitor who court, with
in his absence signifies to the court the accused’s consent jegally
to the proceedings for determining how he is to be represented
tried for the offence being conducted in his absence ; accused,to
and proceed in

: : his absence.
(b) the court is satisfied that there is good reason for pro-

ceeding in the absence of the accused,
the following provisions of this section shall apply.

(2) Subject to the following provisions of this section, the
court may proceed in the absence of the accused in accordance
with such of the provisions of sections 20 to 23 above as are

applicable in the circumstances.

(3) If, in a case where subsection (1) of section 23 above

applies, it appears to the court as mentioned in subsection (4)
of that section, subsections (5) and (6) of that section shall not
apply and the court—

(a) if the accused’s consent to be tried summarily has been
or is signified by the person representing him, shall
proceed in accordance with subsection (2) of that sec-
tion as if that subsection applied ; or

(b) if that consent has not been and is not so signified,
shall proceed in accordance with subsection (3) of that
section as if that subsection applied.

(4) If, where the court has considered as required by section
20(1) above, it appears to the court that the offence is more suit-
able for summary trial then—

(a) if the accused’s consent to be tried summarily has been
or is signified by the person representing him, section
21 above shall not apply, and the court shall proceed
to the summary trial of the information; or

(b) if that consent has not been and is not so signified,
section 21 above shall not apply and the court shall
proceed to inquire into the information as examining
justices and may adjourn the hearing without remand-
ing the accused.



970

Part III

Power to
change from
summary
trial to
committal
proceedings,
and vice
versa.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(5) If, where the court has considered as required by section
20(1) above, it appears to the court that the offence is more
suitable for trial on indictment, section 22 above shall not apply,
and the court shall proceed to inquire into the information as
examining justices and may adjourn the hearing without remand-
ing the accused.

25.—(1) Subsections (2) to (4) below shall have effect where a
person who has attained the age of seventeen appears or is
brought before a magistrates’ court on an information charging
him with an offence triable either way.

(2) Where the court has (otherwise than in pursuance of
section 23(2) above) begun to try the information summarily,
the court may, at any time before the conclusion of the evidence
for the prosecution, discontinue the summary trial and proceed
to inquire into the information as examining justices and, on
doing so, may adjourn the hearing without remanding the
accused.

(3) Where the court has begun to inquire into the informa-
tion as examining justices, then, if at any time during the
inquiry it appears to the court, having regard to any represen-
tations made in the presence of the accused by the prosecutor,
or made by the accused, and to the nature of the case, that the
offence is after all more suitable for summary trial, the court
may, after doing as provided in subsection (4) below, ask the
accused whether he consents to be tried summarily and, if he
so consents, may proceed to try the information summarily:
Provided that, if the prosecution is being carried on by the

Attorney General, the Solicitor General or the Director of Public
Prosecutions, the court shall not act under this subsection without
his consent.

(4) Before asking the accused under subsection (3) above
whether he consents to be tried summarily, the court shall in
ordinary language—

(a) explain to him that it appears to the court more suitable
for him to be tried summarily for the offence,
but that this can only be done if he consents to be so
tried; and

(b) unless it has already done so, explain to him, as providedin section 21(2)(b) above, about the court’s power to
commit to the Crown Court for sentence.

(5) Where a person under the age of seventeen appears or
is brought before a magistrates’ court on an information charg-
ing him with an indictable offence other than homicide, and the
court—

(a) has begun to try the information summarily on the foot-
ing that the case does not fall within paragraph (a) or



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

(b) of section 6(1) of the Children and Young Persons

971

Part IT
Act 1969 and must therefore be tried summarily, as 1969c 54,

required by the said section 6(1) ; or
(b) has begun to inquire into the case as examining justices

on the footing that the case does so fall,
subsection (6) or (7) below, as the case may be, shall have effect.

(6) If, in a case falling within subsection (5)(a) above, it
appears to the court at any time before the conclusion of the
evidence for the prosecution that the case is after all one which
under the said section 6(1) ought not to be tried summarily, the
court may discontinue the summary trial and proceed to inquire
into the information as examining justices and, on doing so, may
adjourn the hearing without remanding the accused.

(7) If, in a case falling within subsection (5)(b) above, it
appears to the court at any time during the inquiry that the
case is after all one which under the said section 6(1) ought to
be tried summarily, the court may proceed to try the information
summarily.

26.—(1) Where—
(a) in the circumstances mentioned in section 24(1)(a) above

Power to
issue
summons to

the court is not satisfied that there is good reason for accused

proceeding in the absence of the accused; or in certain

(b) subsection (4)(b) or (5) of section 24 or subsection (2) or circumstances.
(6) of section 25 above applies, and the court adjourns
the hearing in pursuance of that subsection without
remanding the accused,

the justice or any of the justices of which the court is composed
may issue a summons directed to the accused requiring his
presence before the court.

(2) If the accused is not present at the time and place
appointed—

(a) in a case within subsection (1)(a) above, for the proceed-
ings under section 20(1) or 23(1) above, as the case
may be; or

(b) in a case within subsection (1)(b) above, for the resump-
tion of the hearing,

the court may issue a warrant for his arrest.

Penalties

27.—(1) Without prejudice to section 108 of the Magistrates’
Courts Act 1952 (consecutive terms of imprisonment), a magis-
trates’ court shall not have power to impose imprisonment for
more than six months in respect of any one offence.

General limit
on power of
magistrates’
court to
impose
imprisonment.
1952 c. 55.



972

Part III

Penalties
on summary
conviction
for offences
triable either
way.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(2) Unless expressly excluded, subsection (1) above shall apply
even if the offence in question is one for which a person would
otherwise be liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for
more than six months.

(3) Any power of a magistrates’ court to impose a term of
imprisonment for non-payment of a fine, or for want of sufficient
distress to satisfy a fine, shall not be limited by virtue of sub-
section (1) above.

28.—(1) On summary conviction of any of the offences triable
either way listed in Schedule 3 to this Act a person shall
be liable to imprisonment for a term not exceeding six months
or to a fine not exceeding the prescribed sum or both:
Provided that—

(a) a magistrates’ court shall not have power to impose
imprisonment for an offence so listed if the Crown
Court would not have that power in the case of an
adult convicted of it on indictment ;

(b) on summary conviction of an offence consisting in the
incitement to commit an offence triable either way a
person shall not be liable to any greater penalty than
he would be liable to on summary conviction of the
last-mentioned offence ; and

(c) on summary conviction of attempting to commit an
offence triable either way a person shall not be liable
to any greater penalty than he would be liable to on
summary conviction of the completed offence.

(2) For any offence triable either way which is not listed
in Schedule 3 to this Act, being an offence under a relevant
enactment, the maximum fine which may be imposed on sum-
mary conviction shall by virtue of this subsection be the pres-
cribed sum unless the offence is one for which by virtue of an
enactment other than this subsection a larger fine may be
imposed on summary conviction.

(3) Where, by virtue of any relevant enactment, a person sum-
marily convicted of an offence triable either way would, apart
from this section, be liable to a maximum fine of one amount
in the case of a first conviction and of a different amount in the
case of a second or subsequent conviction, subsection (2) above
shall apply irrespective of whether the conviction is a first,
second or subsequent one.

(4) Subsection (2) above shall not affect so much of any enact-
ment as (in whatever words) makes a person liable on summary
conviction to a fine not exceeding a specified amount for each



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

day on which a continuing offence is continued after conviction
or the occurrence of any other specified event.

(5) Where, as regards any offence triable either way, there is
under any enactment (however framed or worded) a power by
subordinate instrument to restrict the amount of the fine which
on summary conviction can be imposed in respect of that
offence—

(a) subsection (2) above shall not affect that power or over-
ride any restriction imposed in exercise of that power;
and

(b) the amount to which that fine may be restricted in
exercise of that power shall be any amount less than
the maximum fine which could be imposed on sum-
mary conviction in respect of the offence apart from
any restriction so imposed.

(6) Where there is under any relevant enactment (however
framed or worded) a power by subordinate instrument to impose
penal provisions, being a power which allows the creation of
offences triable either way—

(a) the maximum fine which may in the exercise of that
power be authorised on summary conviction in respect
of an offence triable either way shall by virtue of this
subsection be the prescribed sum unless some larger
maximum fine can be authorised on summary convic-
tion in respect of such an offence by virtue of an
enactment other than this subsection ; and

(b) subsection (2) above shall not override any restriction
imposed in the exercise of that power on the amount
of the fine which on summary conviction can be im-
posed in respect of an offence triable either way created
in the exercise of the power.

(7) In this section—
“the prescribed sum” means £1,000 or such sum as is for

the time being substituted in this definition by an crder
in force under section 61(1) below;

“relevant enactment” means an enactment contained in
this Act or in any Act passed before, or in the same
Session as, this Act.

(8) Schedule 5 to this Act shall have effect for the purpose of
altering the penalties available on summary conviction of certain
offences triable either way not listed in Schedule 3 to this Act;
and subsection (2) above shail not apply on summary conviction
of any of the offences mentioned in paragraph 1(2) of the said
Schedule 5.

973

Part IIT



974

Part III
Maximum
penalties
on summary
conviction in
pursuance of
section 23,

1952 ¢. 55.

Penalties
(and mode
of trial) for
offences made
triable only
summarily.

1828 c. 69.

Increase of
fines for
certain
summary
offences.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

29. Where in pursuance of subsection (2) of section 23 above
a magistrates’ court proceeds to the summary trial of an
information, then, if the accused is summarily convicted of the
offence—

(a) the court shall not have power to impose on him in
respect of that offence imprisonment for more than
three months or a fine greater than £500; and

(b) section 29 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 (power
of court to commit offender to Crown Court for sen-
tence if of opinion that his character and antecedents
are such that greater punishment should be inflicted
than the convicting court has power to inflict) shall not
apply as regards that offence.

30.—(1) The enactments specified in column 2 of Schedule 1

to this Act, which relate to the mode of trial of, and the maxi-
mum penalties for, the offences mentioned (and broadly des-
cribed) in column 1 of that Schedule (being the offences which
are by section 15(1)(a) above made triable only summarily
instead of either way) shall have effect subject to the amend-
ments specified in column 3 of that Schedule.

(2) The said amendments have the effect of altering the maxi-
mum penalties available on summary conviction of the offences
so mentioned as well as making alterations consequential on their
becoming triable only summarily; and in that Schedule column
4 shows the present maximum penalties by way of fine or im-
prisonment on summary conviction and on conviction on indict-
ment, and column 5 shows the new maximum penalties resulting
from the amendments.

(3) A person who (by virtue of section 15 above) is summarily
convicted of an offence under section 2 (assaults by persons
committing offences under the Act) or section 9 (entering land,
with others, armed and for the purpose of taking or destroying
game or rabbits) of the Night Poaching Act 1828 shall be liable
to imprisonment for a term not exceeding six months or to a
fine not exceeding £500, or to both (instead of to a maximum
penalty on conviction on indictment of seven years imprisonment
or a fine or both for an offence under the said section 2, or of
fourteen years imprisonment or a fine or both for an offence
under the said section 9).

(4) On conviction of an offence consisting in the incitement
to commit a summary offence a person shall be liable to the
same penalties as he would be liable to on conviiction of the last-
mentioned offence.

31.—(1) The enactments specified in column 2 of Schedule 6 to
this Act, which relate to the maximum fines for the offences
mentioned (and broadly described) in column 1 of that Schedule,
shall have effect as if the maximum fine that may be imposed



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

on summary conviction of any offence so mentioned were a
fine not exceeding the amount specified in column 4 of that
Schedule instead of a fine not exceeding the amount specified in
column 3 of that Schedule, so however that the preceding
provision shall not alter the maximum daily fine, if any, pro-
vided for by any of those enactments.

(2) This subsection applies to the following enactments (by
virtue of which certain byelaws may make persons contravening
the byelaws liable on summary conviction to a fine not exceeding
£20), namely—

975

Part Ill

(a) section 183 of the Public Health Act 1875 and section 1875 c. 55.
237 of the Local Government Act 1972 (local autho- 1972 c. 70.
rities’ byelaws) in their application to byelaws under
any public general Act ; and

(b) paragraph 5 of Schedule 6 to the Weights and Measures 1963 c. 31.
Act 1963 (byelaws about solid fuel), including that para-
graph as extended to wood fuel by paragraph 4 of
Part IV of Schedule 7 to that Act.

(3) In the enactments to which subsection (2) above applies
for any reference to £20 there shall be substituted a reference to
£50 ; and any provision in force at the coming into force of this
subsection which—

(a) is contained in any byelaw made under a public general
Act by virtue of—

(i) any enactment to which subsection (2) above
applies ; or
(ii) section 251 of the Local Government Act 1933 c. 51.

1933 ; and
(b) specifies £20 as the maximum fine which may be

imposed on summary conviction in respect of a contra-
vention of, or offence under, any byelaw mentioned in
that provision,

shall have effect as if it specified £50 instead (but with no change
by virtue of this subsection in the maximum daily fine, if any, for
which it provides).
The preceding provisions of this subsection are without pre-

judice to subsection (4) below.

(4) The following byelaws, namely—
(a) byelaws under section 75 of the Public Health Act 1961 1961 c. 64.

(byelaws as to pleasure fairs and roller skating rinks) ;

(b) byelaws under section 76 of that Act (byelaws as to sea-
side pleasure boats) ; and

(c) any byelaws relating to the burning of straw or stubble
made by a local authority under section 235 of the
Local Government Act 1972 (byelaws for good rule
and government and suppression of nuisances),

Part II I



976

Part III

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

may provide that persons contravening the byelaws shall be
liable on summary conviction to a fine not exceeding £200 and,
in the case of a continuing offence, a further fine not exceeding
£5 for each day during which the offence continues after the
conviction thereof; and any such byelaw in force at the coming
into force of this subsection which specifies £20 or any smaller
sum as the maximum fine which may be imposed on summary
conviction of an offence under any such byelaw shall have effect
as if it specified £200 instead (but with no change by virtue of
this subsection in the maximum daily fine, if any, for which it
provides).

(5) This subsection applies to any pre-1949 enactment (how-
ever framed or worded) which—

(a) as regards any summary offence makes a person liable on
conviction thereof to a fine of, or not exceeding, a
specified amount less than £50 which has not been
altered since the end of 1948 (and is not altered by this
Act) ; or

(b) confers power by subordinate instrument to make a
person, as regards any summary offence (whether or not
created by the instrument), liable on conviction thereof
to a fine of, or not exceeding, a specified amount less
than £50 which has not been altered since the end of
1948 (and is not altered by this Act).

(6) Every enactment to which subsection (5) above applies
shall have effect as if for the specified amount less than £50 there
mentioned there were substituted—

(a) £25 if the specified amount is less than £20; or
(b) £50 if the specified amount is not less than £20.

(7) Where, by virtue of any enactment to which subsection (5)
above applies by virtue of paragraph (a) of that subsection, a
person convicted of a summary offence would, apart from this
section, be liable to a fine, or maximum fine, of one amount in
the case of a first conviction and of a different amount in the
case of a second or subsequent conviction, subsection (6) above
shall apply separately in relation to each specified amount less
than £50, even if this produces the same instead of different
amounts for different convictions.

(8) Subsection (6) above shall not affect so much of any enact-
ment as (in whatever words) makes a person liable on summary
conviction to a fine not exceeding a specified amount for each
day on which a continuing offence is continued after conviction
or the occurrence of any other specified event.

(9) In subsection (5) above “
pre-1949 enactment ” means an

enactment passed before Ist January 1949 or an enactment passed



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 977

on or after that date which (whether directly or, through suc- Part III
cessive re-enactments, indirectly) re-enacts with or without modi-
fication an enactment passed before that date.

(10) In section 67(6) of the Medicines Act 1968, for “ £400 ” 1968 c. 67.

(which gives the maximum fine on summary conviction which
can be imposed by regulations under section 66 for contravention
of the regulations) there shall be substituted “ £1,000 ”.

(11) In this section “ enactment” does not include an enact-
ment contained in an order, regulation or other instrument made
under an Act.

32.—(1) Where a person convicted on indictment of any Other
offence (whether triable only on indictment or either way) would, Provisions as

apart from this subsection, be liable to a fine not exceeding a i maximum

specified amount, he shall by virtue of this subsection be liable nes.

to a fine of any amount.

(2) In section 27(3) of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 1952 c. 55.

(power of a magistrates’ court to fine an offender up to £100
where it would otherwise only have power to sentence him to
imprisonment or other detention), for the words from “

impose
a fine” onwards there shall be substituted the words “ impose
a fine which—

(a) for an offence triable either way, shall not exceed the
prescribed sum within the meaning of section 28 of the
Criminal Law Act 1977; and

(+) for a summary offence, shall—
(i) not exceed £200 ; and
(ii) not be of such an amount as would subject the

offender, in default of payment of the fine, to a
longer term of imprisonment or detention than the
term to which he is liable on conviction of the
offence.”.

(3) In paragraph 1(1)(d) of Schedule 2 to the European Com- 1972 c. 68.

munities Act 1972, for the words “£5 a day” (which give the
maximum daily fine with which an offence created under the

powers conferred by section 2(2) of that Act can under those

powers be made punishable on summary conviction) there shall
be substituted the words “ £100 a day ”.

33. For an offence under section 3 of the Explosive Penalty for

Substances Act 1883 (attempt to cause explosion, or making or Offences under

keeping explosives, with intent to endanger life or property in the of
United Kingdom or the Republic of Ireland) the maximum term substances
of imprisonment which may be imposed by a court in Great Act 1883.

Britain shall be increased from twenty years to life. 1883 c. 3,

12



978

Part III
Power of
magistrates’
court to
remit a person
under 17 for
trial toa
juvenile court
in certain
circumstances.

1933 c. 12.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Young offenders
34.—(1) Where—

(a) a person under the age of seventeen (‘the juvenile ”)
appears or is brought before a magistrates’ court other
than a juvenile court on an information jointly charging

him
and one or more other persons with an offence;

an
(6) that other person, or any of those other persons, has

attained that age,
subsection (2) below shall have effect notwithstanding proviso
(a) in section 46(1) of the Children and Young Persons Act 1933
(which would otherwise require the charge against the juvenile
to be heard by a magistrates’ court other than a juvenile court).
In the following provisions of this section

“ the older accused ”
means such one or more of the accused as have attained the age
of seventeen.

(2) If—
(a) the court proceeds to the summary trial of the informa-

tion in the case of both or all of the accused, and the
older accused or each of the older accused pleads
guilty ; or

(b) the court—
(i) in the case of the older accused or each of the

older accused, proceeds to inquire into the informa-
tion as examining justices and either commits him
for trial or discharges him ; and

(ii) in the case of the juvenile, proceeds to the
summary trial of the information,

then, if in either situation the juvenile pleads not guilty, the court
may before any evidence is called in his case remit him for trial
to a juvenile court acting for the same place as the remitting
court or for the place where he habitually resides.

(3) A person remitted to a juvenile court under subsection (2)
above shall be brought before and tried by a juvenile court
accordingly.

(4) Where a person is so remitted to a juvenile court—
(a) he shall have no right of appeal against the order of

remission ; and
(b) the remitting court may give such directions as appear

to be necessary with respect to his custody or for his
release on bail until he can be brought before the
juvenile court.

(5) The preceding provisions of this section shall apply in
relation to a corporation as if it were an individual who has
attained the age of seventeen.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 979

35. In section 6 of the Children and Young Persons Act 1969 Parr III
(summary trial of young persons), after subsection (1) there shall Power to
be inserted— commit a

“ (1A) Where, in a case falling within subsection (1)(b) 77'forwader
above, a magistrates’ court commits a person under the age extended to
of seventeen for trial for an offence with which he is charged related

_

jointly with a person who has attained that age, the court Offences in
may also commit him for trial for any other indictable
offence with which he is charged at the same time (whether 1969 © 34.

jointly with the person who has attained that age or not)
if that other offence arises out of circumstances which are
the same as or connected with those giving rise to the
first-mentioned offence.”.

36.—(1) Paragraph 6 of Schedule 4 to the Children and Young Enforcement} ¥
Persons Act 1969 (which precludes the making of an attendance Of fines
centre order in respect of a person under the age of seventeen imposed on Wi

youngin consequence of a default within the meaning of the Criminal offenders.
Justice Act 1961) shail not apply in the case of a default con- j9¢) 39,"
sisting in failure to pay, or want of distress to satisfy, a sum
adjudged to be paid by a conviction.

(2) Where a magistrates’ court would, but for the statutory
restrictions upon the imprisonment of young offenders, have
power to commit to prison a person under the age of seventeen
for a default consisting in failure to pay, or want of sufficient
distress to satisfy, a sum adjudged to be paid by a conviction,
the court may, subject to the following provisions of this section,
make—

(a) an order requiring the defaulter’s parent or guardian to
enter into a recognisance to ensure that the defaulter
pays so much of that sum as remains unpaid ; or

(b) an order directing so much of that sum as remains un-
paid to be paid by the defaulter’s parent or guardian
instead of by the defaulter.

(3) An order under subsection (2) above shall not be made in
respect of a defaulter—

(a) in pursuance of paragraph (a) of that subsection, unless
the parent or guardian in question consents ;

(b) in pursuance of paragraph (b) of that subsection, unless
the court is satisfied in all the circumstances that it is
reasonable to make the order.

(4) None of the following orders, namely—
(a) an order under section 19(1) of the Criminal Justice Act 1948 c. 58.

1948 for attendance at an attendance centre; or
3



980

Part I

1961 c, 39,

1973 c. 62.

1969 c. 54,

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(b) any order under subsection (2) above,
shall be made by a magistrates’ court in consequence of a default
of a person under the age of seventeen years consisting in failure
to pay, or want of sufficient distress to satisfy, a sum adjudged
to be paid by a conviction unless the court has since the con-
viction inquired into the defaulter’s means in his presence on at
least one occasion.

(5) An order under subsection (2) above shall not be made by
a magistrates’ court unless the court is satisfied that the defaulter
has, or has had since the date on which the sum in question
was adjudged to be paid, the means to pay the sum or any
instalment of it on which he has defaulted, and refuses or neglects
or, as the case may be, has refused or neglected, to pay it.

(6) An order under subsection (2) above may be made in
pursuance of paragraph (b) of that subsection against a parent or
guardian who, having been required to attend, has failed to do
so; but, save as aforesaid, an order under that subsection shall
not be made in pursuance of that paragraph without giving the
parent or guardian an opportunity of being heard.

(7) A parent or guardian may appeal to the Crown Court
against an order under subsection (2) above made in pursuance
of paragraph (5) of that subsection.

(8) Any sum ordered under subsection (2)(b) above to be paid
by a parent or guardian may be recovered from him in like
manner as if the order had been made on the conviction of the
parent or guardian of an offence.

(9) In this section—
“guardian”, in relation to a person under the age of

seventeen, means a person appointed, according to
law, to be his guardian by deed or will, or by order of
a court of competent jurisdiction;

“the statutory restrictions upon the imprisonment of young
offenders ” has the meaning given by section 39(1) of
the Criminal Justice Act 1961 ;

“sum adjudged to be paid by a conviction” means any
fine, costs, compensation or other sum adjudged to be
paid by an order made on a finding of guilt, including
an order made under section 35 of the Powers of
Criminal Courts Act 1973 (compensation orders) as
applied by section 3(6) of the Children and Young
Persons Act 1969.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 981

37.—(1) In section 12 of the Children and Young Persons Act Part TI
1969 (power to include requirements in supervision orders) there Supervision
shall be inserted after subsection (3) the following subsections— orders.

“(3A) This subsection applies to— 1969 c. 54.

(a) any supervision order made under section 7(7) of
this Act in respect of a child or young person
found guilty as there mentioned ; and

(b) any supervision order made in respect of a person
under section 21(2) of this Act by a court on dis-
charging a care order made in respect of him under
the said section 7(7).

(3B) Subject to the following subsection (but without
prejudice to subsection (2) or (4) of this section) a super-
vision order to which subsection (3A) of this section applies
may require the supervised person to do as mentioned in
all or any one or more of paragraphs (a) to (c) of this sub-
section, that is to say—

(a) to be of good behaviour;
(b) to comply, for as long as the order remains in force,

or until the end of some shorter period specified
in the order, with such requirements as may be so
specified, being requirements which, having regard
to the circumstances of the case, the court making
the order considers appropriate for the purpose of
preventing the commission of further offences by
the supervised person ;

(c) if he is of compulsory school age, to comply, for as
long as he is of that age and the order remains
in force, with such arrangements for his education
as may from time to time be made by his parent,
being arrangements for the time being approved
by the local education authority.

Expressions used in paragraph (c) of this subsection and
in the Education Act 1944 have the same meaning there 1944 c, 31.
as in that Act.
(3C) A requirement to do as mentioned in paragraph (b)

of the preceding subsection shall not be included in a super-
vision order to which subsection (3A) of this section applies
unless the supervised person or, if he is a child, his parent
or guardian consents to its inclusion ; and there shall not be
included in such an order by virtue of the said para-
graph (b)—

(a) any requirement that would involve the co
operation of a person other than the supervisor
and the supervised person unless that other person
consents to its inclusion ; or

14



982 c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Part Ill (b) any requirement requiring the specified person to
reside with a specified individual or live at a
specified place ; or

(c) any such requirement as is mentioned in sub-
section (4) of this section.”.

1969 c. 54. (2) In section 15 of the Children and Young Persons Act 1969
(variation and discharge of supervision orders), after subsection
(2) there shall be inserted the following subsection—“ (2A) If while a supervision order to which section

12(3A) of this Act applies is in force in respect of a person
who has not attained the age of eighteen it is proved to the
satisfaction of a juvenile court, on the application of the
supervisor, that the supervised person has failed to comply
with any requirement included in the supervision order in
pursuance of section 12 or section 18(2)(b) of this Act, the
court may, whether or not it also makes an order under
subsection (1) of this section—

(a) order him to pay a fine of an amount not exceeding
£50 ; or

(b) subject to section 16(10) of this Act, make an
attendance centre order in respect of him.”.

(3) The preceding provisions of this section, and any related
amendment or repeal provided for in Schedule 12 or 13 to this
Act, shall not apply in relation to supervision orders made before
the coming into force of those provisions.

Cross-border enforcement
Execution 38.—(1) A warrant issued in Scotland or Northern Ireland for
throughout _—

the arrest of a person charged with an offence may be executed
United in England or Wales by any constable acting within his police
ofwarrants area ; and subsection (4) of section 102 of the Magistrates’ Courts
of arrest. Act 1952 (execution without possession of the warrant) shall
1952. 55. apply to the execution in England or Wales of any such warrant.

(2) A warrant issued in England, Wales or Northern Ireland
for the arrest of a person charged with an offence may be
executed in Scotland by any constable appointed for a police
area in like manner as any such warrant issued in Scotland.

(3) A warrant issued in England, Wales or Scotland for the
arrest of a person charged with an offence may be executed in
Northern Ireland by any member of the Royal Ulster Con-
stabulary or the Royal Ulster Constabulary Reserve; and sub-

1964 c. 21 sections (4) and (5) of section 159 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act
(N.L). (Northern Ireland) 1964 (execution without possession of the

warrant and execution on Sunday) shall apply to the execution
in Northern Ireland of any such warrant.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 983

(4) A warrant may be executed by virtue of this section Parr III
whether or not it has been endorsed under section 12, 14 or 15
of the Indictable Offences Act 1848 or under section 27, 28 or 1848 c. 42.
29 of the Petty Sessions (Ireland) Act 1851. 1851 c. 93.

(5) Nothing in this section affects the execution in Scotland or
Northern Ireland of a warrant to which section 123 of the
Bankruptcy Act 1914 applies. 1914 c. 59,

39.—(1) A summons requiring a person charged with an Service of
offence to appear before a court in England or Wales may, in summonses
such manner as may be prescribed by rules of court, be served on

and eeehim in Scotland or Northern Ireland. United
(2) A summons requiring a person charged with an offence to Kingdom.

appear before a court in Northern Ireland may, in such manner
as may be prescribed by rules of court, be served on him in
England, Wales or Scotland.

(3) Citation of a person charged with a crime or offence to
appear before a court in Scotland may be effected in any other
part of the United Kingdom in like manner as it may be done
in Scotland, and for this purpose the persons authorised to
effect such citation shall include, in England and Wales and Transfer of
Northern Ireland, constables and prison officers serving in those orders.

parts of the United Kingdom.

40. Schedule 7 to this Act (which confers powers on courts in
Northern Ireland, and extends the existing powers of courts in
England, Wales and Scotland, to make transfer of fine orders)
shall have effect.

Other provisions
41.—(1) A magistrates’ court adjourning a case under— Transfer of

(a) section 6 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 (committal Fas
proceedings), or

. 1952. 55.
(b) section 14(1) of that Act (trial of information), or
(c) section 19(4) above,

and remanding the accused in custody, may, if he has attained
the age of seventeen, order that he be brought up for any sub-
sequent remands before an alternate magistrates’ court nearer to
the prison where he is to be confined while on remand.

(2) The order shall require the accused to be brought before
the alternate court at the end of the period of remand or at such
earlier time as the alternate court may require.

(3) While the order is in force, the alternate court shall, to the
exclusion of the court which made the order, have all the powers
in relation to further remand (whether in custody or on bail) and



984

Part III

Remand of
accused
already in
custody.

Peremptory
challenge
of jurors.
1974 c, 23.

Appeals
against
conviction.
1968 c. 19.
1968 c. 21.

Cases where
magistrates’
court may
remit offender
to another
such court
for sentence.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

the grant of legal aid which that court would have had but for
the order.

(4) The alternate court may, on remanding the accused in
custody, require him to be brought before the court which made
the order at the end of the period of remand or at such earlier
time as that court may require; and, if the alternate court does
so, or the accused is released on bail, the order under sub-
section (1) above shall cease to be in force.

(5) Schedule 8 to this Act shall have effect to supplement this
section.

42.—(1) When a magistrates’ court remands an accused person
in custody and he is already detained under a custodial sentence,
the period for which he is remanded may be up to 28 clear days.

(2) But the court shall enquire as to the expected date of his
release from that detention; and if it appears that it will be
before 28 clear days have expired, he shall not be remanded
in custody for more than 8 clear days or (if longer) a period
ending with that date.

(3) So long as he is detained under a custodial sentence, an
application for him to be further remanded in custody may be
made and determined without his appearance in court, provided
that he is represented by counsel or a solicitor who signifies the
accused’s consent to the application being heard in his absence.

43. The provisions of section 12(1) of the Juries Act 1974 shall
be amended so as to substitute in paragraph (a) thereof “ three ”
for “seven”.

44, In section 2 of the Criminal Appeal Act 1968 and in sec-
tion 9 of the Criminal Appeal (Northern Ireland) Act 1968

(grounds for allowing appeals) in subsection (1)(a) (cases where
the verdict of the jury is unsafe or unsatisfactory) for the words
“verdict of the jury” there shall be substituted the word“ conviction ”.

45.—(1) Where a person who has attained the age of seventeen
(“the offender”) has been convicted by a magistrates’ court
(“the convicting court”) of an offence to which this section
applies (“ the instant offence ”) and—

(a) it appears to the convicting court that some other
magistrates’ court (“the other court”) has convicted
him of another such offence in respect of which the
other court has neither passed sentence on him nor
committed him to the Crown Court for sentence nor
dealt with him in any other way; and



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

(b) the other court consents to his being remitted under this
section to the other court,

the convicting court may remit him to the other court to be
dealt with in respect of the instant offence by the other court
instead of by the convicting court.

(2) The offender, if remitted under this section, shall have no
right of appeal against the order of remission.

(3) Where the convicting court remits the offender to the other
court under this section, it shall adjourn the trial of the informa-
tion charging him with the instant offence, and—

985

Part TI

(a) section 105 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 (remand 1952 c. 55.
in custody or on bail} and all other enactments
(whenever passed) relating to remand or the granting
of bail in criminal proceedings shall have effect in
relation to the convicting court’s power or duty to
remand the offender on that adjournment as if any
reference to the court to or before which the person
remanded is to be brought or appear after remand
were a reference to the court to which he is being
remitted ; and

(b) subject to subsection (4) below, the other court may deal
with the case in any way in which it would have power
to deal with it (including, where applicable, the remis-
sion of the offender under this section to another magi-
strates’ court in respect of the instant offence) if all
proceedings relating to that offence which took place
before the convicting court had taken place before the
other court.

(4) Nothing in this section shall preclude the convicting court
from making any order which it has power to make under
section 28 of the Theft Act 1968 (orders for restitution) by virtue 1968 c. 60.
of the offender’s conviction of the instant offence.

(5) Where the convicting court has remitted the offender under
this section to the other court, the other court may remit him
back to the convicting court ; and the provisions of subsection (3)
above (so far as applicable) shall apply with the necessary modi-
fications in relation to any remission under this subsection.

(6) This section applies to—
(a) any offence punishable with imprisonment; and
(b) any offence in respect of which the convicting court has

a power or duty to order the offender to be disqualified
under section 93 of the Road Traffic Act 1972 (dis- 1972 c. 20.
qualification for certain motoring offences) ;

and in this section “‘ conviction ” includes a finding under section
26(1) of the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952 (remand for medical



986 c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

ParTIII examination) that the person in question did the act or made
the omission charged, and “convicted” shall be construed
accordingly.

Committalfor 46. For section 56(1) of the Criminal Justice Act 1967

sence for4 (powers of magistrates’ courts as regards committal for sentence

summarily, im respect of offences tried summarily) there shall be

1967 c. 80. substituted—
“(1) Where a magistrates’ court (‘the committing

court’) commits a person in custody or on bail to the
Crown Court under any enactment to which this section
applies to be sentenced or otherwise dealt with in respect
of an offence (‘the relevant offence’), the committing
court—

(a) if the relevant offence is an offence triable either
way, may also commit him, in custody or on bail
as the case may require, to the Crown Court to
be dealt with in respect of any other offence what-
soever in respect of which the committing court
has power to deal with him (being an offence of
which he has been convicted by that or any other
court) ; or

(b) if the relevant offence is a summary offence, may
commit him, as aforesaid, to the Crown Court to
be dealt with in respect of—

(i) any other offence of which the committing
court has convicted him, being either an
offence punishable with imprisonment or
an offence in respect of which the commit-
ting court has a power or duty to order
him to be disqualified under section 93 of

1972 c, 20, the Road Traffic Act 1972 (disqualification
for certain motoring offences) ; or

(ii) any suspended sentence in respect of which
the committing court has under section

1973 c. 62. 24(1) of the Powers of Criminal Courts Act
1973 power to deal with him.”.

Prison 47.—(1) Where a court passes on an adult a sentence of
sentence imprisonment for a term of not less than six months and not

partly served
more than two years, it may order that, after he has served

and partly
—_part of the sentence in prison, the remainder of it shall be held

suspended, tin suspense.
(2) The part to be held in suspense shall be not more than

three quarters and not less than one quarter of the whole term,
and the offender shall not be required to serve that part unless



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

it is restored under subsection (3) below; and this shall be
explained to him by the court, using ordinary language and
stating the substantial effect of that subsection.

(3) If at any time after the making of the order he is con-
victed of an offence punishable with imprisonment and com-
mitted during the whole period of the original sentence, then
(subject to subsection (4) below) a court which is competent
under this subsection may restore the part of the sentence held
in suspense and order him to serve it.

(4) If a court, considering the offender’s case with a view to
exercising the powers of subsection (3) above, is of opinion
that (in view of all the circumstances, including the facts of
the subsequent offence) it would be unjust fully to restore the
part of the sentence held in suspense, it shall either restore a
lesser part or declare, with reasons given, its decision to make
no order under the subsection.

(5) Where a court exercises those powers, it may direct that
the restored part of the original sentence is to take effect as a
term to be served either immediately or on the expiration of
another term of imprisonment passed on the offender by that
or another court.

(6) “ Adult ” in this section means a person who has attained
the age of twenty-one; and “the whole period” of a sentence
is the time which the offender would have had to serve in
prison if the sentence had been passed without an order under
subsection (1) above and he had no remission under section

987

Part III

25(1) of the Prison Act 1952 (industry and good conduct in 1952c., 52,
prison).

(7) Schedule 9 to this Act has effect with respect to procedural,
sentencing and miscellaneous matters ancillary to those dealt
with above in this section, including in particular the courts
which are competent under subsection (3) above.

(8) This section and paragraphs 1 to 6 of Schedule 9 to this
Act and the Powers of Criminal Courts Act 1973 shall be 1973 c. 62.
construed and have effect as if this section and those paragraphs
of the Schedule were contained in that Act.

48.
of the Justices of the Peace Act 1949 shall, without prejudice
to the generality of subsection (1) of that section, include power
to make, with respect to proceedings against any person for a

(1) The power to make rules conferred by section 15 Power to
make rules
as to furnish-
g of

information
prescribed offence or an offence of any prescribed class, by prosecutor
provision—

(a) for requiring the prosecutor to do such things as may be
prescribed for the purpose of securing that the accused
or a person representing him is furnished with, or can

in criminal
proceedings.
1949 c. 101.



988 c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Part III obtain, advance information concerning all, or any
prescribed class of, the facts and matters of which the
prosecutor proposes to adduce evidence; and

(b) for requiring a magistrates’ court, if satisfied that any
requirement imposed by virtue of paragraph (a) above
has not been complied with, to adjourn the proceedings
pending compliance with that requirement unless the
court is satisfied that the conduct of the case for the
accused will not be substantially prejudiced by non-
compliance with the requirement.

(2) Rules made by virtue of subsection (1)(a) above—
(a) may require the prosecutor to do as provided in the

rules either—
(i) in all cases ; or
(ii) only if so requested by or on behalf of the

accused;
(b) may exempt facts and matters of any prescribed des-

cription from any requirement imposed by the rules,
and may make the opinion of the prosecutor material
for the purposes of any such exemption ; and

(c) may make different provision with respect to different
offences or offences of different classes.

(3) It shall not be open to a person convicted of an offence
to appeal against the conviction on the ground that a requirement
imposed by virtue of subsection (1) above was not complied
with by the prosecutor.

49. After section 34 of the Powers of Criminal Courts Act
Power to 1973 there shall be inserted—
order search
of persons cnower

of 34A.—(1) Where—

before
Crown Court to (a) the Crown Court imposes a fine on a person

order or forfeits his recognizance ;
1973 c. 62. search of .

persons (b) the Crown Court makes against a person
before it. any such order as is mentioned in para-

graph 3, 4 or 9 of Schedule 9 to the
Administration of Justice Act 1970 (orders

1970 c, 31. for the payment of costs) ;

(c) the Crown Court makes against a person
any such order as is mentioned in para-
graph 12 of that Schedule (fines etc. pay-
able by parents or guardians) other than
an order under section 35 of this Act; or

(d) on the determination of an appeal brought
by a person under section 83 of the Magis-

1952 ¢. 55. trates’ Courts Act 1952 a sum is payable



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

by him, whether by virtue of an order
of the Crown Court or by virtue of a
conviction or order of the magistrates’
court against whose decision the appeal
was brought,

then, if that person is before it, the Crown Court
may order him to be searched.

(2) Any money found on a person in a search
under this section may be applied, unless the court
otherwise directs, towards payment of the fine or
other sum payable by him; and the balance, if any,
shall be returned to him.”.

Part IV
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

989

Part Iii

50.—(1) For sections 1 and 2 of the Road Traffic Act 1972 Amendment

(causing death by reckless or dangerous driving, and reckless, of Road
and dangerous, driving generally) there shall be substituted— Traffic

Act

“ Causing 1. A person who causes the death of another 1972 c. 20.

death by person by driving a motor vehicle on a road recklessly
driving. shall be guilty of an offence.

2. A person who drives a motor vehicle on a road
recklessly shall be guilty of an offence.”.

(2) For section 17 of that Act (reckless, and dangerous, cycling)
there shall be substituted—
“
Reckless

17. A person who rides a cycle, net being a motor
cyenne. vehicle, on a road recklessly shall be guilty of an

offence.

In this section ‘ road ’ includes a bridleway.”.
(3) Nothing in subsection (1) or (2) above or in any related

repeal provided for in Schedule 13 to this Act shall apply in
relation to an offence committed before the coming into force
of that subsection.

51.—(1) A person who—
(a) places any article in any place whatever ; or

(b) dispatches any article by post, rail or any other means
whatever of sending things from one place to another,

with the intention (in either case) of inducing in some other
person a belief that it is likely to explode or ignite and thereby
cause personal injury or damage to property is guilty of an
offence.

In this subsection “article” includes substance.

Bomb hoaxes.



990

Part IV

Misuse of
Drugs Act
1971: redefi-
nition of
cannabis.
1971 c. 38.

Amendments
of Obscene
Publications
Act 1959
with respect
to cinema-
tograph
exhibitions.
1959 c. 66.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(2) A person who communicates any information which he
knows or believes to be false to another person with the intention
of inducing in him or any other person a false belief that a bomb
or other thing liable to explode or ignite is present in any place
or location whatever is guilty of an offence.

(3) For a person to be guilty of an offence under subsection
(1) or (2) above it is not necessary for him to have any particular
person in mind as the person in whom he intends to induce the
belief mentioned in that subsection.

(4) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be
liable—

(a) on summary conviction, to imprisonment for a term not
exceeding three months or to a fine not exceeding
£1,000, or both ;

(b) on conviction on indictment, to imprisonment for a term
not exceeding five years.

52. In section 37(1) (interpretation) of the Misuse of Drugs
Act 1971, for the definition of “cannabis” there shall be
substituted—

cannabis’ (except in the expression
‘ cannabis resin ’)

means any plant of the genus Cannabis or any part
of any such plant (by whatever name designated)
except that it does not include cannabis resin or any
of the following products after separation from the rest
of the plant, namely—

(a) mature stalk of any such plant,
(b) fibre produced from mature stalk of any such
plant, and

(c) seed of any such plant; ”.

53.—(1) In the proviso to section 1(3) of the Obscene Publica-
tions Act 1959 (which excludes from the scope of that Act
anything done in the course of a cinematograph exhibition
taking place otherwise than in a private house to which the
public are not admitted and anything done in the course of
television or sound broadcasting) the words from “a cinemato-
graph exhibition” to “in the course of” shall be omitted.

(2) In section 2 of that Act (prohibition of publication of
obscene matter) at the end of subsection (3) there shall be
inserted the following subsection :—

“* (3A) Proceedings for an offence under this section shall
not be instituted except by or with the consent of the
Director of Public Prosecutions in any case where the
article in question is a moving picture film of a width of
not less than sixteen millimetres and the relevant publication



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

or the only other publication which followed or could
reasonably have been expected to follow from the relevant

publication took place or (as the case may be) was to take

place in the course of a cinematograph exhibition; and
in this subsection “ the relevant publication

” means—

(a) in the case of any proceedings under this section
for publishing an obscene article, the publication
in respect of which the defendant would be

charged if the proceedings were brought; and

(b) in the case of any proceedings under this section
for having an obscene article for publication for
gain, the publication which, if the proceedings
were brought, the defendant would be alleged to
have had in contemplation.’

”

(3) In section 2 of that Act after subsection (4) there shall be
inserted the following subsection:—“ (4A) Without prejudice to subsection (4) above, a

person shall not be proceeded against for an offence at
common law—

(a) in respect of a cinematograph exhibition or any-
thing said or done in the course of a cinemato-
graph exhibition, where it is of the essence of the
common law offence that the exhibition or, as the
case may be, what was said or done was obscene,
indecent, offensive, disgusting or injurious to

morality ; or
(b) in respect of an agreement to give a cinemato-

graph exhibition or to cause anything to be said
or done in the course of such an exhibition where
the common law offence consists of conspiring to

corrupt public morals or to do any act contrary
to public morals or decency.”

(4) At the end of section 2 of that Act there shall be added
the following subsection: —“ (7) In this section “ cinematograph exhibition ” means

an exhibition of moving pictures produced on a screen by
means which include the projection of light.”

(5) In section 3 of that Act (which among other things makes

provision for the forfeiture of obscene articles kept for publica-
tion for gain) at the beginning of subsection G3) there shall be
inserted the words “ Subject to subsection (3A) of this section ”
and at the end of that subsection there shall be inserted the

following subsection: —“ (3A) Without prejudice to the duty of a court to make
an order for the forfeiture of an article where section 1(4)

991

Part IV

of the Obscene Publications Act 1964 applies (orders made 1964 c. 74.



992

Part IV

Inciting girl
under sixteen
to have
incestuous
sexual
intercourse.

1960 c. 33.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

on conviction), in a case where by virtue of subsection (3A)
of section 2 of this Act proceedings under the said section
2 for having an article for publication for gain could not be
instituted except by or with the consent of the Director of
Public Prosecutions, no order for the forfeiture of the
article shall be made under this section unless the warrant
under which the article was seized was issued on an
information laid by or on behalf of the Director of Public
Prosecutions.”

(6) In section 4 of that Act (defence of public good) at the
beginning of subsection (1) there shall be inserted the words
“Subject to subsection (1A) of this section” and at the end
of that subsection there shall be inserted the following sub-
section :—

“ (LA) Subsection (1) of this section shall not apply where
the article in question is a moving picture film or sound-
track, but—

(a) a person shall not be convicted of an offence against
section 2 of this Act in relation to any such film
or soundtrack, and

(b) an order for forfeiture of any such film or sound-
track shall not be made under section 3 of this
Act,

if it is proved that publication of the film or soundtrack is
justified as being for the public good on the ground that
it is in the interests of drama, opera, ballet or any other
art, or of literature or learning.”

(7) At the end of section 4 of that Act there shall be added
the following subsection : —

“* (3) In this section “ moving picture soundtrack ” means
any sound record designed for playing with a moving
picture film, whether incorporated with the film or not.”

_
54.—(1) It is an offence for a man to incite to have sexual

intercourse with him a girl under the age of sixteen whom he
knows to be his grand-daughter, daughter or sister.

(2) In the preceding subsection “ man ” includes boy,
“ sister ”

includes half-sister, and for the purposes of that subsection any
expression importing a relationship between two people shall be
taken to apply notwithstanding that the relationship is not traced
through lawful wedlock.

(3) The following provisions of section 1 of the Indecencywith Children Act 1960, namely—
subsection (2) (competence of spouse of accused to give

evidence);



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 993

subsection (3) (references in Children and Young Persons ParrIV
Act 1933 to the offences mentioned in Schedule 1 to 1933 c. 12.

that Act to include offences under that section);
subsection (4) (offences under that section to be deemed

offences against the person for the purpose of section 3

of the Visiting Forces Act 1952), 1952 c. 67.

shall apply in relation to offences under this section.

(4) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be
liable—

(a) on summary conviction, to imprisonment for a term not

exceeding six months or to a fine not exceeding £1,000,
or both ;

(b) on conviction on indictment, to imprisonment for a
term not exceeding two years.

55.—(1) The Rabies Act 1974 shall be amended as provided Amendment
s of Rabies

in subsections (2) and (3) below. ‘Act 1974 and

(2) After section 5 there shall be inserted the following Diseases of
. Animals (N.1.)

sections:— Order 1975.
** Powers 5A.—(1) Without prejudice to the powers of arrest 1974 ¢, 17.
of arrest. conferred by section 71 of the principal Act or other-

wise, a constable may arrest without warrant any
person whom he, with reasonable cause, suspects to
be in the act of committing or to have committed
an offence to which this section applies.

(2) The offences to which this section applies are
offences against the principal Act consisting of—

(a) the landing or attempted landing of any
animal in contravention of an order made
under that Act and expressed to be made
for the purpose of preventing the introduc-
tion of rabies into Great Britain; or

(b) the failure by the person having the charge
or control of any vessel, boat or hovercraft
to discharge any obligation imposed on
him in that capacity by such an order; or

(c) the movement, in contravention of an order
under section 10 or 11 of that Act, of any
animal into, within or out of a place or
area declared to be infected with rabies.

(3) Section 73(1) of the principal Act (inspectors
to have powers of constables) shall not have effect in
relation to the powers conferred by this or the
following section.



994

Part IV

1970 c. 40.

S.L. 1974/2211.
S.1. 1974/2212,
S.I. 1975/418
(N.I. 3).

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Powers of 3B.—(1) For the purpose of arresting a person
satryand under the power conferred by section 5A above a

constable may enter (if need be, by force) and search
any vessel, boat, hovercraft, aircraft or vehicle of any
other description in which that person is or in which
the constable, with reasonable cause, suspects him
to be.

(2) For the purpose of exercising any power to
seize an animal or cause an animal to be seized which
is conferred on constables by an order made under
the principal Act and expressed to be made for the
purpose of preventing the introduction of rabies into
Great Britain, a constable may enter (if need be, by
force) and search any vessel, boat, hovercraft, aircraft
or vehicle of any other description in which there is,
or in which he, with reasonable cause, suspects that
there is, an animal to which that power applies.”.

(3) After section 6 there shall be inserted the followingsection: —
6A.—(1) An order made under the principal Act

for rabies ad expressed to be made for the purpose of prevent-
offences, ing the introduction or spreading of rabies into or

within Great Britain may direct that paragraph (a)
of section 79(1) of that Act (punishment for offences)
shall have effect in relation to any summary offence
against that Act the existence of which is attribut-
able to the provisions of that order as if for the
words ‘£400’ (which were substituted by section
105(5)(a) of the Agriculture Act 1970) there were
substituted the words ‘ £1,000’.

(2) The said paragraph (a) shall have effect as
aforesaid in relation to any summary offence the
existence of which is attributable to the provisions
of either of the following orders made under the
principal Act, namely the Rabies (Importation of
Dogs, Cats and Other Mammals) Order 1974 and
the Rabies (Control) Order 1974.”,

(4) The Diseases of Animals (Northern Ireland) Order 1975
shall be amended as follows.

(5) After Article 7 there shall be inserted the followingArticles:—
“ Powers of arrest

7A.—(1) Without prejudice to the powers of arrest con-
ferred by section 39 of the principal Act or otherwise, a
constable may arrest without warrant any person whom he,



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 995

with reasonable cause, suspects to be in the act of com- ParTIV
mitting or to have committed an offence to which this Article
applies.

(2) The offences to which this Article applies are offences
against the principal Act consisting of—

(a) the landing or attempted landing of any animal in
contravention of an order made under that Act and
expressed to be made for the purpose of preventing
the introduction of rabies into Northern Ireland;
or

(b) the failure by the person having the charge or
control of any vessel, boat or hovercraft to dis-
charge any obligation imposed on him in that
capacity by such an order; or

(c) the movement, in contravention of an order under
section 7 or 8 of that Act, of any animal into,
within or out of a place or area declared to be
infected with rabies.

(3) Section 41(1) of the principal Act (inspectors to have

powers of constables) shall not have effect in relation to the

powers conferred by this or the following Article.

Powers of entry and search

7B.—(1) For the purpose of arresting a person under the

power conferred by Article 7A a constable may enter (if
need be, by force) and search any vessel, boat, hovercraft,
aircraft or vehicle of any other description in which that
person is or in which the constable, with reasonable cause,
suspects him to be.

(2) For the purpose of exercising any power to seize an
animal or cause an animal to be seized which is conferred
on constables by an order made under the principal Act
and expressed to be made for the purpose of preventing the
introduction of rabies into Northern Ireland, a constable
may enter (if need be, by force) and search any vessel, boat,
hovercraft, aircraft or vehicle of any other description in
which there is, or in which he, with reasonable cause,
suspects that there is, an animal to which that power
applies.”’.

(6) After Article 8 there shall be inserted the following
Article:— “ Increase of fines for rabies offences

8A.—(1) An order made under the principal Act and
expressed to be made for the purpose of preventing the
introduction or spreading of rabies into or within Northern



996

Part IV

S.I. 1975/418
(N.I. 3).

Coroners’
inquests.

1926 c. 59,

1888 c. xxxviii.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Ireland may direct that paragraph (a) of section 46(1) of
that Act (punishment for offences) shall have effect in
relation to any summary offence against that Act the
existence of which is attributable to the provisions of that
order as if, for the words ‘ £500’ (which were substituted by
Article 10(1)(a@) of the Diseases of Animals (Northern
Ireland) Order 1975) there were substituted the words
‘£1,000’.

(2) The said paragraph (a) shall have effect as aforesaid
in telation to any summary offence the existence of which
is attributable to the provisions of any order made under
the principal Act before the coming into operation of section
55(6) of the Criminal Law Act 1977 and expressed to be
made for the purpose of preventing the introduction or
spreading of rabies into or within Northern Ireland.”.

56.—(1) At a coroner’s inquest touching the death of a person
who came by his death by murder, manslaughter or infanticide,
the purpose of the proceedings shall not include the finding of
any person guilty of the murder, manslaughter or infanticide;
and accordingly a coroner’s inquisition shall in no case charge
a person with any of those offences.

(2) Without prejudice to the power of a coroner under
subsection (2) of section 13 of the Coroners (Amendment) Act
1926 to summona jury if it appears to him that there is any
reason for doing so in a case in which he is not required
by that subsection to do so, paragraphs (a) and (d) of that
subsection (which require him to do so if it appears to him
that the deceased came by his death by murder, manslaughter
or infanticide, or that the death was caused by an accident
arising out of the use of a vehicle in a street or public highway)
shall cease to have effect.

(3) The section set out in Schedule 10 to this Act shall be
substituted for section 20 of the Coroners (Amendment) Act
1926 (which provides for the adjournment of inquests in cases
of murder, manslaughter or infanticide, of causing death by

reckless
driving, or of aiding, abetting, counselling or procuring

suicide).

(4) The City of London Fire Inquests Act 1888 (which
makes provision as to the functions and proceedings of the
coroner for the City of London with regard to inquests upon
fires within the City) shall cease to have effect.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

57,—(1) In section 2 of the Powers of Criminal Courts Act
1973 (probation) there shall be added after subsection (8) the
following subsections—

**(9) The Secretary of State may by order direct that sub-

997

Part IV
Probation and
conditional
discharge:
power to vary

section (1) above shall be amended by substituting, for the statutory
minimum or maximum period specified in that subsection
as originally enacted or as previously amended under this
subsection, such period as may be specified in the order.

(10) An order under subsection (9) above may make in
paragraph 3(2)(a) of Schedule | to this Act any amendment
which the Secretary of State thinks necessary in consequence
of any substitution made by the order.”.

(2) In section 7 of the said Act of 1973 (absolute and con-
ditional discharge) there shall be added after subsection (4)
the following subsection—

“(5) The Secretary of State may by order direct that
subsection (1) above shall be amended by substituting, for
the maximum period specified in that subsection as origin-
ally enacted or as previously amended under this sub-
section, such period as may be specified in the order.”.

(3) In subsections (3) and (4) of section 54 of the said Act of
1973 (which require certain orders under that Act to be approved
by a resolution of each House of Parliament, and provide for
their revocation), before the word “14”, wherever it occurs,
there shali be inserted the words “ 2 or 7 or”.

58.—(1) In section 8(3) of the Criminal Justice Act 1961
(under which the maximum fine that may be imposed on a young
person tried summarily is £50) for the words “ fifty pounds”, in
both places where they occur, there shall be substituted the
words “ £200”.

(2) In section 2(13) of the Children and Young Persons Act
1969 (by virtue of which the maximum amount for which
the parent or guardian of a child or young person can be

required by an order under section 1 of that Act to enter into a
recognisance to take proper care of and exercise proper control
over him is £50), for the words “ fifty pounds” there shall be
substituted the words “ £200”.

(3) In section 3(7) of the said Act of 1969 (under which the
maximum amount for which a young person can in care pro-
ceedings be required by an order under that subsection to enter
into a recognisance to keep the peace or to be of good behaviour
is £25), for the words “twenty-five pounds” there shall be
substituted the words “£50”.

minimum or
maximum
period.
1973 c. 62.

Proceedings
involving
persons
under 17:
increase of
certain
pecuniary
limits.
1961 c. 39.
1969 c. 54.



998

Part IV

1961 ¢. 39,
1969 ¢. 54,

Alteration
ofmaximum
periods of
imprisonment
in default of
payment of
fines etc.
1952 c. 55,

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(4) In subsection (3) of section 6 of the said Act of 1969 (under
which the maximum fine which can be imposed on a young
person tried summarily for an indictable offence in pursuance of
subsection (1) of that section is £50), for the words “fifty
pounds” there shall be substituted the words “£200”.

(5) In section 15(4) of the said Act of 1969 (powers of a magis-
trates’ court other than a juvenile court in respect of failure by
the supervised person to comply with certain requirements of a
supervision order, if that person has attained the age of
eighteen)—

(a) in paragraph (a) (under which, if the court does not
discharge the supervision order, the maximum fine
which it can impose on the supervised person is £20),
for the words “twenty pounds” there shall be sub-
stituted the words “ £50” ; and

(b) for the words “four hundred pounds” (which specify
the maximum fine which the court can impose if it
discharges the supervision order in a case where the
offence in consequence of which the order was made is
of a kind which the court has no power to try or has
no power to try without appropriate consents) there
shall be substituted the words “ £1,000 ”.

(6) In relation to a person under the age of fourteen section
8(3) of the Criminal Justice Act 1961 and section 6(3) of the
Children and Young Persons Act 1969 shall have effect as if
for the words “£200”, wherever they occur by virtue of sub-
section (1) or (4) above, there were substituted the words £50”:
but this subsection shall cease to have effect on the coming into
force of section 4 of the said Act of 1969 (which prohibits
criminal proceedings against children).

59. For the Table in paragraph 1 of Schedule 3 to the Magis-
trates’ Courts Act 1952 (maximum periods of imprisonment in
default of payment of fines etc.) there shall be substituted the
following Table:— “ TABLE

An amount not exceeding £25 7 days
An amount exceeding £25 but not

exceeding £50... .. 14days
An amount exceeding £50 but not

exceeding £200... .. 30days
An amount exceeding £200 but not

exceeding £500... 60days
An amount exceeding £500 but not

exceeding £1,000 ... 90 days



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 999

An amount exceeding £1,000 but not Part IV
exceeding £2,500 6 months

An amount exceeding £2,500 but not
exceeding £5,000 ... 9 months

An amount exceeding £5,000 ... ... 12 months.”

60.—(1) In section 35(5) of the Powers of Criminal Courts Increase in

Act 1973 (limit of £400 on compensation which can be made maxinu®

payable under a compensation order made by a magistrates’ am OU ction
court) for the words “£400” there shall be substituted the which may be

words “ £1,000”. ordered by

(2) Subsection (1) above shall not apply in relation to a com- magistrates

pensation order made in respect of an offence committed before 1973 ¢, 62,

the coming into force of this section.

61.—(1) If it appears to the Secretary of State that there has Power to

been a change in the value of money since the last occasion
alter

sums
when the sum or sums specified in a provision mentioned inain
subsection (2) below were fixed (whether by the coming into force provisions.
of a provision of this Act or by order under this subsection),
the Secretary of State may by order substitute for the sum or
sums for the time being specified in that provision such other
sum or sums as appear to him justified by the change.

(2) The said provisions are—
(a) section 23(1) above;
(b) the definition of “the prescribed sum ” in section 28(7)

above;
(c) paragraph (a) of section 29 above ;

(d) the Table in paragraph 1 of Schedule 3 to the Magis- 1952 c. 58.

trates’ Courts Act 1952 (maximum periods of imprison-
ment in default of payment of fines etc.)

(e) section 35(5) of the Powers of Criminal Courts Act 1973

dimit on compensation which can be made payable

under
a compensation order made by a magistrates’

court).

(3) Where it appears to the Secretary of State that the
difference between a sum to which subsection (4) below applies
and the prescribed sum (within the meaning of section 28 above)
has been or would be altered or eliminated by an order made or

proposed to be made under subsection (1) above, he may by
order amend the enactment specifying the first-mentioned sum

so as to substitute for that sum such other sum as appears to
him to be justified by a change in the value of money appearing
to him to have taken place between—

(a) the last occasion on which the sum in question was
fixed ; and



1000

Part IV

Right to have
someone
informed
when arrested.

Provisions
applying to
Scotland.
1975 c. 21.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

(b) the making of the order or proposed order under sub-
section (1) above.

(4) This subsection applies to any sum specified in any enact-
ment contained in this Act (except paragraph (a) of section 29)
or in any Act passed before, or in the same Session as, this Act
as—

(a) the maximum fine which may be imposed on summaryconviction of an offence triable either way; or
(b) the maximum fine which, in the exercise of any power

by subordinate instrument to impose penal provisions,
may be authorised on summary conviction in respect ofan offence triable either way.

(5) An order under subsection (1) or (3) above—
(a) shall be made by statutory instrument subject to annul-

ment in pursuance of a resolution of either House of
Parliament and may be revoked by a subsequent order
thereunder ; and

(b) without prejudice to Schedule 14 to this Act, shall
not affect the punishment for an offence committed
before that order comes into force.

62. Where any person has been arrested and is being held in
custody in a police station or other premises, he shall be
entitled to have intimation of his arrest and of the place where
he is being held sent to one person reasonably named by him,without delay or, where some delay is necessary in the interest
of the investigation or prevention of crime or the apprehensionof offenders, with no more delay than is so necessary.

Part V
PROVISIONS APPLYING TO SCOTLAND

63.—(1) The Criminal Procedure (Scotland) Act 1975 shall
have effect subject to the amendments specified in Schedule 11
to this Act.

(2) The following provisions of this Act shall have effect in
relation to Scotland, namely—

section 15(2) to (4).
section 30(3):
section 31(10);
section 32(3) ;

section 33 ;
sections 38 to 40 and Schedule 7 ;



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

sections 50 to 52 ;

section 55(1) to (3);
section 65(1), (3) and (6) to (10) and Schedule 14;
section 65(4) and Schedule 12 so far as they relate to—

Night Poaching Act 1828,
Public Stores Act 1875,

Explosive Substances Act 1883,
Prison Act 1952 (in its application to persons for

the time being in Scotland),

Adoption Act 1958,
sections 26, 28, 29 and 39(1) of the Criminal
Justice Act 1961,

Housing (Scotland) Act 1966,
Road Traffic Regulation Act 1967,

sections 3 and 60 of the Criminal Justice Act
1967 and (in its application to persons for the
time being in Scotland) section 63 of that Act,

Companies Act 1967,

Gaming Act 1968,
section 179 of the Road Traffic Act 1972,

Health and Safety at Work etc. Act 1974,

Rehabilitation of Offenders Act 1974 ;

section 65(5) and Schedule 13 so far as they relate to—

Night Poaching Act 1828,
Truck Act 1831,
Public Stores Act 1875,
section 5, 7, 9 or 19 of the Conspiracy and Pro-
tection of Property Act 1875,

Cruelty to Animals Act 1876,
Truck Amendment Act 1887,
Witnesses (Public Inquiries) Protection Act 1892,

section 283 of the Customs and Excise Act 1952,

Protection of Animals (Amendment) Act 1954,
sections 26 and 28 of the Criminal Justice Act

1961,
Penalties for Drunkenness Act 1962,
Criminal Justice (Scotland) Act 1963,
sections 43(2) and 80 of the Road Traffic Regula-

tion Act 1967,
sections 60, 92(8) and 106(2)(f) of and, in rela-

tion to enactments mentioned therein which

1001

Part V



1002

Part V

Meaning of
** indictable
offence ”’,
“*
summary

offence ” and
“* offence
triable either
way ” in
England and
Wales.

Citation, etc.

1952 ¢. 55.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

extend to Scotland, Part I of Schedule 3 to the
Criminal Justice Act 1967,

Firearms Act 1968,
Transport Act 1968,
section 59(5)(e) of and paragraph 48(a) of Schedule

8 to the Courts Act 1971,
Misuse of Drugs Act 1971,
Road Traffic Act 1972,

section
58(a) of the Powers of Criminal Courts Act

Road Traffic Act 1974,
District Courts (Scotland) Act 1975,
Criminal Procedure (Scotland) Act 1975,
Protection of Birds (Amendment) Act 1976 :

Schedule 9, paragraph 3(3).

Part VI
SUPPLEMENTARY

64.—(1) In this Act and, unless the context otherwise requires,in any other enactment (including an enactment passed after this
Act)—

(a) “indictable offence ” means an offence which, if com-
mitted by an adult, is triable on indictment, whether it
is exclusively so triable or triable either way;

(b) “summary offence” means an offence which, if com-
mitted by an adult, is triable only summarily ;

(c) “ offence triable either way
” means an offence which, if

committed by an adult, is triable either on indictment
or summarily ;

and the terms “ indictable”, “ summary” and “ triable either
way”, in their application to offences, shall be construed
accordingly.

(2) In the definitions in subsection (1) above references to the
way or ways in which an offence is triable are to be construed
without regard to the effect, if any, of section 23 above on the
mode of trial.

65.—(1) This Act may be cited as the Criminal Law Act
1977.

(2) The provisions of sections 14 to 32 and 48 above, so far
as they relate to proceedings before magistrates’ courts, shall be
construed as one with the Magistrates’ Courts Act 1952, except



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45

that in those provisions “fine” shall include any pecuniary
penalty.

(3) Except where the context otherwise requires, any reference
in this Act to any enactment is a reference to it as amended,
and includes a reference to it as extended or applied, by or under
any other enactment, including this Act.

(4) The enactments specified in Schedule 12 to this Act
shall have effect subject to the amendments there specified, being
minor amendments and amendments consequential on the pro-
visions of this Act.

(5) Subject to the transitional provisions contained in this Act,
the enactments specified in Schedule 13 to this Act (which include
certain spent provisions) are hereby repealed to the extent
specified in the third column of that Schedule.

(6) There shall be defrayed out of money provided by Parlia-
ment any increase attributable to the provisions of this Act in
the sums payable out of such money under any other Act.

(7) This Act shall come into force on such day as the Secretary
of State may appoint by order made by statutory instrument, and
different days may be so appointed for different purposes.

(8) Without prejudice to any other transitional provision
contained in this Act, the transitional provisions contained in
Schedule 14 to this Act shall have effect.

(9) Without prejudice to Schedule 14 or any other transitional
provision contained in this Act, an order under subsection (7)
above may make such transitional provision as appears to the
Secretary of State to be necessary or expedient in connection
with the provisions thereby brought into force.

(10) In this Act—
(a) Part V and, so far as there provided, the provisions men-

tioned in section 63(2) above extend to Scotland;
(b) the following provisions extend to Northern Ireland

namely—
sections 38 to 40,
section 44,
section 52,
section 55(4) to (6),
subsections (1), (3) and (6) to (10) of this section,
Schedule 7,
in Schedule 14, paragraph 5 ;

(c) section 31 and Schedule 6, so far as they amend any
enactment which extends to the Channel Islands or the

1003

Part VI



1004 c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Part VI Isle of Man, extend to the Channel Islands or the Isle
of Man, as the case may be;

(d) subsections (4) and (5) above and Schedules 12 and 13,
so far as they relate to—

1952 c. 52. (i) section 45 of the Prison Act 1952 (in its
application to persons for the time being in Northern
Ireland or in the Channel Islands or the Isle of
Man);

1961 c. 39. (ii) Part III and section 39(1) of the Criminal
Justice Act 1961; and

1967 c. 80. (iii) sections 60 and 63 of the Criminal Justice
Act 1967 (in their application to persons for the
time being in Northern Ireland or in the Channel
Islands or the Isle of Man),

extend to Northern Ireland, the Channel Islands and
the Isle of Man (as well as, by virtue of paragraph (a)
above, to Scotland) ;

(e) section 32(3) extends to all places (except Scotland)
1972 c. 68. to which section 2 of the European Communities Act

1972 extends (as well as, by virtue of paragraph (a)
above, to Scotland), and the provisions of section 28(6)
and (7), in their operation in relation to the provision
that may be made under section 2(2) of the said Act
of 1972, extend to all such places (except Scotland) ;

but
save as aforesaid, this Act extends to England and Wales

only.



SCHEDULES
SCHEDULE1

OFFENCES MADE TRIABLE ONLY SUMMARILY, AND RELATED AMENDMENTS

1 2
Offence Enactment

NiGcut Poacuine Act 1828 (c. 69)
1. Offences under section 1 Section I

(taking or destroying game
or rabbits by night or enter-
ing land for that purpose).

Truck Act 1831 (c. 37)
2. Offences under section 9 Section 9.
(entering into illegal con-
tracts or making illegal pay-
ments).

Pusiic MEETING Act 1908 (c. 66)
3. Offences under section Section 1(1).
1(1) (endeavouring to break
up a public meeting).

CHILDREN AND YounG Persons Act 1933 (c. 12)
4. Offences under section 3 Section 3.
(allowing persons under 16
to be in brothels).

3
Amendment

For the words from “ such offen-
der” onwards substitute “he
shall be liable on summary con-
viction to a fine not exceeding
£200”.

For the words from “ for the first ”
onwards substitute be liable on
summary conviction to a fine not
exceeding £200 °’.

After offence” add and shall
on summary conviction be liable to
imprisonment for a term not ex-
ceeding six months or to a fine not
exceeding £1,000 or to both”.

For the words from “ guilty” to
‘twenty-five pounds” substitute
** liable on summary conviction to
a fine not exceeding £50”.

4
Oldpenalties

(a) for a first offence, on
summary conviction, 3
months or £100 and, in
default of finding sureties of
£10, a further 6 months;
(6) for a second offence, on
summary conviction, 6
months or £100 and, in
default of finding sureties of
£20, a further 12 months;
(c) for a third offence, on
conviction on indictment,
2 years or a fine or both.

(a) for a first offence, £10;
(6) fora second offence, £20;
(c) for a third offence, £100.

(a) on summary conviction
3 months or £100 or both;
(b) on conviction on indict-
ment 12 months or £500 or
both.

(a) on summary conviction
6 months or £25 or both;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment 6 months or £25 or
both.

Sections 15
and 30.

5
New penalties

£200.

£200.

6months or £1,000
or both.

6months or £50 or
both,

LL
6I

19
"
W
U
T
Jo
us
t)

sp
o

So
ol



i
Offence

2
Enactment

3
Amendment

PusLic Orper Acr 1936 (1 Edw. 8 & 1 Geo, 6.) (c. &
5. Offences under section 5
(conduct conducive to
breaches of the peace).

Water Act 1945 (c. 42)
6. Offences under section 7
(failure to comply with
obligations in relation to
the obtaining of informa-
tion as to underground
water),

7, Offences under section 34
(securing that water dis-
charged under that section
into a water-course is un-
polluted).

8. Any offence consisting in
a contravention of section
71 of Schedule 3 (pollution
from liquids resulting from
manufacture of gas).

Section 5 (as substi-
tuted by section 7 of
the Race Relations
Act 1965).

Section 7(7).

Section 34(5),

Section 71 of Sche-
dule 3.

REPRESENTATION OF THE PEOPLE Act 1949 c. 68)
9. Offences under section 49
(offences in connection with
service declarations).

Section 49(1).

After “ offence add “and shall
on summary conviction be liable to
imprisonment for a term not ex-
ceeding six months or to a fine not
exceeding £1,000 or to both ”.

After “ Act” add “and shall on
summary conviction be liable to a
fine not exceeding £200 and, where
the offence continues after con-
viction, to a further fine of £20 for
every day during which it so
continues ”’.

After “ Act” add “and shall on
summary conviction be liable to a
fine not exceeding £200 and, where
the offence continues after con-
viction, to a further fine of £20 for
every day during which it so
continues *’,
For the words from “fifty
pounds ” to “ten pounds” sub-
stitute £200 and to a further fine
not exceeding £20 ”’.

For the words from “ fifty” to
** one hundred pounds ” substitute“ £500 ”

4
Oldpenalties

(a) on summary conviction
3 months or £100 or both;
(5) on conviction on indict-
ment 12 months or £500 or
both.

(a) on summary conviction
£50 and, where the offence
continues, a daily fine of£5;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £200 and, where the
offence continues, a daily
fine of £20.

(a) on summary conviction
£50 and, where the offence
continues, a daily fine of£5;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £200 and, where the
offence continues, a daily
fine of £20.
(a) on summary conviction
£50 and, where the offence
continues, a daily fine of
£10;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £200 and, where the
offence continues, a daily
fine of £20.

(a) on summary conviction
£50 or 3 months or both;
(5) on conviction on indict-
ment £100 or 6 months or
both.

5
Newpenalties

6months or£1,000
or both.

£200 and, where
the offence con-
tinues, a daily fine
of £20.

£200 and, where
the offence con-
tinues, a daily fine
of £20.

£200 and, where
the offence con-
tinues, a daily fine
of £20.

£500 or 6 months
or both.

T
‘H
O
S

90
0T

LL
6I

W
V
M
D
T
[o
ul
d



oe

1

Offence
Post Orrice Act 1953 (c. 36)
10. Offences under section
56 (criminal diversion of
letters from addressee).

Dentists Act 1957 (c. 28)
11, Offences under section
34 (prohibition on practice
of dentistry by laymen).

12, Offences under section
35 (prohibition on use of
practitioners’ titles by lay-
men).

13. Offences under section
37 (restrictions on indivi-
duals).

Opticians AcT 1958 (c. 32)
14, Offences under section
20 (restriction on testing of
sight).

15, Offences under section
21 (restriction on sale and
supply of optical appli-
ances).

16. Offences under section
22 (penalty for pretending
to be registered etc ).

2
Enactment

Section 56(1).

Section 34(1).

Section 35(2).

Section 37(1).

Section 20(5).

Section 21(5).

ction 22(1) and (2).

3
Amendment

For the words from “ guilty”
onwards substitute “liable on
summary conviction to a fine not
exceeding £500 or to imprisonment
for a term not exceeding six
months or to both”,

For paragraphs (a) and (6) substi-
tute “‘on summary conviction to
a fine not exceeding £1,000”.

For paragraphs (a) and (4) substi-
tute “on summary conviction to
a fine not exceeding £1,000”.

For paragraphs (a) and (5) substi-
tute “‘on summary conviction to
a fine not exceeding £1,000’.

For the words from “ one hundred

pounds
* onwards __ substitute

ee

For the words from “‘ one hundred

pounds.
onwards substitute

In each subsection, for the words
from “ one hundred pounds ” on-
wards substitute £500”.

4
Oldpenalties

£50 or 6 months.

(a) on summary conviction
£100;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £500.

(a) on summary conviction
£100;
(b) on conviction on indict-
ment £500.

(a) on summary conviction

(d) on conviction on indict-
ment £500.

(a) on summary conviction
£100;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £250.

(a) on summary conviction
£100;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £250.

(a) on summary conviction
£100;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment £250.

3
New penalties

£500 or 6 months
or both.

£1,000,

£1,000,

£1,000.

£500.

£500.

£500

T
“B
O
S

LL
6I
PY

AU
T

LO
O
T



1

Offence

BETTING. GAMING AND Lorteriss ACT 1963 (c, 2)
17. Offences under the
following provisions—
section 7 (restriction of
betting on dog race-
courses);
section 10(5) (advertising
licensed betting offices);
section 11(6) (person
holding bookmaker’s or
betting agency permit
employing a person dis-
qualified from holding
such a permit);
section 18(2) (making
unauthorised charges to
bookmakers on licensed
track);
section 19 (occupiers of
licensed tracks not to
have any interest in book-
making thereon);
section 21 (betting with
young persons);
section 22 (betting circu-
lars not to be sent to
young persons),

Poxtce Act 1964 (c. 48)
18. Offences under section
51(1) (assaults on con-
stables).

2
Enactment

Section 52.

Section 51(1).

3
Amendment

For paragraphs (a) and (5) of sub-
section (2) (penalties for certain
offences) substitute on summary
conviction to a fine not exceeding
£1,000 or to imprisonment for a
term not exceeding six months or
to both”.

For paragraphs (a) and (4) substi-
tute “‘on summary conviction to
imprisonment for a term not
exceeding six months or to a fine
not exceeding £1,000 or to both ”.

4
Oldpenalties

(a) on summary conviction
£50 or, on a second or
subsequent conviction, 2
months or £100 or both;

(8) on conviction on indict-
ment £300 or, on a second
or subsequent conviction,
6 months or £500 or both.

(a) on summary conviction
6 months, or in the case of a
second or subsequent con-
viction 9months, or £100 or
both;
(b) on conviction on indict-
ment 2 years or a fine or
both.

T
*H

O
S

5
New penalties

£1,000or 6months
or both.

6 months or£1 ,000
or both.

80
01

sp
o

LL
6I
IP

W
U
T
[o
ut
ui
s)



1

Offence

Tueatres Act 1968 (c. 54)

19. Offences under section
6 (provocation of breach of
the peace bymeans ofpublic
performance of play).

Roap TraFric Act 1972 (c.
20. Offences under the
following provisions—

section 5(1) (driving or
attempting to drive when
unfit to drive through
drink or drugs);

section 5(2) (being in
charge of a motor vehicle
when unfit to drive
through drink or drugs);

section 6(1) (driving or
attempting to drive with
blood-alcohol concentra-
tion above the prescribed
limit);

2
Enactment

Section 6(2).

20)
In Part I of Schedule
4 (as amended by
Part IV of Schedule 5
to the Road Traffic
Act 1974)—-

the entry relating
to section 5(1);

the entry relating
to section 5(2);

the entry relating
to section 6(1);

3
Amendment

For paragraphs (a) and (b) substi-
tute “* on summary conviction to a
fine not exceeding £1,000 or to
imprisonment for a term not
exceeding six months or to both ”.

For the words in column 3 substi-
tute “*Summarily ” and for the
words in column 4 substitute “ 6
months or £1,000 or both ”;

for the words in column 3 substi-
tute “‘Summarily ” and for the
words in column 4 substitute “3
months or £500 or both ”;

for the words in column 3 substi-
tute “ Summarily ” and for the
words in column 4 substitute “* 6
months or £1,000 or both ”;

4
Oldpenalties

(a) on summary conviction
3 months or £100 or both;
(b) on conviction on indict-
ment 12 months or £500 or
both,

(a) on summary conviction
£400 or 4 months;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment 2 years or a fine or
both;

(a) on summary conviction
£200;
(b) on conviction on indict-
ment 12 months or a fine
or both;

(a) on summary conviction
£400 or 4 months;
(5) on conviction on indict-
ment 2 years or a fine or
both;

5
New penalties

6months or£1,000
or both.

6months or £1,000
or both;

3 months or £500
or both;

6months or £1,000
or both;

T
“H
O
S

LL
6[
PY

M
YT

sp
o

60
01



1

Offence
2

Enactment
Roap Trarric Act 1972 (c. 20) contd.
section 6(2) (being in
charge of a motor vehicle
with blood-alcohol con-
centration above thepres-cribed limit);

section 913) (failing to
provide a specimen of
blood or urine for a
laboratory test).

the entry relating
to section 6(2);

the entry relating
to section 9(3).

3
Amendment

for the words in column 3 substi-
tute “Summarily”” and for the
words in column 4 substitute “3
months or £500 or both ” ;

for the words in column 3 substi-
tute “ Summarily ” andin column
4, in paragraph (i) for the words“©£400” substitute “ 6 months or
£1,000 or both ” and for the words
from “ £200” in paragraph (ii) to
the end ofparagraph (iv) substitute“3 months or £500 or both ”.

HEALTH AND Safety at Work etc. Act 1974 (c. 37)
21. Offences under section
33(5) (continuing contra-vention of improvement
notice, prohibition notice
or court order).

Section 33(5). For the words from “liable” to
“£50” substitute “liable on
summary conviction to a fine not
exceeding £100”.

4
Oldpenalties

(2) on summary conviction
£200;
(6) on conviction on indict-
ment 12 months or a fine
or both;

(a) on summary conviction—
(i) where it is shown
that the offender was
driving or

attempting
to

drive, £400
(ii) where ‘in any other
case it is shown that the
offender was in charge of
amotor vehicle on a road
or other public place,

(6) on conviction on indict-
ment—
(i) 2 years or a fine or
both in the case of a con-
viction where it is shown
as mentioned in para-
graph (a)(i) above;

Gi) 12months or a fine or
both in the case of a con-
viction where it is shown
as mentioned in para-
graph (@\ii) above.

£50 for each day on which
the
tinues.

contravention con-

5
New penalties

3 months or £500
or both;

(a) where it is
shown that the
offender was dri-
ving or attempting
to drive, 6 months
or £1,000 or both;
(6) where in any
other case it is
shown that the
offender was in
charge of a motor
vehicle on a road
or other public
place, 3 months or
£500, or both.

£100 for each day
on which the con-
travention contin-
ues.

T
"H

O
S

sp
*o

LL
6I
19

M
D
T
Jo
ut
ui
4s
y



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 1011

SCHEDULE 2 Section 16.

OFFENCES TRIABLE EITHER WAY INSTBAD OF ONLY ON INDICTMENT

1. Offences at common law of public nuisance.

2. Offences under section 8 of the Disorderly Houses Act 1751 1751 c. 36,
(appearing to be keeper of bawdy house etc.).

3. Offences consisting in contravention of section 13 of the
Statutory Declarations Act 1835 (administration by a person of an 1835 c. 62.
oath etc. touching matters in which he has no jurisdiction).

4. Offences under section 36 of the Malicious Damage Act 1861 1861 c. 97.

(obstructing engines or carriages on railways).

5. Offences under the following provisions of the Offences against
the Person Act 1861— 1861 c. 100.

(a) section 16 (threats to kill) ;

(b) ae 26 (not providing apprentices or servants with food
etc.) ;

(c) section 34 (doing or omitting to do anything so as to endanger
railway passengers);

(d) section 36 (assaulting a clergyman at a place of worship etc.) ;

(e) section 38 (assault with intent to resist apprehension) ;

(f) section 57 (bigamy).

6. Offences under section 13 of the Debtors Act 1869 (transactions j9¢9 .. 62.
intended to defraud creditors).

7. Offences under section 5 of the Public Stores Act 1875 1875 c. 25.
(obliteration of marks with intent to conceal).

8. Offences under section 12 of the Corn Returns Act 1882 (false 1882 c. 37.
returns).

9. Offences under section 22 of the Electric Lighting Act 1882 1892 c. 56.
(injuring works with intent to cut off electricity supply).

10. Offences under section 3 of the Submarine Telegraph Act 1885 c. 49.
1885 (damaging submarine cables).

11. Offences under section 8(2) of the Cremation Act 1902 (making 1902 c. 8.
false representations etc. with a view to procuring the burning of
any human remains).

12. All offences under the Perjury Act 1911 except offences under— 1911 c. 6.

(a) section 1 (perjury in judicial proceedings) ;

(b) section 3 (false statements etc. with reference to marriage) ;

(c) section 4 (false statements etc. as to births or deaths) ;

(d) section 5 (false statutory declarations and other false state-
ments without oath) so far as it relates to statements in
statutory declarations.

K3



1012

Scu. 2
1913 ¢, 27,

1914 c.

1919 ¢.

1920 c.

1956 c.

1964 c,

1967 c.

1968 c.

47,

31.

41.

69.

87.

38.

60.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

13. The following offences under the Forgery Act 1913—
(a) offences under paragraph (a) of section 2(2) (forgery ot

valuable security etc.) in relation to any document being an
authority or request for the payment of money or for the
delivery or transfer of goods and chattels, where the amount
of money or the value of the goods or chattels does not
exceed £1,000 but does exceed £100 ;

(b) offences under paragraph (a) of section 7 (demanding prop-
erty on forged documents), where the amount of the money
or the value of the property in respect of which the offence
is committed does not exceed £1,000 but does exceed £100.

14. Offences under section 17 of the Deeds of Arrangement Act
1914 (trustee making preferential payments).

15. Offences under section 3(4) of the Checkweighing in Various
Industries Act 1919 (false statements).

16. Offences under section 8(2) of the Census Act 1920 (disclosing
census information).

17. Offences under the following provisions of the Sexual Offences
Act 1956—

(a) section 6 (unlawful sexual intercourse with a girl under 16);
(b) section 26 (permitting a girl under 16 to use premises for

sexual intercourse).

18. Offences under section 3(1) of the Shipping Contracts and
Commercial Documents Act 1964 (offences), so far as it relates to the
contravention of any direction under that Act.

19. The following offences under the Criminal Law Act 1967—
(a) offences under section 4(1) (assisting offenders) ; and

(b) offences under section 5(1) (concealing arrestable offences
and giving false information),

where the offence to which they relate is triable either way otherwise
than by virtue of section 16(2) above.

20. The following offences under the Theft Act 1968—
(a) burglary in a dwelling where entry to the dwelling or part of

it in which the burglary was committed, or to any building or
part of a building containing the dwelling, was obtained
by force or deception or by the use of any tool, key or
appliance, except where any person in the dwelling was sub-
jected to violence or the threat of violence ;

(6) handling stolen goods from an offence not committed in the
United Kingdom.

21. Uttering any forged document the forgery of which is an
offence mentioned in this Schedule.

22. Aiding, abetting, counselling or procuring the commission of
any offence mentioned in the preceding paragraphs of this Schedule
except paragraph 19.



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 1013

23. Attempting to commit any offence mentioned in the preceding Scu. 2
paragraphs of this Schedule except paragraphs 19 and 22.

24. Any offence consisting in the incitement to commit an offence
mentioned in the preceding paragraphs of this Schedule except para-
graphs 22 and 23.

SCHEDULE 3
Sections

16 and

OFFENCES TRIABLE EITHER WAY BY VIRTUE OF SECTION 16(1) OR (2)

1. Offences at common law of public nuisance.

2. Offences under section 8 of the Disorderly Houses Act 1751 1751 c. 36.

(appearing to be keeper of bawdy house etc.).

3. Offences consisting in contravention of section 13 of the
Statutory Declaration Act 1835 (administration by a person of an 1835 c. 62.

oath etc. touching matters in which he has no jurisdiction).

4. Offences under section 36 of the Malicious Damage Act 1861 1861 c. 97.

(obstructing engines or carriages on railways).

5. Offences under the following provisions of the Offences against 1861 c. 100.

the Person Act 1861—

(a) section 16 (threats to kill) ;

(b) section 20 (inflicting bodily injury, with or without a weapon) ;

(c) 26 (not providing apprentices or servants with food
etc.) ;

(d) section 27 (abandoning or exposing child) ;

(e) section 34 (doing or omitting to do anything so as tu
endanger railway passengers);

(f) sn 36 (assaulting a clergyman at a place of worship
etc.) ;

(g) section 38 (assault with intent to resist apprebension) ;

(h) section 47 (assault occasioning bodily harm—common
assault):

(i) section 57 (bigamy);
(f) section 60 (concealing the birth of a child).

6. Offences under section 20 of the Telegraph Act 1868 (disclosing 169 ¢. 110.
or intercepting messages).

7. Offences under section 13 of the Debtors Act 1869 (transactions 1g¢9 ¢, 62.
intended to defraud creditors).

8. Offences under section 5 of the Public Stores Act 1875 (oblitera- 875 ¢. 25.
tion of marks with intent to conceal).

K4



1014

Scu. 3
1882 c. 37.

1882 c. 56.

1885 c. 49,

1891 c. 38.

1902 c. 8.

1911 c. 6.

1913 c, 27.

1914 c. 47,

1919 c. 51.

1920 c. 41.

1925 c. 86.

1928 c, 43.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

9. Offences under section 12 of the Corn Returns Act 1882 (false
returns).

10. Offences under section 22 of the Electric Lighting Act 1882
(injuring works with intent to cut off electricity supply).

11. Offences under section 3 of the Submarine Telegraph Act 1885
(damaging submarine cables).

12, Offences under section 13 of the Stamp Duties Management
Act 1891 (offences in relation to dies and stamps).

13. Offences under section 8(2) of the Cremation Act 1902 (making
false representations etc. with a view to procuring the burning of any
human remains).

14. All offences under the Perjury Act 1911 except offences under—
(a) section 1 (perjury in judicial proceedings) ;

(b) section 3 (false statements etc. with reference to marriage) ;
(c) section 4 (false statements etc. as to births or deaths).

15. The following offences under the Forgery Act 1913—
(a) offences under paragraph (a) of section 2(2) (forgery of

valuable security etc.) in relation to—
(i) any document being an accountable receipt, release,

or discharge, or any receipt or other instrument evidencing
the payment of money, or the delivery of any chattel

; Or

(ii) any document being an authority or request for the
payment of money or for the delivery or transfer of goods
and chattels, where the amount of money or the value
of the goods or chattels does not exceed £1,000 ;

(b)
offences

under section 4 (forgery of documents in general);
an

(c) offences under paragraph (a) of section 7 (demanding property
on forged documents), where the amount of the money or
the value of the property in respect of which the offence is
committed does not exceed £1,000.

16. Offences under section 17 of the Deeds of Arrangement Act
1914 (trustee making preferential payments).

17. Offences under section 3(4) of the Checkweighing in Various
Industries Act 1919 (false statements).

18. Offences under section 8(2) of the Census Act 1920 (disclosing
census information).

19, Offences under section 36 of the Criminal Justice Act 1925
(forgery of passports etc.).

20. Offences under section 11 of the Agricultural Credits Act 1928
(frauds by farmers).



Criminal Law Act 1977 c. 45 1015

21. Offences under the following provisions of the Coinage Offences Scu. 3
Act 1936— 1936 c. 16,

(a) section 4(1) (defacing coins) ;

(b) section 5(1) (uttering counterfeit coin);
(c) section 5(2) (uttering counterfeit gold or silver coin);
(a) section 5(3) (possession of counterfeit gold or silver coin) ;
(e) section 5(4) (possession of counterfeit copper coin) ;

(f) section 5(6) (uttering coins etc. as gold or silver coins);
(g) section 7 (importing and exporting counterfeit coin) ;
(h) section 8 (making, possessing or selling medals resembling

gold or silver coin).

195%
Offences under the following provisions of the Post Office Act 1953 c. 36,

(a) section 53 (unlawfully taking away or opening mail bag);
(b) section 55 (fraudulent retention of mail bag or postal packet);
(c) section 57 (stealing, embezzlement, destruction etc. by officer

of Post Office of postal packet) ;
(d) section 58 (opening or dela of postal packets by officers

of the Post Office). ving Pa
y

23. Offences under the following provisions of the Sexual Offences 1956 c. 69.
Act 1956—

(a) section 6 (unlawful sexual intercourse with a girl under 16) ;
(b) section 13 (indecency between men);
(c) section 26 (permitting a girl under 16 to use premises for

sexual intercourse).

24. Offences under section 3(1) of the Shipping Contracts and 1964 c. 87.
Commercial Documents Act 1964 (offences), so far as it relates to
the contravention of any direction under that Act.

25. Offences under section 24B(7) of the Housing Subsidies Act 1967c. 29.
1967 (failure to notify lender that residence condition not fulfilled
or ceased to be fulfilled).

26. The following offences under the Criminal Law Act 1967— 1967 c. 58.

(a) offences under section 4(1) (assisting offenders) ; and
(5) offences under section 5(1) (concealing arrestable offences

and giving false information),
where the offence to which they relate is triable either way.

27. Offences under section 4(1) of the Sexual Offences Act 1967 1967 c. 60.
(procuring others to commit homosexual acts).

28. All indictable offences under the Theft Act 1968 except:— 1968 c. 60.

(a) robbery, aggravated burglary, blackmail and assault with
intent to rob ;

(b) burglary comprising the commission of, and intention to
commit, an offence which is triable only on indictment;

(c) burglary in a dwelling if any person in the dwelling was
subjected fo violence or the threat of violence.



1016

Scu. 3
1971 c. 48.

c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

29. Offences under the following provisions of the Criminal
Damage Act 1971—

section 1(1) (destroying or damaging property) ;

section 1(1) and (3) (arson) ;

section 2 (threats to destroy or damage property) ;

section 3 (possessing anything with intent to destroy or damage
property).

30. Offences in relation to stamps issued for the purpose of
national insurance under the provisions of any enactments as applied
to those stamps.

31. Uttering any forged cocument the forgery of which is an
offence listed in this Schedule.

32. Committing an indecent assault upon a person whether male
or female.

33. Aiding, abetting, counselling or procuring the commission of
any offence listed in the preceding paragraphs of this Schedule
except paragraph 26.

34. Attempting to commit an offence triable either way except an
offence mentioned in paragraph 26 or 33 above.

35. Any offence consisting in the incitement to commit an offence
triable either way except an offence mentioned in paragraph 33 or
34 above.



SCHEDULE 4 Section 23

OFFENCES FOR WHICH THE VALUE INVOLVED IS RELEVANT TO THE MODE OF TRIAL

Offence Value involved How measured
1. Offences under section 1 of the As regards property alleged to have been What the property would probably have cost to buy in
Criminal Damage Act 1971* destroyed, its value. the open market at the material time.
(destroying or damaging
property), excluding any offence As regards property alleged to have been (a) If immediately after the material time the damage
committed by destroying or damaged, the value of the alleged damage. was capable of repair—
damaging property by fire. (i) what would probably then have been the

market price for the repair of the damage, or
(ii) what the property alleged to have been

damaged would probably have cost to buy
in the open market at the material time,

whichever is the less; or

(5) if immediately after the material time the damage
was beyond repair, what the said property would
probably have cost to buy in the open market at
the material time.

2.The following offences, namely—- The value indicated in paragraph 1 above As for the corresponding entry in paragraph 1 above.
(a) aiding, abetting, counselling for the offence alleged to have been aided,

or procuring the commis- abetted, counselled or procured, or
sion of any offence men- attempted or incited.
tioned in paragraph 1

above;
(6) attempting to commit any

offence somentioned; and
(c) inciting another to commit

any offence so mentioned.

*1971 c. 48.

LL
6[
PY

M
D
T
po

ut
y

LI
0I



1018 c. 45 Criminal Law Act 1977

Section 28. SCHEDULE 5

ALTERATION OF PENALTIES ON SUMMARY CONVICTION
OF CERTAIN OFFENCES TRIABLE EITHER WAY

1971 c. 38.
folkaw>

The Misuse of Drugs Act 1971 shall be amended as
‘ollows—

(a) in section 26(3) (which makes provision in relation to the
1952 c. 44. penalties for certain offences under the Customs and Excise

Act 1952 where a Class C drug is involved), for the words
from “as if” onwards there shall be substituted “ as if for
the words from ‘ shall be liable’ to ‘ or to both’ there were
substituted the following words, that is to say—

* shall be liable—
(a) on summary conviction, to a penalty of three times

the value of the goods or £500, whichever is the greater,
or to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 3 months,
or to both ;

(b) on conviction on indictment, to a pecuniary penalty
of such amount as the court may determine, or to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding five years, or to
both’,

so however that nothing in this subsection shall be taken
to affect the liability of any person to detention under the
said section 45(1), 56(2) or 304.” ;

(b) in the entries in Schedule 4 showing the punishment that
may be imposed on persons summarily convicted of offences
mentioned in subparagraph (2)(b) below, for “6 months
or £200, or both” there shall be substituted ‘“‘3 months
or £500 or both” ; and

(c) in the entry in Schedule 4 relating to section 5(2)—
(i) for “6 months or £400, or both” (being the maxi-

mum punishment on summary conviction of an offence
under that section where a Class B drug was involved)
there shall be substituted “3 months or £500, or both”;
and
(ii) for “6 months or £200, or both ” (being the maxi-

mum punishment on summary conviction of such an
offence where a Class C drug was involved) there shall
be substituted “3 months or £200, or both”.

(2) The offences to which (as provided in section 28(8) above)
section 28(2) above does not apply are—

(a) offences under section 5(2) of the Misuse of Drugs Act
1971 (having possession of a controlled drug) where the
controlled drug in relation to which the offence was com-
mitted was a Class B or Class C drug;

(b) offences under the following provisions of that Act, where
the controlled drug in relation to which the offence was
committed was a Class C drug, namely—

(i) section 4(2) (production, or being concerned in the
production, of a controlled drug) ;




