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SCHEDULE Section 2.

DESCRIPTION OF LANDS REFERRED TO IN THE FOREGOING ACT

PART I

LAND FOR CARETAKER’S HOUSE

A piece of land of regular shape within Woodgrange Park Cemetery in the London Borough of
Newham extending to 0.017 acres or thereabouts bounded by a line commencing at a point on
the eastern verge of the entrance driveway at the junction with the southern edge of the pathway
at a distance of 30 feet or thereabouts south of the boundary wall to Tenbury Close (hereinafter
referred to as “the first fixed point”) thence proceeding in a generally south-easterly direction
following the verge of the driveway for a distance of 45 feet or thereabouts thence in an easterly
direction for a distance of 16 feet or thereabouts thence in a generally north-westerly direction
following the line of trees for a distance of 45 feet or thereabouts thence in a westerly direction
for a distance of 16 feet or thereabouts to the first fixed point.

PART II

LAND FOR HOUSING OR OTHER DEVELOPMENT

A piece of land of irregular shape within Woodgrange Park Cemetery in the London Borough
of Newham extending to 3.336 acres or thereabouts bounded by a line commencing at a point
(hereinafter referred to as “the second fixed point”) at the northern edge of the back of the
pavement line of a property known as number 457 High Street North proceeding in a northerly
direction along High Street North for a distance of 157 feet or thereabouts thence in a north-
westerly direction for a distance of 147 feet or thereabouts thence proceeding in a south-south-
westerly direction for a distance of 66 feet or thereabouts thence in a north-westerly direction
for a distance of 564 feet or thereabouts thence proceeding in a south-south-easterly direction
for a distance of 328 feet or thereabouts thence proceeding in a north-easterly direction for a
distance of 312 feet or thereabouts thence in a south-south-easterly direction for a distance of 31
feet or thereabouts thence in a south-westerly direction for a distance of 59 feet or thereabouts
thence in a southerly direction for a distance of 111 feet or thereabouts thence proceeding in a
north-easterly direction for a distance of 374 feet or thereabouts to the second fixed point.


