Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK
Statutory Instrument: The Benefit Cap (Annual Limit) (Amendment) Regulations 2023 No. 335

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No.

The Benefit Cap (Annual Limit)
(Amendment) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Welfare Reform Act 2012
2. In section 96(5A) of the Welfare Reform Act 2012 (benefit cap)—
(a) in paragraph (a) for “£23,000 or £15,410” substitute “£25,323 or £16,967”;
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£20,000 or £13,400” substitute “£22,020 or £14,753”.



