
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK
Statutory Instrument: The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) (Amendment) Order 2022 No. 233

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No.

The Immigration and Nationality
(Fees) (Amendment) Order 2022

Amendments to the Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Order 2016

2.—(1)  The Immigration and Nationality (Fees) Order 2016(1) is amended as follows.
(2)  In article 4, in table 1, in the row beginning “1.1”, in the fourth column, for “£95” substitute

“£130”.
(3)  In article 5, in table 2, in the row beginning “2.3”, in the third column, for “£480” substitute

“£490”.

(1) S.I. 2016/177, amended by S.I. 2017/440; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/177
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/440

