
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made
as a UK Statutory Instrument: The Social Security (Contributions) (Rates, Limits and

Thresholds Amendments and National Insurance Funds Payments) Regulations 2020 No. 299

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No.

The Social Security (Contributions) (Rates,
Limits and Thresholds Amendments and National

Insurance Funds Payments) Regulations 2020

PART 2
Rates, limits and thresholds for National Insurance contributions

Amendments to the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001

8. In regulation 11 (prescribed equivalents)—
(a) in paragraph (3) (primary threshold)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£719” substitute “£792”; and
(ii) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£8,632” substitute “£9,500”; and

(b) in paragraph (3A) (secondary threshold)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£719” substitute “£732”; and

(ii) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£8,632” substitute “£8,788”.


