
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a UK Statutory Instrument. This
draft has been replaced by a new draft, The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2012 ISBN 978-0-11-151948-6

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2011 No.

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2011

PART 4
JOBSEEKER’S ALLOWANCE

Increase in age-related amounts of contribution-based Jobseeker’s Allowance

24. In regulation 79(1) of the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations(1) (weekly amounts of
contribution-based jobseeker’s allowance)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£51.85” substitute “£53.45”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£51.85” substitute “£53.45”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£65.45” substitute “£67.50”.

(1) Relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2010/793.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/793

