Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 111

The Social Security (Up-rating) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Scotland) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Best Start Foods Regulations

4.—(1) The Best Start Foods Regulations are amended as follows.
(2) Inregulation 10(1)(1) (kinds of assistance)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£17,005” substitute “£18,725”,

(b) in sub-paragraph (b)(i), for “£7,920” substitute “£8,717”,

(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£328” substitute “£358”,

(d) in sub-paragraph (h), in both places where it occurs for “£660” substitute “£726.
(3) Inregulation 13(2) (value of benefit}—

(a) in paragraph (1), for “£4.50” substitute “£4.95”,

(b) in paragraph (2)(a), for “£9.00” substitute “£9.90”,

(c) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£4.50” substitute “£4.95”,

(d) in paragraph (3), for “£9.00” substitute “£9.90”.

(1) Regulation 10 is relevantly amended by S.S.1. 2022/129 and S.S.1. 2022/336.
(2) Regulation 13 is relevantly amended by S.S.1. 2021/221 and S.S.1. 2022/167.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/129
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/336
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2021/221
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/167

