
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 18

The Local Governance (Scotland) Act 2004
(Remuneration) Amendment Regulations 2021

Amendment of the Local Governance (Scotland) Act 2004 (Remuneration) Regulations 2007

2.—(1)  The Local Governance (Scotland) Act 2004 (Remuneration) Regulations 2007(1) are
amended as follows.

(2)  For the table in regulation 6(2) (remuneration of the Leader of the Council) substitute—

“(a|) Band A – £31,010,

(b) Band B – £37,213,

(c) Band C – £43,412,

(d) Band D – £55,817.”

(3)  For the table in regulation 7(2) (remuneration of the Civic Head) substitute—

“(a|) Band A – £23,257,

(b) Band B – £27,910,

(c) Band C – £32,560

(d) Band D – £41,862.”.

(4)  In regulation 10 (councillors’ remuneration) for “£17,854” substitute “£18,604”.
(5)  In regulation 12 (joint boards)—

(a) in paragraph (8) (payment to conveners) for “£22,320” substitute £23,257”, and
(b) in paragraph (9) (payment to vice-conveners) for “£21,204” substitute “£22,095”.

(1) S.S.I. 2007/183. Relevant amending instruments are S.S.I. 2008/415, S.S.I. 2013/119, S.S.I. 2013/351, S.S.I. 2015/7, S.S.I.
2016/6, S.S.I. 2017/66, S.S.I. 2018/38, S.S.I. 2019/23, and S.S.I. 2020/26.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2007/183
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/415
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/119
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/351
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/66
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2018/38
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2019/23
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2020/26

