
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2021 No. 170

The Social Security (Up-rating) (Miscellaneous
Amendment) (Scotland) Regulations 2021

Amendment of the Best Start Grant Regulations

2.—(1)  The Best Start Grant Regulations are amended as follows.
(2)  In schedule 2—

(a) in paragraph 6(1) (value of pregnancy and baby payment grant)—
(i) in head (a), for “£600” substitute “£606”, and

(ii) in head (b), for “£300” substitute “£303”, and
(b) in paragraph 7(1) (value of multiple pregnancy supplement), for “£300” substitute “£303”.

(3)  In paragraph 4 of schedule 3(1) (value of early learning grant), for “£250” substitute
“£252.50”.

(4)  In paragraph 5 of schedule 4(2) (value of school-age grant), for “£250” substitute “£252.50”.

(1) As relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2019/157.
(2) As relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2019/157.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2019/157
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2019/157

