
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 128

The Education (Miscellaneous Amendments)
(Coronavirus) (Scotland) Regulations 2020

Amendment of the Education (Placing in Schools Etc-Deemed Decisions) (Scotland)
Regulations 1982

2.—(1)  The Education (Placing in Schools Etc-Deemed Decisions) (Scotland) Regulations
1982(1) are amended in accordance with the following paragraphs.

(2)  In regulation 4(1) (deemed decision of education authority)—
(a) for “30th April” in both places where it appears substitute “31st May”,
(b) for “2 months” in both places where it appears substitute “3 months”.

(3)  In regulation 5(1) (deemed decision of appeal committee)—
(a) in subparagraph (a), for “2 months” substitute “4 months”,
(b) in subparagraph (c), for “14 days” substitute “28 days”,
(c) in the full-out, for “2 months” to the end substitute “4 months, 14 days or, as the case may

be, 28 days.”.

(1) S.I. 1982/1733.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1982/1733

