
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2018 No. 186

Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Court of Session,
Sheriff Appeal Court and Sheriff Court) (Amendment) 2018

Citation and commencement, etc.

1.—(1)  This Act of Sederunt may be cited as the Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Court
of Session, Sheriff Appeal Court and Sheriff Court) (Amendment) 2018.

(2)  It comes into force on 24th September 2018.
(3)  A certified copy is to be inserted in the Books of Sederunt.

Amendment of the Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Sheriff Court) (Amendment and
Further Provisions) 1993

2.—(1)  Schedule 1 of the Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Sheriff Court) (Amendment
and Further Provisions) 1993(1) is amended in accordance with this paragraph.

(2)  In paragraph 15 of the General Regulations(2), for “£35” substitute “£37”.
(3)  In the provisions of the Table of Fees which are mentioned in column 1 of schedule 1 of this

Act of Sederunt, for the amounts specified in column 2, substitute the amounts specified in column 3.

Amendment of the Rules of the Court of Session 1994

3.—(1)  Rule 42.16 (table of fees) of the Rules of the Court of Session 1994(3) is amended in
accordance with this paragraph.

(2)  In paragraph (1A)(4), for “£35” substitute “£37”.
(3)  In the provisions of the Table of Fees in paragraph (3) which are mentioned in column 1 of

schedule 2 of this Act of Sederunt, for the amounts specified in column 2, substitute the amounts
specified in column 3.

Amendment of the Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Sheriff Appeal Court) 2015

4.—(1)  The Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Sheriff Appeal Court) 2015(5) is amended
in accordance with this paragraph.

(2)  In the provisions of schedule 1 (detailed fees) mentioned in column 1 of Part 1 of schedule
3 of this Act of Sederunt, for the amounts specified in column 2, substitute the amounts specified
in column 3.

(1) S.I. 1993/3080, last amended by S.S.I. 2017/53.
(2) Paragraph 15 was inserted by S.S.I. 2014/14.
(3) The Rules of the Court of Session 1994 are in schedule 2 of the Act of Sederunt (Rules of the Court of Session 1994) 1994

(S.I. 1994/1443), last amended by S.S.I. 2018/126.
(4) Paragraph (1A) was inserted by S.S.I. 2014/15.
(5) S.S.I. 2015/387, amended by S.S.I. 2016/316.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/3080
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/53
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/1443
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2018/126
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2014/15
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/387
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/316


Document Generated: 2024-02-29
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(3)  In the provisions of schedule 2 (inclusive fees) mentioned in column 1 of Part 2 of schedule
3 of this Act of Sederunt, for the amounts specified in column 2, substitute the amounts specified
in column 3.

Saving

5. Paragraphs 2, 3 and 4 have no effect as regards fees payable in respect of work carried out
before 24th September 2018.

Edinburgh
6th June 2018

CJM SUTHERLAND
Lord President

I.P.D.

2


