
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No. 105

The Budget (Scotland) Act 2011 Amendment Order 2012

Amendment of section 3 of the 2011 Act

2. In section 3 (overall cash authorisations) of the 2011 Act—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£30,704,780,000” substitute “£30,737,019,000”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£65,900,000” substitute “£61,955,000”;
(c) in paragraph (c), for “£10,800,000” substitute “£9,980,000”; and
(d) in paragraph (d), for “£75,293,000” substitute “£75,461,000”.


