
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 49

The Advice and Assistance and Civil Legal Aid
(Priority of Debts) (Scotland) Regulations 2009

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Advice and Assistance and Civil Legal Aid (Priority of
Debts) (Scotland) Regulations 2009 and come into force on 7th April 2009.

Application

2.—(1)  Regulation 3 applies only in relation to any case where an application for advice and
assistance is made on or after 7th April 2009.

(2)  Regulation 4 applies only in relation to any case where an application for civil legal is made
on or after 7th April 2009.

Amendment of the Advice and Assistance (Scotland) Regulations 1996

3. In regulation 16(2)(b) of the Advice and Assistance (Scotland) Regulations 1996(1), for
“£5,009” substitute “£5,259”(2).

Amendment of the Civil Legal Aid (Scotland) Regulations 2002

4. In regulation 33(b) of the Civil Legal Aid (Scotland) Regulations 2002(3), for “£5,009”
substitute “£5,259”(4).

Revocations

5. Except in relation to a case where the application for advice and assistance is made before 7th
April 2009, the Regulations specified in Part 1 of the Schedule are revoked to the extent specified
in the corresponding entry in the third column of that Part.

6. Except in relation to a case where the application for civil legal aid is made before 7th April
2009, the Regulations specified in Part 2 of the Schedule are revoked to the extent specified in the
corresponding entry in the third column of that Part.

(1) S.I.1996/2447; regulation 16(2) was amended, other than by way of an increase to the specified figure, by S.S.I. 2002/495.
(2) The previous figure in regulation 16(2)(b) of the Advice and Assistance (Scotland) Regulations 1996 was inserted by S.S.I.

2008/47.
(3) S.S.I. 2002/494; regulation 33(b) has not been amended other than by way of increases to the specified figure.
(4) The previous figure in regulation 33(b) of the Civil Legal Aid (Scotland) Regulations 2002 was inserted by S.S.I. 2008/48.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/2447
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/495
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/47
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/47
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/494
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/48


Document Generated: 2023-07-19
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

St Andrew’s House,
Edinburgh
12th February 2009

KENNY MACASKILL
A member of the Scottish Executive

2


