
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 137

The Plant Health (Export Certification)
(Scotland) Amendment Order 2007

Amendment of schedule

6.—(1)  In paragraph 4(a)–
(a) in column 1 (service) omit paragraph (i);
(b) in column 2 (fee) omit the figure of £1.00; and
(c) in paragraph (ii) in column 1 (service) for “£10.00” substitute “£1.00”.

(2)  In paragraph 5–
(a) in column 1 (service) after “plant products” insert “other than seeds”;
(b) (i) in column 1 (service) omit sub-paragraph (a); and

(ii) in column 2 (fee) omit the figure of £1.00; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (b) in column 1 (service) for “£10.00” substitute “£1.00”.

(3)  in paragraph 6–
(a) in column 1 (service) after “plant products” insert “other than seeds”;
(b) (i) in column 1 (service) omit sub-paragraph (a); and

(ii) in column 2 (fee) omit the figure of £1.00.
(c) in sub-paragraph (b) in column 1 (service) for “£10.00” substitute “£1.00”.

(4)  after paragraph 8 insert–

“8A. For any second or subsequent
certificate issued under paragraph 8 when
an inspection is carried out at the same
location on the same day.

11.00”.

(5)  For paragraph 11(c) in column 1 (service) and the corresponding figures from “£165.00” to
“£3.00” in column 2 (fee) substitute–

“(c)   for potato viruses

(i) (aa) growing on test (200 tubers
tested for 2 viruses)

220.00

(bb) growing on test (each additional 50
tubers or part thereof tested for 2
viruses)

55.00

(cc) testing for additional viruses (200
tubers) (per virus)

10.00



Document Generated: 2023-07-12
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(dd) testing for additional viruses (each
additional 50 tubers or part thereof)
(per virus)

2.50

(ii) (aa) direct tuber test (200 tubers
tested for 2 viruses)

260.00

(bb) direct tuber test (each additional 50
tubers or part thereof) (per virus)

65.00

(cc) testing for additional viruses (200
tubers) (per virus)

20.00

(dd) testing for additional viruses (each
additional 50 tubers or part thereof)
(per virus)

5.00

(iii) (aa) leaf sample test (100 leaves
tested for 4 viruses)

45.00

(bb) leaf sample test (each additional 50
leaves or part thereof tested for 4
viruses)

22.50

(cc) testing for additional viruses (100
leaves) (per virus)

3.00

(dd) testing for additional viruses (each
additional 50 leaves or part thereof)
(per virus)

1.50.”.

(6)  For paragraphs 14, 15 and 16 in column 1 (service) and the corresponding figures from
“£20.00” to “£30.00” in column 2 (fee) substitute–

“14. Consideration of an application
(including certificate processing, growing
crop inspection and pre-export seed testing
work) for a phytosanitary certificate in
respect of seed samples (for one hour or
any part thereof).

69.00”.

(7)  For paragraph 17 in column 1(service) and the corresponding figure £5.00 in column 2 (fee)
substitute–

“15. Issue of a phytosanitary certificate
for re-export or a duplicate phytosanitary
certificate or phytosanitary certificate for
re-export where the original has been lost,
stolen, destroyed or materially damaged).

5.00”.

2


