
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 314

EDUCATION

The Student Loans (Information Requests, Maximum
Threshold, Maximum Repayment Levels and
Hardship Loans) (Scotland) Regulations 2005

Made       -      -      -      - 8th June 2005
Laid before the Scottish
Parliament       -      - 8th June 2005

Coming into force 30th June 2005

THE STUDENT LOANS (INFORMATION REQUESTS, MAXIMUM
THRESHOLD, MAXIMUM REPAYMENT LEVELS AND
HARDSHIP LOANS) (SCOTLAND) REGULATIONS 2005

1. Citation and commencement  
2. Amendment of the Repayment of Student Loans (Scotland) Regulations

2000
 

3. After regulation 11 insert– Information requests A borrower shall, within
six weeks of the event, inform...

 

4. (1) For “£10,000” substitute “£15,000” in– (a) paragraph 9(4); and...  
5. In paragraph 13(1), for “£246” substitute “£208”.  
6. Amendment of the Education (Student Loans) (Scotland) Regulations 2000  

  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


