
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory
Instrument: The Social Security (Up-rating) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Scotland) Regulations 2024 No. 105

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No.

The Social Security (Up-rating) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Scotland) Regulations 2024

Amendment of the Carer Support Payment Regulations

7.—(1)  The Carer Support Payment Regulations are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 14(1) (earnings limit), for “£139” substitute “£151”.
(3)  In regulation 16(1) (amount and form of Carer Support Payment), for “£76.75” substitute

“£81.90”.


