
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory Instrument:
The Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Miscellaneous Amendment) (Scotland) (No. 2) Regulations 2023 No. 135

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No.

The Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Miscellaneous
Amendment) (Scotland) (No. 2) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Advice and Assistance (Financial Limit) (Scotland) Regulations 1993

6. Regulation 3 (financial limit) of the Advice and Assistance (Financial Limit) (Scotland)
Regulations 1993(1) is amended as follows—

(a) in paragraph (b)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (i), for “£120” substitute “£135”,

(ii) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “£45” substitute “£50”,
(b) in paragraph (c)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (i) and (ii), for “£105” substitute “£115”,
(ii) in sub-paragraph (iii), for “£45” substitute “£50”,

(iii) in sub-paragraph (iv)—
(aa) omit “a stipendiary magistrate, or”,
(bb) for “£705” substitute “£750”,

(iv) in sub-paragraph (v)—
(aa) omit “(other than before a stipendiary magistrate)”,
(bb) for “£330” substitute “£500”,

(v) in sub-paragraph (vi) and (vii), for “£195” substitute “£215”,
(vi) in sub-paragraph (viii), for “£265” substitute “£290”,

(vii) in sub-paragraph (ix), for “£185” substitute “£215”,
(viii) in sub-paragraph (x) and (xv), for “£225.00” substitute “£250”,

(ix) in sub-paragraph (xi), for “£550” substitute “£600”,
(x) in sub-paragraph (xii), (xiii) and (xiv), for “£350” substitute “£385”,

(xi) in sub-paragraph (xv), for “£550.00” substitute “£600”.

(1) S.I. 1993/3187; relevant amending instruments are S.S.I. 2007/248, S.S.I. 2017/466 and S.S.I. 2022/116.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/3187
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2007/248
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2017/466
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/116

