
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory Instrument:
The Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Miscellaneous Amendment) (Scotland) (No. 2) Regulations 2023 No. 135

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No.

The Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Miscellaneous
Amendment) (Scotland) (No. 2) Regulations 2023

Legal aid in contempt of court proceedings

5. Schedule 1 (table of fees allowable to solicitors for legal aid made available under section 30
of the Legal Aid (Scotland) Act 1986 in connection with proceedings for contempt of court) of the
Legal Aid in Contempt of Court Proceedings (Scotland) (Fees) Regulations 1992(1) is amended as
follows—

(a) in paragraph 1(a), for “£31.14” substitute “£34.32”,
(b) in paragraph 1(b), for “£15.58” substitute “£17.17”,
(c) in paragraph 2(a), for “£12.00” substitute “£13.23”,
(d) in paragraph 2(b), for “£5.98” substitute “£6.59”,
(e) in paragraph 3, for “£6.82” substitute “£7.52”,
(f) in paragraph 4, for “£2.75” substitute “£3.04”,
(g) in paragraph 4A(a)(2), for “£6.01” substitute “£6.63”,
(h) in paragraph 4A(b), for “£3.00” substitute “£3.31”.

(1) S.I. 1992/1228; relevant amending instruments are S.S.I. 2013/250 and S.S.I. 2022/30. Figures in paragraphs 1 to 4A were
substituted by S.S.I. 2022/30.

(2) Paragraph 4A was inserted by S.S.I. 2011/41 and amended by S.S.I. 2022/30.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1228
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2013/250
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/30
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/30
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2011/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/30

