
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a
Scottish Statutory Instrument: The Social Security Up-rating (Scotland) Order 2023 No. 110

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No.

The Social Security Up-rating (Scotland) Order 2023

Rate of disability living allowance

8. In regulation 4 (rate of benefit) of the Social Security (Disability Living Allowance)
Regulations 1991(1)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£92.40” substitute “£101.75”,
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£61.85” substitute “£68.10”,
(c) in paragraph (1)(c), for “£24.45” substitute “£26.90”,
(d) in paragraph (2)(a), for “£64.50” substitute “£71.00”,
(e) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£24.45” substitute “£26.90”.

(1) S.I. 1991/2890. Regulation 4 is relevantly amended by S.I. 1993/1939 and S.S.I. 2022/128.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2890
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/1939
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/128

