
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory
Instrument: The Social Security (Up-rating) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Scotland) Regulations 2023 No. 111

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No.

The Social Security (Up-rating) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Scotland) Regulations 2023

Amendment of the Funeral Support Payment Regulations

10.—(1)  The Funeral Support Payment Regulations are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 13(1) (amount of funeral expense assistance)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£1,070.60” substitute “£1,178.75”,
(b) in paragraph (4)(b), for “£21.55” substitute “£23.75”,
(c) in paragraph (6), for “£130.65” substitute “£143.85”.

(1) Regulation 13 is relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2020/99 and S.S.I. 2022/129.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2020/99
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/129

