Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a
Scottish Statutory Instrument: The Social Security Up-rating (Scotland) Order 2022 No. 128

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No.

The Social Security Up-rating (Scotland) Order 2022

Rate of personal independence payment

9. Inregulation 24 of the Social Security (Personal Independence Payment) Regulations 2013(1)
(rate of personal independence payment)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£60.00” substitute “£61.85”,
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£89.60” substitute “£92.40”,
(c) in paragraph (2)(a), for “£23.70” substitute “£24.45”, and
(d) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£62.55” substitute “£64.50”.

(1) S.1.2013/377. Regulation 24 was relevantly amended by S.S.I. 2021/169.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/377
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2021/169

