
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory Instrument:
The Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Financial Limit) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022 No. 116

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No.

The Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Financial
Limit) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2022

Amendments to the Criminal Legal Aid (Scotland) (Fees) Regulations 1989

2. In regulation 6 (duty solicitors’ fees) of the Criminal Legal Aid (Scotland) (Fees) Regulations
1989(1)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£140” substitute “£165”,
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£93” substitute “£115”, and
(c) in paragraph (2), for “£150” substitute “£250”.

(1) S.I. 1989/1491. Relevant amending instruments are S.S.I. 2008/240 and S.S.I. 2021/56.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1989/1491
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2008/240
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2021/56

