
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory Instrument:
The Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2020 (revoked) No. 83

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No.

The Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing
Care) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2020

Amendment of the Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland)
Regulations 2002

2.—(1)  The Community Care (Personal Care and Nursing Care) (Scotland) Regulations 2002(1)
are amended as follows.

(2)  In regulation 2 (accommodation provided under the Social Work (Scotland) Act 1968 or
section 25 (care and support services etc.) of the Mental Health (Care and Treatment) (Scotland)
Act 2003)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£177” substitute “£180”, and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£80” substitute “£81”.

(1) S.S.I. 2002/303; relevant amending instruments are S.S.I. 2005/445, S.S.I. 2018/200 and S.S.I. 2019/82.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2002/303
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2005/445
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2018/200
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2019/82

