
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish Statutory
Instrument: The Sheriff Court Simple Procedure (Limits on Award of Expenses) Amendment Order 2019 No. 79

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No.

The Sheriff Court Simple Procedure (Limits on
Award of Expenses) Amendment Order 2019

Amendment of the Sheriff Court Simple Procedure (Limits on Award of Expenses) Order
2016

2.—(1)  The Sheriff Court Simple Procedure (Limits on Award of Expenses) Order 2016(1) is
amended in accordance with paragraphs (2) and (3).

(2)  In article 2 (category of simple procedure cases in which no award of expenses may be made)
for “£200” substitute “£300”.

(3)  In article 3 (categories of simple procedure cases in which expenses awarded may not exceed
prescribed sum) for “£200” substitute “£300”.

(1) )S.S.I. 2016/388.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2016/388

