
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a Scottish Statutory Instrument. This draft
has been replaced by a new draft, The Budget (Scotland) Acts 2007 and 2008 Amendment Order 2009 ISBN 978-0-11-100239-1

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No.

The Budget (Scotland) Acts 2007
and 2008 Amendment Order 2009

Amendment of schedule 3 to the 2008 Act

8.—(1)  Schedule 3 to the 2008 Act (direct funded bodies) is amended in accordance with
paragraphs (2) and (3).

(2)  In column 2 (amount of resources other than accruing resources)–
(a) in relation to the first purpose, for “£90,300,000” substitute “£89,335,000”;
(b) in relation to the second purpose, for “£10,600,000” substitute “£10,500,000”; and
(c) in relation to the third purpose, for “£101,009,000” substitute “£99,509,000”.

(3)  In column 3 (amount of accruing resources), in relation to the first purpose, for “£500,000”
substitute “£12,000,000.”


