
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2020 No. 326

The Health Protection (Coronavirus, International Travel)
(Amendment No. 25) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020

Amendments to regulation 4

4. In regulation 4 (requirement to self isolate)—
(a) in paragraph (1)(b) for “14th day” substitute “10th day”;
(b) in paragraph (7)(a) for “14th day” substitute “10th day”;
(c) in paragraph (12)(ca)(i)—

(i) after “where P is” insert “a new domestic elite sportsperson,”;
(ii) after “conditions specified in paragraph 39(4)” insert “(za),”;

(d) after paragraph (12)(cc) insert—
“(cd)   in paragraph 42 of Schedule 2, paragraph (2) does not—

(i) prevent P from travelling between the place where P is self-isolating and any
place where P’s presence is required for the purposes of work as a journalist,
or

(ii) require P to remain in isolation from any other person with whom P
reasonably needs to meet in person for the purposes of work as a journalist,”.


