Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2013 No. 18

The County Courts (Financial Limits)
Order (Northern Ireland) 2013

Increase of financial limits of civil jurisdiction of county courts
2. The County Courts (Northern Ireland) Order 1980 shall be amended as follows:—
(a) In Article 10(1) (general civil jurisdiction) for “£15,000” substitute “£30,000”; and

(b) In Article 30(1) (general civil jurisdiction exercisable by District Judges) for “£5,000”
substitute “£10,000”.



