
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2011 No. 115

The Supervision and Treatment Orders
(Maximum Period) Order (Northern Ireland) 2011

Amendment to the Mental Health (Northern Ireland) Order 1986

2.—(1)  Schedule 2A to the Mental Health (Northern Ireland) Order 1986 (supervision and
treatment orders) is amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph 1(1)(a) for “2 years” substitute “3 years”.
(3)  In paragraph 8(2) for “2 years” substitute “3 years”.


