
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1998 No. 139

The Residential Care Homes (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1998

Amendment of Schedule 3 to the principal regulations

3. In Schedule 3 (Annual fees) to the principal regulations—
(a) in paragraph 1 for “£41” there shall be substituted “£46”; and
(b) in paragraph 2 for “£30” there shall be substituted “£34”.


