Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1996 No. 73

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 1996

Part II

Social Security Benefits and Pensions

Increase in rates of disability living allowance

12. In regulation 4 of the Social Security (Disability Living Allowance) Regulations (Northern
Ireland) 1992(1) (rate of benefit)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£46-70” there shall be substituted “£48-50”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£31:20” there shall be substituted “£32-40”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(c) for “£12-40” there shall be substituted “£12-90”;
(d) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£32-65” there shall be substituted “£33-90’; and
(e) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£12-40” there shall be substituted “£12:90”.

(1) S.R. 1992 No. 32; relevant amending provisions are S.R. 1993 No. 340 and S.R. 1995 No. 71


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1992/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1993/340
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1995/71

