No. 274 Supplémentary- Benefits ‘1259
' 1979 - No. 274
SUPPLEMENTARY BENEFITS

The Supplementary Benefit (Determmatlon of Reqmremeuts) Regulations
(Northem Ireland) 1979

Made . . . . -~ . Srd August 1979
Commg into operation . . . 12th November 1979

The Department of Health and Social Services; in exercise of the powers
conferred on it by Arficle 4(2) and (3) of the. Supplementary Benefits (Northern
Ireland) Order 1977(a), and of all other powers enabling it in that behalf, with
the consent of the Department of Finance, hereby makes the following
regulanons R . . .

Ci ztat ion and commencement

* 1. These regulations - may be c1ted ‘as the Supplementary Benefit
(Determmatxon of Requiremeiits)” ‘Reégulations (Northerh Ireland) 1979 and
'shall come into operation on 12th November 1979: - R

Amendment of provzszons for calculatmg requzrements

"2—(1) Schedule'1 to'the Supplementary Benefits (Northérn Ireland) Order
1977 (provisions for determining right to and amount of supplementary
benefits) shall be varied in accordance with the following prov1s1ons '

. (2) For paragraph 7 (normal requirements) and paragraph 8 (blmd persons)
there shall be substitutéd the following paragraphs—- . -

“7. Requirements of persons, other than blind per,sous—-—~ '

(@) husband and wife or other persons fallmg T

.. within paragraph 3(1) . VAL 29470,
- B '.>. . 37‘65
C...3790
(b) person hvmg ‘alonéror householder not falling within -
sub- paragraph (@) who is directly responsiblé for house-
hold necessmesh and rent (if any) . . +A..1830
s ‘ B...:2370
C...2395
(c) any, other person aged——— . ) o
(i) not less than I8 years -7 ; A 1465
e . . B..1895
Lo o Cul 1920
(ii) less than 18 but not less than 16 years . . . 11-25
(iif) less:than 16 but not less than 13 years . . . ~ 9:35
" (iv) Tess*than 13 but not less than 11 years. . . ; 770
" (v) less than 11 but not less than § years . . . 625

(vi) less than 5 years . . .. . . . . 520

(a) S.I 197772156 (N.L 27)



1260 Supplementary Benefits ‘No. 274

8. Requirements of persons who are or include blind persons—
(@) husband and wife or other persons falling within paragraph 3(1)—

£

(i) if one of them is blind AL, 3095

: ‘ B...3890

7 C...3915
() if both of them are blind LA L3175
B B...3970
C... 3995

(b) any other blind person aged—

- (D) not less than 18 years VA L1955
B ... 2495

C...2520

_ (i) less than 18 but not less than 16 years . . . 12:15
(iii) less than 16 but not less than 13 years . - 935
(iv) less than 13 but not less than 11 years . 7-70
. (v) less than 11 but not less than 5 years .. .. . 625
(v1) lIess than 5 years . . . . . . . 5-20”

(3) In paragraph 10 (attendance requirements)—
(@ m sub-paragraph (1)(a), for “£15 60" there shall be substltuted
“£18-60”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (1)(b) for “£10- 40” there shall be - substituted
) “£12-4
‘ (4) In paragraph 11 (rent) in sub- paragraph (1)(b) for “£1- 45” there shall
be substituted “£1-70”,

Revocatzon

3. The Supplementary Benefit (Determmauon of Requirements) Regula-
txons (Northern Ireland) 1978(b) are hereby revoked.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health and Social
Se_rvices for Northern Ireland on 3rd August 1979.

L (ms) W. 1. Sloane
‘ ' Senior Assistant Secretary
. The Department of Finance hereby consénts to the f.o'reg:oing' regulations.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance for Northern
Treland on 3rd August 1979.

(L.s.) . ' R. McMurray _
. . Assistant Secretary

‘(b) S.R. 1978 No. 204 (I, p. 659)



No. 274 Supplementary Benefits 1261
EXPLANATORY NOTE

(Thzs note is not part of the regulations but is intended to indicate
their general purport.)

These .regulations pfbVide ‘for i‘ncreases in the weekly sums allowed in
calculating' requiterénts for the purpose of determining entitlement to, and
the amount of, supplementary pension or allowance. They also increase the
present weekly amount for attendance requirements and the rent addition for
non-householdess, . :«

.. The opportunity is taken to revoke the Supplementary Benefit (Determina-
tion of Reqmrements) Regula‘uons (Northem Ireland) 1978



	0001
	0002
	0003



