
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

2015 CHAPTER 6

Extension of period for which acting Ombudsman and acting Commissioner
may hold office

1.—(1)  In Article 6(2)(a) of the Ombudsman (Northern Ireland) Order
1996 (maximum period for which acting Ombudsman may hold office) for “12
months” substitute “24 months”.

(2)  In Article 5(2)(a) of the Commissioner for Complaints (Northern Ireland)
Order 1996 (maximum period for which acting Commissioner may hold office)
for “12 months” substitute “24 months”.

1


