
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Ombudsman and 
Commissioner for 

Complaints 
(Amendment) Act 

(Northern Ireland) 2015 

CHAPTER   6 

£4.25





Ombudsman and Commissioner for 
Complaints (Amendment) Act 

(Northern Ireland) 2015
CHAPTER 6

CONTENTS
1. Extension  of  period  for  which  acting  Ombudsman  and  acting 

Commissioner may hold office
2. Retrospective operation of section 1
3. Commencement and short title





c. 6    ELIZABETH II

Ombudsman and Commissioner for 
Complaints (Amendment) Act 

(Northern Ireland) 2015
2015 CHAPTER 6

An Act to extend the maximum period for which an acting Assembly Ombudsman 
for Northern Ireland and an acting Northern Ireland Commissioner for Complaints 
may hold office. [20th July 2015]

E IT ENACTED by being passed by the Northern Ireland Assembly and 
assented to by Her Majesty as follows:B

Extension of period for which acting Ombudsman and acting Commissioner 
may hold office

1.—(1) In  Article  6(2)(a)  of the Ombudsman (Northern Ireland) Order 1996 
(maximum period for which acting Ombudsman may hold office) for “12 months” 
substitute “24 months”.

(2) In Article 5(2)(a) of the Commissioner for Complaints (Northern Ireland) 
Order 1996 (maximum period for which acting Commissioner may hold office) for 
“12 months” substitute “24 months”.

Retrospective operation of section 1
2. The amendments made by section 1 are to be regarded as having come into 

operation on 30 August 2014.

Commencement and short title
3.—(1) This Act comes into operation on the day after it receives Royal Assent.
(2) This Act may be cited as the Ombudsman and Commissioner for Complaints 

(Amendment) Act (Northern Ireland) 2015.

1



c. 6 Ombudsman and Commissioner for Complaints (Amendment) 
                                          Act (Northern Ireland) 2015

© Crown copyright 2015

Printed and published in the UK by the Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of 
Carol Tullo, Controller of Her Majesty's Stationery Office, being the Government Printer for Northern Ireland 
and the officer appointed to print the Acts of the Northern Ireland Assembly

2





Published by TSO (The Stationery Office) and available from:

Online
www.tsoshop.co.uk

Mail, Telephone, Fax & E-mail
TSO, PO Box 29, Norwich, NR3 1GN
Telephone orders/General enquiries 0333 202 5070
Fax orders: 0333 202 5080
Email: customer.services@tso.co.uk
Textphone: 0333 202 5077

TSO@Blackwell and other Accredited Agents


