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Planning Act (Northern Ireland) 2011

EXPLANATORY NOTES

COMMENTARY ON SECTIONS

Part 14: Miscellaneous and General Provisions

Section 232: Inquiries to be held in public subject to certain exceptions

Given the changes in the role of the Secretary of State and the new role of
the Department of Justice, following devolution of policing and justice powers,
these provisions clarify the responsibilities of the Secretary of State and the
Department of Justice in relation to inquiries.   The provisions deal with
procedures for planning applications, etc, where, in the opinion of the Secretary
of State/the Department of Justice, the consideration by a council or Department
of objections or representations received in relation to the application raise issues
of national security or the security of Crown or other premises and that the
disclosure of related information would be contrary to the national or public
interest.

The Secretary of State will have responsibility for issuing a relevant direction
under section 232 in instances where the giving of evidence of a particular
description or the making it available for inspection would be likely to result in
the disclosure of information relating to:

(a) national security; or

(b) the measures taken or to be taken to ensure the security of any premises or
property belonging to Her Majesty in right of the Crown or belonging to a
government department or held in trust for Her Majesty for the purposes of a
government department; or

(c) measures taken or to be taken to ensure the security of any premises or property
which is used for the purposes of the armed forces of the Crown or the Ministry
of Defence Police.

The provisions also set out that the Department of Justice will have
responsibility for issuing the relevant direction under section 232 in instances
where the giving of evidence of a particular description or the making it available
for inspection would be likely to result in the disclosure of information (contrary
to the public interest) relating to the measures to be taken to ensure the security
of any premises or property other than premises or property mentioned above.
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