
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Welfare Reform
Act (Northern Ireland) 2010, Cross Heading: Pilot scheme. (See end of Document for details)

2010 CHAPTER 13

PART 1
SOCIAL SECURITY

Pilot scheme

Period for which pilot schemes have effect etc.

22.—(1)  In Article 31 of the Jobseekers Order (pilot schemes)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “12 months” substitute “ 36 months ”, and
(b) in paragraph (8), for the words from “facilitate” to the end substitute “

make it more likely that persons will obtain or remain in work or be able
to do so ”.

(2)  In section 19(1) of the Welfare Reform Act (pilot schemes), for “24
months” substitute “ 36 months ”.

1



Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Welfare Reform Act (Northern
Ireland) 2010, Cross Heading: Pilot scheme.


