
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

London Local Authorities Act 2004
2004 CHAPTER i

PART 1

PRELIMINARY

1 Citation and commencement

(1) This Act may be cited as the London Local Authorities Act 2004 and shall come into
operation at the end of the period of two months beginning with the date on which
it is passed.

(2) This Act and the London Local Authorities Acts 1990 to 2003 may be cited together
as the London Local Authorities Acts 1990 to 2004.

2 Interpretation

In this Act—
“the 1978 Act” means the Refuse Disposal (Amenity) Act 1978 (c. 3);
“borough council” means London borough council and includes the

Common Council of the City of London in its capacity as a local authority and
“borough” and “council” shall be construed accordingly;

“operational land” has the same meaning as in the Town and Country
Planning Act 1990 (c. 8).

PART 2

ABANDONED VEHICLES

3 Disposal of vehicles

(1) Section 4 (Disposal of removed vehicles) of the 1978 Act shall have effect in the area
of a borough council in accordance with this section.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1978/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/8


2 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 2 – Abandoned vehicles

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(2) For subsection (1) there are substituted the following subsections—

“(1) Subject to subsections (5) and (6) below, a local authority may, in such manner
as they think fit, dispose of any vehicle which is in their custody in pursuance
of section 3 above—

(a) in the case of a vehicle—
(i) on which no licence is displayed;

(ii) to which no G.B. or N.I. registration mark is fixed;
(iii) to which an illegible registration mark is fixed; or
(iv) in respect of which there is no registered keeper,

at any time after its removal;
(b) in the case of a vehicle on which a licence is displayed and to which

paragraph (a)(ii), (iii) and (iv) above does not apply, at any time after
the expiry of the period of 28 days beginning with the date on which
the licence expires;

(c) in any other case, at any time after the local authority has, for the
purpose of ascertaining the owner of the vehicle, taken such of the
steps specified in subsection (1B) below as are applicable to the
vehicle and either—

(i) the authority have failed to ascertain the name and address of
the owner; or

(ii) the owner has failed to comply with a notice under
subsection (1A) below served on him by post.

(1A) A notice under subsection (1)(b) above shall be a notice addressed to the
owner of the vehicle which—

(a) states—
(i) the registration mark and make of the vehicle;

(ii) the place where the vehicle was found before it was removed;
(iii) the place to which the vehicle has been removed;
(iv) that unless the vehicle is removed by the owner on or

before the date specified under paragraph (b) below, the local
authority intends to dispose of it; and

(b) requires the owner to remove the vehicle from the custody of the local
authority within 7 days of the date on which the notice was served.

(1B) The steps to be taken by a local authority before serving a notice under
subsection (1)(b) are—

(a) if the vehicle carries a G.B. or N.I. registration mark, the local
authority shall ascertain from the G.B. or, as the case may be, the N.I.
records the name and address of the registered keeper;

(b) if the vehicle does not carry such a registration mark, the local
authority shall make such inquiries as appear to them to be practicable
to ascertain the identity of the owner of the vehicle.”.

(3) Subsection (2) is omitted.

(4) After subsection (7), the following subsection is inserted—

“(7A) The Secretary of State may by regulations alter the period of notice provided
under subsection (1A)(b) above.”.



London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 2 – Abandoned vehicles
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

3

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(5) In subsection (8) at the end the following definitions are inserted—

““G.B. records” means the records kept under the Vehicle Excise and
Registration Act 1994 (c. 22) by the Driver and Vehicle Licensing Agency
on behalf of the Secretary of State and “G.B. registration mark” means a
registration mark assigned to a vehicle registered in those records;

“N.I. records” means the records kept under that Act by Driver and
Vehicle Licensing Northern Ireland on behalf of the Secretary of State and
“N.I. registration mark” means a registration mark assigned to a vehicle
registered in those records;

“registered keeper” in respect of a vehicle means the person in whose name
the vehicle is registered in G.B. or N.I. records;”.

(6) At the end, the following subsection is inserted—

“(9) References in this section to such sums in respect of the removal, storage or
disposal of a vehicle as may be prescribed shall be sums of the same level as
the level of charges set by London authorities for the removal, storage and
disposal of vehicles under section 74 (Fixing of certain parking and other
charges for London) of the Road Traffic Act 1991 (c. 40).”.

4 Recovery of expenses connected with removed vehicles

Section 5 (Recovery of expenses connected with removed vehicles) of the 1978 Act
shall have effect in the area of a borough council as if—

(a) for paragraphs (a) to (c) of subsection (1) there were substituted “charges in
respect of the removal, storage and disposal of the vehicle”; and

(b) after that subsection there were inserted—

“(1A) The level of charges made by the appropriate authority for the
removal, storage and disposal of vehicles under this section shall be
the same as the level of charges set by London authorities for the
removal, storage and disposal of vehicles under section 74 (Fixing
of certain parking and other charges for London) of the Road Traffic
Act 1991.”.

5 Meaning of “owner” under the 1978 Act

(1) Section 11 (Interpretation) of the 1978 Act shall have effect in the area of a borough
council as if after subsection (2) the following subsection were inserted—

“(2A) References in this Part of this Act to the “owner” of a vehicle at a particular
time are to the person by whom it was then kept and the registered keeper at
a particular time shall be taken, unless the contrary is shown, to be the person
by whom the vehicle was kept at that time.”.

(2) In section 11 of the 1978 Act the definition of “owner” shall cease to have effect in
the area of a borough council.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/40


4 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 2 – Abandoned vehicles

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

6 Powers of entry

(1) This section applies where a vehicle is to be or has been removed from a road by a
borough council under section 3 (Removal of abandoned vehicles) of the 1978 Act.

(2) An authorised officer may, at any time before the vehicle is lawfully removed from
the custody of the council or is disposed of by the council under section 4 (Disposal
of abandoned vehicles) of the 1978 Act, enter the vehicle for the purpose of—

(a) removing anything from it in the interests of the safety of persons or property;
or

(b) preventing damage to or loss of the vehicle or any of its contents.

(3) Subject to subsections (4) and (5) below, the council shall retain and keep safe anything
removed under subsection (2) above and shall deliver it to any person claiming it who
satisfies the council that he is the owner of it or of the vehicle in question.

(4) The council may, in such manner as they think fit and at any time, dispose of any
perishable item removed under subsection (2) above.

(5) Where the vehicle from which anything is removed under subsection (2) above is
disposed of under the said section 4 the council may—

(a) no sooner than the date on which the period of 14 days beginning with the
date on which the vehicle was removed expires; and

(b) in any manner they think fit,
dispose of the thing removed if it has not been claimed by any person who satisfies
the council that he is its owner.

(6) If any person, no later than the date on which the period of five months beginning
with the date on which the vehicle was removed expires satisfies the council that they
were, at the time the vehicle was removed, the owner of anything disposed of under
subsection (4) or (5) above, the council shall pay to that person the proceeds (if any)
obtained on the disposal of the thing.

7 Disclosure of information

(1) Any person who, apart from this section, would not have power to disclose information
obtained in identifying the owner of a vehicle under section 4 (Disposal of abandoned
vehicles) of the 1978 Act (in the application of that section in the area of a borough
council) to—

(a) a borough council;
(b) Transport for London; or
(c) a person acting on behalf of a borough council or Transport for London,

shall have power to do so in any case where the disclosure is necessary for the purposes
of enforcing any provision of the enactments specified in subsection (2) below.

(2) The enactments are—
(a) sections 3 to 5 (Abandoned vehicles) of the 1978 Act;
(b) Part II (Traffic in London) of the Road Traffic Act 1991 (c. 40);
(c) Part II (Bus lanes) of the London Local Authorities Act 1996 (c. ix); and
(d) sections 4 (Penalty charges for road traffic contraventions) and 5

(Contraventions of lorry ban order: supplementary) of the London Local
Authorities and Transport for London Act 2003 (c. iii).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/40
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1996/9
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/2003/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/2003/3


London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 3 – Public health and the environment
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

5

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

8 Transitional provision

If, before this Part of this Act comes into force, a vehicle has been removed under
section 3 (Removal of abandoned vehicles) of the 1978 Act, the vehicle shall be dealt
with under that Act as if this Act had not come into force.

PART 3

PUBLIC HEALTH AND THE ENVIRONMENT

9 Nuisance from birds

(1) If in the opinion of a borough council the habitual nesting, roosting or alighting of birds
on any part of a building or structure (including a bridge) fronting upon, crossing or
overhanging a highway in the area of the council is a source of nuisance to pedestrians
using that highway, the council may serve a notice under this section upon the owner
or occupier of the building or structure.

This subsection is subject to the provisions of the Wildlife and Countryside Act 1981
(c. 69) and to subsection (4) below.

(2) If after reasonable enquiry the council have been unable to ascertain the name and
address of the owner or occupier, they may affix a notice to the building or structure.

(3) A notice under this section is a notice requiring, within such reasonable time (not
being less than 28 days) as may be specified in the notice, the owner or occupier of the
building or structure to take measures for the purpose of preventing or minimising the
habitual nesting, roosting or alighting of birds on the part of the building or structure
concerned and the council may specify such measures in the notice.

(4) The measures which may be specified in a notice under this section may include the
erection of baffles, nets or wires or the laying of gel on the building or structure or
other measures of a like nature but shall not include any method prohibited by the
said Act of 1981.

(5) The sections of the Public Health Act 1936 (c. 49) mentioned in Schedule 1 to this Act
shall have effect as if references therein to that Act included references to this section.

(6) This section shall have effect as if it were an Act or order to which section 42 of
the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1976 (c. 57) (which makes
provision for certain local Acts and orders to be subject to the planning enactments)
applies.

(7) Subsections (8) to (10) below apply where a borough council serve a notice under this
section on—

(a) the British Railways Board, in respect of any bridge owned by the Board; or
(b) any protected party in respect of its operational land,

and the notice specifies measures to be taken for the purpose mentioned in
subsection (3) above.

(8) The party on whom a notice under this section is served may, within a period of 28
days beginning with the day on which the notice is served, serve a counter-notice on
the borough council specifying alternative measures which will in their reasonable
opinion have the effect of preventing or minimising the habitual nesting, roosting or

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1981/69
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1981/69
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1936/49
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1976/57


6 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 3 – Public health and the environment

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

alighting of birds on the part of the building or structure concerned to the same or
greater extent than the measures specified in the notice.

(9) Where a counter-notice is served under subsection (8) above, the notice served under
subsection (1) above shall be deemed to specify the alternative measures specified in
the counter-notice and shall be deemed to have been served on the date the counter-
notice was served.

(10) Where a counter-notice is served under subsection (8) above and, before the expiry of
the period of 28 days beginning with the date on which the counter-notice is served,
the council serves a further notice requiring further measures to be taken, the protected
party shall comply with the further notice within such period as may be specified in
the further notice.

(11) The measures specified in any such further notice shall complement the measures
specified in the counter-notice to which it relates.

(12) The period within which—
(a) an owner or occupier must comply with the requirements of a notice served

under subsection (1) above; or
(b) a protected party must comply with the requirements of—

(i) a counter-notice served under subsection (8) above; or
(ii) a further notice under subsection (10) above,

may be extended with the agreement of the council.

(13) In this section “protected party” means—
(a) Network Rail Infrastructure Limited;
(b) Transport for London;
(c) the British Waterways Board;
(d) the Port of London Authority,

and their subsidiaries (within the meaning given by section 736 of the Companies Act
1985 (c. 6)), servants, agents and contractors.

10 Dangerous structures and demolitions

(1) Section 81(1)(b) (Local Authority’s power to serve notice about demolition) of the
Act of 1984 shall have effect in the area of a borough council as if—

(a) for the reference to an order made under section 77 (Dangerous building) of
the Act of 1984 there were substituted a reference to an order made under
section 64 (Proceedings to enforce compliance with notice) of the Act of 1939;
and

(b) for the reference to a notice given under section 79 (Ruinous and dilapidated
buildings and neglected sites) of the Act of 1984 there were substituted a
reference to an order under section 69 (Removal of dilapidated and neglected
structures) of the Act of 1939.

(2) Section 45 of the London Local Authorities Act 2000 (c. vii) is amended as follows—
(a) in subsection (4), after “dangerous buildings)” the words “, section 78

(Dangerous building – emergency measures)” are inserted;
(b) in subsection (5), the figures “77 to 80, 82, 83” are replaced by the figures

“77 to 79”; and

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1985/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/2000/7


London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 3 – Public health and the environment
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

7

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(c) in subsection (6), in the definition of “the London Building Acts”, the words
“as amended” to the end are omitted.

(3) A borough council may recover from a person on whom a notice is served under
section 81 of the Act of 1984 any expenses reasonably incurred by them under that
section, in addition to any expenses recoverable under section 99 of that Act.

(4) Sections 107 to 110 of the Act of 1984 shall apply in respect of expenses recoverable
under subsection (3) above as they apply in respect of expenses to which those sections
apply.

(5) In its application under subsection (4) above, for the reference in the said section 107
to the person who is the owner of the premises at the date on which the works were
completed there shall be substituted a reference to the person on whom the notice
under the said section 81 was served.

(6) In this section—
“the Act of 1939” means the London Building Acts (Amendment) Act 1939

(c. xcvii);
“the Act of 1984” means the Building Act 1984 (c. 55).

11 Repair, etc., of vehicles on highways

(1) Subsection (2)(b) of section 5 (Repair, etc., of vehicles on highways) of the Greater
London Council (General Powers) Act 1982 (c. i) is repealed.

(2) After subsection (4) of that section, the following subsection is inserted—

“(4A) A person shall not be convicted of an offence under this section if he proves to
the satisfaction of the court that the works were carried out otherwise than—

(a) in the course of, or for the purposes of, a business; or
(b) for gain or reward.”.

12 Defacement of buildings

(1) Section 12 (Defacement of buildings) of the London Local Authorities Act 1995 (c. x)
is amended in accordance with this section.

(2) In subsections (1)(a), (1)(b), (3) and (7) the words “, apparatus or plant” are inserted
after “premises”.

(3) In subsection (6), at the end, the words “and, subject to subsection (6A) below, they
may recover from the said person the expenses reasonably incurred by them in so
doing” are inserted.

(4) After subsection (6) the following subsections are inserted—

“(6A) The council may not recover their expenses under subsection (6) above in
respect of a sign on a surface to which this section applies if the surface—

(a) forms part of a flat or a dwellinghouse; or
(b) is within the curtilage of or forms part of the boundary of the curtilage

of a dwellinghouse.

(6B) In proceedings by the council against the person served with the notice for the
recovery of any expenses which the council are entitled to recover from that

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1939/97
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1939/97
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/55
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1982/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1982/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1995/10


8 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 3 – Public health and the environment

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

person, it shall not be open to that person to raise any question which could
have been raised on an appeal under this section.

(6C) Sections 291 and 293 of the Public Health Act 1936 (c. 49) shall have effect
as if references therein to that Act included references to this section.

(6D) No council shall exercise their powers to recover expenses from any person
under subsection (6) above until a code of practice dealing with the exercise
of those powers has been published by a joint committee.”.

(5) In subsection (9), the words “premises, apparatus or plant” are substituted for
“building, wall, fence or other structure or erection”.

(6) After subsection (9) the following subsection is inserted—

“(10) In this section—
“dwellinghouse” does not include a building containing one or

more flats, or a flat contained within such a building;
“flat” means a separate and self-contained set of premises

constructed or adapted for use for the purpose of a dwelling and
forming part of a building from some other part of which it is divided
horizontally;

“joint committee” means any joint committee established under
section 101(5) of the Local Government Act 1972 (c. 70) and
comprising at least one member from each borough council;

“premises” means building, wall, fence or other structure or
erection.”.

13 Defacement of buildings: protection of universal postal service providers

(1) For the purposes of section 12(1) (Defacement of buildings) of the London Local
Authorities Act 1995 (c. x), a universal service provider shall be deemed to be the
occupier of any plant or apparatus comprising a universal postal service letter box or
universal postal service pouch-box belonging to it.

(2) Before serving any notice under section 12(1)(a) of that Act in respect of a universal
postal service letter box or universal postal service pouch-box a council shall serve not
less than 28 days' notice of their intention to do so on the universal service provider
to which the letter box or pouch-box belongs.

(3) In this section—
“universal service provider” means any universal service provider for the

purposes of the Postal Services Act 2000 (c. 26);
“universal postal service letter box” has the meaning given in section 86(4)

of that Act;
“universal postal service pouch-box” has the meaning given in paragraph

1(10) of Schedule 6 to that Act.

14 Defacement of buildings: further protection of railway and waterway
undertakers

(1) Section 12 (Defacement of buildings) of the London Local Authorities Act 1995 shall
not apply to any surface which forms part of the operational land of a protected party
unless it is a surface to which this section applies.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1936/49
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/70
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1995/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1995/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/26


London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 4 – Fixed penalties
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

9

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(2) This section applies to any surface which abuts on or to which access is given directly
from—

(a) a street; or
(b) any place other than a street to which the public have access as of right.

(3) In this section—
“protected party” has the same meaning as in section 13 of the said Act

of 1995;
“street” includes any highway, any bridge carrying a highway and any road,

lane, mews, footway, square, court, alley or passage, whether a thoroughfare
or not.

PART 4

FIXED PENALTIES

15 Fixed penalty offences

(1) Where on any occasion an authorised officer of a borough council finds a person who
he has reason to believe has on that occasion committed, in the area of that council,
an offence under—

(a) any of the enactments mentioned in columns (1) and (2) of the table set out in
Schedule 2 to this Act and described in column (3) of that table; or

(b) any byelaws made by the borough council under any enactment,
the officer may give that person a notice offering him the opportunity of discharging
any liability to conviction for that offence by payment of a fixed penalty.

(2) Sections 16 (Fixed penalty notices), 17 (Levels of fixed penalties) and 18 (Fixed
penalties: reserve powers of Secretary of State) of this Act shall apply in respect of
fixed penalty notices under this section.

(3) The Secretary of State may, by regulations, amend Schedule 2 to this Act by the
addition of further offences to the list of offences therein described.

(4) An authorised officer may not exercise the powers under subsection (1) above, and
the said section 16 shall have no effect, until the levels of fixed penalties set by the
councils in accordance with the said section 17 have come into force for the first time
in accordance with the said section 18.

16 Fixed penalty notices

(1) The provisions of this section shall have effect in relation to notices (in this section
referred to as “fixed penalty notices”) which may be given under section 15 (Fixed
penalty offences) of this Act by an authorised officer in respect of an offence.

(2) Where a person is given a fixed penalty notice in respect of an offence—
(a) no proceedings shall be instituted for that offence before the expiration of 14

days following the date of the notice; and
(b) he shall not be convicted of that offence if he pays the fixed penalty before

the expiration of that period.



10 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 4 – Fixed penalties

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(3) A notice under this section shall give such particulars of the circumstances alleged to
constitute the offence as are necessary for giving reasonable information of the offence
and shall state—

(a) the period during which, by virtue of subsection (2) above, proceedings will
not be taken for the offence;

(b) the amount of the fixed penalty; and
(c) the name of the person to whom and the address at which the fixed penalty

may be paid,
and without prejudice to payment by any other method, payment of the fixed penalty
may be made by pre-paying and posting to that person at that address a letter containing
the amount of the penalty (in cash or otherwise).

(4) Where a letter is sent in accordance with subsection (3) above, payment shall be
regarded as having been made at the time at which that letter would be delivered in
the ordinary course of post.

(5) The form of notices under this section shall be such as the Secretary of State may by
order prescribe.

(6) The fixed penalty payable in pursuance of a fixed penalty notice under this section
shall be paid to the borough council.

(7) Schedule 3 to this Act shall have effect with respect to financial provisions relating to
fixed penalties payable in pursuance of a fixed penalty notice under this section.

(8) In any proceedings a certificate which—
(a) purports to be signed by or on behalf of the chief finance officer of the borough

council; and
(b) states that payment of a fixed penalty was or was not received by a date

specified in the certificate,
shall be evidence of the facts stated.

(9) In this section, “chief finance officer”, in relation to a borough council, means the
person having responsibility for the financial affairs of the council.

17 Levels of fixed penalties

(1) It shall be the duty of the borough councils to set the levels of fixed penalties payable
to them under section 16 (Fixed penalty notices) of this Act.

(2) Different levels may be set for different areas in Greater London and for different
cases or classes of case.

(3) In setting the level of fixed penalty under subsection (1) above the councils may take
account of—

(a) any reasonable costs or expected costs incurred or to be incurred in connection
with the administration of the provisions of the enactment under which the
particular fixed penalty offence is created; and

(b) the cost or expected cost of enforcing the provisions of the relevant enactment.

(4) Levels of fixed penalties set by the councils in accordance with this section may only
come into force in accordance with section 18 (Fixed penalties: reserve powers of
Secretary of State) of this Act.



London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 4 – Fixed penalties
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

11

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(5) The councils shall publish, in such manner as the Secretary of State may determine,
the levels of fixed penalties which have been set by the councils in accordance with
this section.

(6) The functions conferred on councils by subsections (1) and (5) above shall be
discharged by the joint committee.

(7) In this section, and the said section 18, “the joint committee” means any joint
committee established under section 101(5) of the Local Government Act 1972 (c. 70)
and comprising at least one member from each borough council.

The joint committee is to be formed before the end of the period of six months
commencing on the date on which this Act is passed.

18 Fixed penalties: reserve powers of Secretary of State

(1) Where the borough councils set any levels of fixed penalties under subsection (1) of
section 17 (Levels of fixed penalties) of this Act, they shall notify the Secretary of
State of the levels of fixed penalties so set.

(2) Where notification of any levels of fixed penalties is required to be given under
subsection (1) above, the levels of fixed penalties shall not come into force until after
the expiration of—

(a) the period of one month beginning with the day on which the notification is
given; or

(b) such shorter period as the Secretary of State may allow.

(3) If, before the expiration of that period, the Secretary of State gives notice to the joint
committee that he objects to the levels of fixed penalties on the grounds that some or
all of them are or may be excessive, those levels of fixed penalties shall not come into
force unless and until the objection has been withdrawn.

(4) If, at any time before the levels of fixed penalties required to be notified under
subsection (1) above to the Secretary of State have come into force, the Secretary of
State considers that some or all of them are excessive, he may make regulations setting
the levels of fixed penalties.

(5) Levels of fixed penalties set under subsection (4) above must be no higher than those
notified under subsection (1) above.

(6) Regulations under subsection (4) above are without prejudice to the duty imposed on
borough councils by subsection (1) of the said section 17; but where the Secretary of
State makes any such regulations the councils must not set any further fixed penalties
under the said subsection (1) until after the expiration of the period of 12 months
beginning with the day on which the regulations are made.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/70


12 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 5 – Miscellaneous

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

PART 5

MISCELLANEOUS

19 Night café licensing

(1) In section 4 (Interpretation of Part II) of the London Local Authorities Act 1990 (c. vii),
in the definition of “night café”, for paragraphs (a) and (b) there shall be substituted—

“(a) any premises in a borough which are kept open, for public
refreshments, at any time between 11pm and 5am; or

(aa) any premises in a borough which—
(i) are kept open, for public refreshment on the premises, at any

time between 5am and 11pm; and
(ii) are also open, but not for that purpose, at any time between

11pm and 5am; or
(b) any premises in a borough where meals or refreshments are supplied,

for consumption exclusively off the premises, at any time between
midnight and 5am; or”.

(2) The said section 4 as so amended shall be renumbered as subsection (1) of that section
and after that provision as so renumbered there shall be inserted—

“(2) Paragraph (aa) of the definition of “night café” in subsection (1) above does
not apply to any premises solely because persons are allowed to remain in the
premises in order to finish the consumption of refreshment provided to them
before 11pm, at any time between 11pm and 11.20pm.”.

(3) Section 17 (which makes provision about powers of entry in respect of night cafés) of
the said Act of 1990 applies in the area of a borough council as if, after subsection (1)
(b), the following paragraph were inserted—

“(c) An authorised officer may at all reasonable times enter upon, inspect
and examine premises which are licensed under this Part of this Act
to ascertain whether conditions attached to the licence by virtue of
section 6 (Licensing) of this Act are being complied with.”.

20 Street trading

(1) Part III (Street trading) of the London Local Authorities Act 1990 (c. vii) is amended
in accordance with Schedule 4 to this Act.

(2) The definition of “street trading” in section 2 (Interpretation) of the City of
Westminster Act 1999 (c. i) is amended by the insertion, after paragraph (a), of the
following paragraph—

“(aa) the purchasing of or offering to purchase any ticket for gain or reward;
and”.

21 Licensing: powers of entry

(1) Paragraph 12(1) of Schedule 12 (Licensing of public entertainment in Greater London)
of the London Government Act 1963 (c. 33) applies in the area of a borough council
as if the words from “at which he has reason to believe” to “about to be given” were
omitted.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1990/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1990/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1999/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1999/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1963/33


London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 5 – Miscellaneous
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

13

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(2) Section 15 of the London Local Authorities Act 1991 (c. xiii) (which makes provision
about powers of entry in respect of special treatment premises), is amended by the
insertion after subsection (1) of the following subsection—

“(1A) An authorised officer may at all reasonable times enter upon, inspect and
examine premises which are licensed under this Part of this Act to ascertain
whether conditions attached to the licence by virtue of section 6 (Licensing
under Part II) of this Act are being complied with.”.

22 Soliciting for custom

(1) Subject to the following provisions, it is an offence, in a public place in the area of a
borough council, to solicit persons, or to permit the soliciting of persons, to attend—

(a) premises which the council are satisfied are being, or within the last 7 days
have been, used for the unlicensed sale of intoxicating liquor for consumption
on, or in the vicinity of, the premises;

(b) premises which the council are satisfied are being, or within the last 7
days have been, used for the purposes of public dancing or music and any
other public entertainment of the like kind, but which are not licensed under
paragraph 12 of Schedule 12 to the London Government Act 1963 (c. 33);

(c) premises which the council are satisfied are being, or within the last 7 days
have been, used for the provision of—

(i) entertainment of a description falling within paragraph 2(e), (f) or (g)
of Schedule 1 to the Licensing Act 2003 (c. 17); or

(ii) entertainment facilities falling within paragraph 3(1) of that Schedule,
and in respect of which a premises licence under Part 3 of that Act is required
but not held; or

(d) near beer premises within the meaning of section 14 of the London Local
Authorities Act 1995 (c. x) in respect of which no near beer licence under
section 16 (Licensing) of that Act is held.

(2) A person guilty of an offence under this section shall be liable on summary conviction
to a fine not exceeding level 4 on the standard scale.

(3) This section shall not apply in respect of the operational land of a person authorised
by any enactment to carry on any railway, light railway or tramway undertaking.

(4) In this section “public place” includes any highway and any other premises or place in
the open to which at the material time the public have or are permitted to have access
(whether on payment or otherwise).

23 Greater London Magistrates' Courts Authority

Regulations under section 59B(3) of the Justices of the Peace Act 1997 (c. 25) may
provide that the amount to be paid by each London local authority to the Greater
London Magistrates' Courts Authority under that subsection may be determined by
reference to the council tax base for each London local authority, calculated in
accordance with regulations made under section 33 of the Local Government Finance
Act 1992 (c. 14).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1991/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1963/33
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2003/17
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1995/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/1995/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1997/25
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/14


14 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 5 – Miscellaneous

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

24 Hotel Proprietors Act 1956

(1) The Hotel Proprietors Act 1956 (c. 62) (which makes provision for the making good
of loss or damage to a guest’s property by hotel proprietors) shall have effect in the
area of a borough council as if—

(a) in section 2(3) for “fifty pounds” there were substituted “£750” and for “one
hundred pounds” there were substituted “£1,500”; and

(b) in paragraph (b) of the Schedule for “£50” there were substituted “£750” and
for “£100” there were substituted “£1,500”.

(2) The Secretary of State may, by regulations, alter the amounts mentioned in the said
section 2(3) and paragraph (b) as amended by subsection (1) above.

(3) Regulations under this section may have effect only in relation to the area of a borough
council.

25 Enforcement of control as to advertisements

Section 224 (Enforcement of control as to advertisements) of the Town and Country
Planning Act 1990 (c. 8) shall apply in the area of a borough council as if—

(a) in subsection (5) for the words “if he proves that it was displayed without
his knowledge or consent” there were substituted “if he proves either of the
matters specified in subsection (6) below”; and

(b) after that subsection there were inserted—

“(6) The matters are—
(a) that the advertisement was displayed or, as the case may be,

continued to be displayed without his knowledge; or
(b) that he took all reasonable steps and exercised all due

diligence to prevent the display or, as the case may be, to
secure that the display was discontinued.”.

26 Provision of information to authorised officer

(1) This section applies where an authorised officer of a borough council has reasonable
grounds for suspecting that any offence in respect of which the council may prosecute
legal proceedings has been committed or attempted, or is being committed or
attempted.

(2) If, on being requested by the authorised officer to furnish his name and address for
service of a summons or fixed penalty notice, the relevant person—

(a) fails to furnish a name; or
(b) furnishes a false name; or
(c) furnishes a false address,

the relevant person shall, unless the authorised officer failed to produce his
authorisation on making the request, be guilty of an offence punishable on summary
conviction by a fine not exceeding level 5 on the standard scale.

(3) In this section “the relevant person” means any person whom the authorised officer
has reasonable grounds to suspect of having committed or having attempted to commit
the offence or being in the course of committing or attempting to commit it.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1956/62
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/8


London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 6 – Supplemental
Document Generated: 2023-05-25

15

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

27 Application of London Local Authorities Act 2000

(1) In the definition of “participating council” in section 2 (Interpretation) of the London
Local Authorities Act 2000 (c. vii), the words “other than Barnet” are repealed and
the provisions of that Act shall apply in the area of the London Borough of Barnet.

(2) In the definition of “outer London borough” in subsection (6) of section 45 (Dangerous
structures) of that Act, the words “but does not include the London Borough of Barnet”
are repealed.

(3) Subsection (1) of section 4 (Service of penalty charge notice on the basis of
information provided by camera, etc.) of that Act is repealed.

PART 6

SUPPLEMENTAL

28 Authorised officers

(1) In this Act “authorised officer”, in relation to a borough council, means—
(a) any employee of the council;
(b) any person by whom, in pursuance of arrangements made with the council,

any functions under this Act fall to be discharged; or
(c) any employee of any such person,

who is authorised in writing by the council to act in relation to the relevant provision
of this Act.

(2) In each of the scheduled Acts “authorised officer”, in relation to a borough council,
shall have the same meaning as in subsection (1) above save that—

(a) the reference to the relevant provision of this Act shall include a reference to
the relevant provision of the Act as so mentioned; and

(b) where appropriate, the reference to the participating council includes a
reference to the borough council under the Act so mentioned.

(3) The Environmental Protection Act 1990 (c. 43) shall have effect in the area of a
borough council as if—

(a) in subsection (10) of section 88, for the definition of “authorised officer” there
were substituted the following definition—

““authorised officer” means—
(a) any employee of the litter authority;
(b) any person by whom, in pursuance of arrangements made

with the litter authority, any functions under this Act fall to
be discharged; or

(c) any employee of any such person,
who is authorised in writing by the litter authority to act in relation to
the relevant provision of this Act.”.

(4) The definition of “authorised officer” in section 2 of each of the scheduled Acts is
hereby repealed.

(5) In this section the “scheduled Acts” means the Acts specified in Schedule 5 to this Act.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/2000/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukla/2000/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/43


16 London Local Authorities Act 2004 (c. 1)
Part 6 – Supplemental

Document Generated: 2023-05-25
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This

item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

29 Obstruction of authorised officer

Any person who intentionally obstructs any authorised officer acting in the exercise
of his powers under this Act shall be guilty of an offence and liable on summary
conviction to a fine not exceeding level 3 on the standard scale.

30 Defence of due diligence

(1) In proceedings for an offence under this Act it shall be a defence for the person charged
to prove that he took all reasonable precautions and exercised all due diligence to avoid
the commission of the offence.

(2) If in any case the defence provided under subsection (1) above involves the allegation
that the commission of the offence was due to the act or default of another person, the
person charged shall not, without leave of the court, be entitled to rely on that defence
unless, no later than 7 clear days before the hearing, he has served on the prosecutor
a notice in writing giving such information as was then in his possession identifying
or assisting in the identification of that other person.

31 Liability of directors, etc.

(1) Where an offence under this Act committed by a body corporate is proved to have been
committed with the consent or connivance of, or to be attributable to any neglect on
the part of, a director, manager, secretary or other similar officer of the body corporate
or any person who was purporting to act in any such capacity, he, as well as the body
corporate, shall be guilty of the offence.

(2) Where the affairs of the body corporate are managed by its members, subsection (1)
above shall apply to the acts and defaults of a member in connection with his functions
of management as if he were a director of the body corporate.

32 Regulations

(1) Any power to make regulations conferred by this Act includes power to make
provision in respect of such cases only as may be specified in the regulations and to
make different provision for different circumstances.

(2) Any power to make regulations conferred by this Act shall be exercised by statutory
instrument.

(3) Any statutory instrument made under this Act shall be subject to annulment in
pursuance of a resolution of either House of Parliament.


