
Coronavirus (Scotland) (No.2) Act 2020 asp 10
SCHEDULE 4 – Other measures in response to coronavirus
Document Generated: 2023-08-13

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

SCHEDULE 4
OTHER MEASURES IN RESPONSE TO CORONAVIRUS

PART 11

TRAFFIC REGULATION

15 (1) The Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 applies in accordance with the modifications
in this paragraph.

(2) Section 15 has effect as if—
(a) in subsection (1)(a) for “six months” there were substituted “eighteen

months”,
(b) in subsection (5) for “six months” there were substituted “eighteen months”.


