
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

Marriage and Civil Partnership
(Scotland) Act 2014

2014 asp 5

PART 1

MARRIAGE

CHAPTER 5

OTHER CHANGES TO MARRIAGE PROCEDURE

18 The Marriage Schedule

(1) The 1977 Act is amended as follows.

(2) In section 6 (the Marriage Schedule)—
(a) after subsection (1) insert—

“(1A) Regulations under subsection (1) prescribing the form of the Marriage
Schedule may make different provision for different cases or
circumstances.”, and

(b) in subsection (4)(a), for “14 days” in both places where those words appear
substitute “28 days”.

(3) In section 7(2) (issuing of certificate in respect of legal capacity to marry), for “14
days” substitute “28 days”.

(4) In section 19(1) (period between receipt of marriage notice and solemnisation of
marriage), for “14 days” substitute “28 days”.


