
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student
Finance) (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023, Section 26. (See end of Document for details)

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 87

The Education (Student Finance) (Miscellaneous
Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023

PART 5
Amendments to the Education (Student Support) (Wales) Regulations 2017

CHAPTER 2

Financial support – uplifts

26. In regulation 50—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£91” substitute “£93”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£176” substitute “£179”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(c), for “£192” substitute “£196”;
(d) in paragraph (1)(d), for “£192” substitute “£196”;
(e) in paragraph (1)(e), for “£138” substitute “£141”.

Commencement Information
I1 Reg. 26 in force at 22.2.2023, see reg. 1(2)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2023/87/regulation/1/2


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Education (Student Finance)
(Miscellaneous Amendments) (Wales) Regulations 2023, Section 26.


