
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2018 No. 14

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements
and Default Scheme) (Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2018

Amendments to the Council Tax Reduction Schemes and Prescribed Requirements (Wales)
Regulations 2013

10. In Schedule 7 (applicable amounts: persons who are not pensioners)—
(a) in column (2) of the Table in paragraph 1 (personal allowances)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (1) for “£73.85” in each place in which it occurs substitute “£76.10”
and for “£58.50” substitute “£60.25”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£73.85” substitute “£76.10”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (3) for “£116.00” substitute “£119.50”;

(b) in paragraph 2(a) after “the applicant” insert “or the applicant is a member of the work-
related activity group”;

(c) in the Table in Part 4 (amounts of premiums specified in Part 3), in the second column—
(i) in sub-paragraph (1) for “£32.55” and “£46.40” substitute “£33.55” and “£47.80”

respectively;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (2) for “£62.45” in each place in which it occurs substitute “£64.30”

and for “£124.90” substitute “£128.60”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (3) for “£60.90” substitute “£62.86”;
(iv) in sub-paragraph (4) for “£34.95” substitute “£36.00”;
(v) in sub-paragraph (5) for “£24.78”, “£15.90” and “£22.85” substitute “£25.48”,

“£16.40” and “£23.55” respectively;
(d) in Part 5 (the components), in paragraph 18(c)(ii) omit “or the work-related activity

component”;
(e) in Part 6 (amount of components), in paragraph 24 (amount of support component), for

“£36.55” substitute “£37.65”.


