
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 709

The National Health Service (Travelling
Expenses and Remission of Charges) (Wales)

(Amendment) (No.2) Regulations 2009

Title, commencement, application and interpretation

1.—(1)  The title of these Regulations is the National Health Service (Travelling Expenses and
Remission of Charges) (Wales) (Amendment) (No.2) Regulations 2009.

(2)  These Regulations come into force on 6 April 2009.
(3)  These Regulations apply in relation to Wales.
(4)  In these Regulations “the principal Regulations” (“y prif Reoliadau”) means the National

Health Service (Travelling Expenses and Remission of Charges) (Wales) Regulations 2007(1).

Amendment of regulation 5 of the principal Regulations

2. In regulation 5 of the principal Regulations (entitlement to full remission and payment), in
paragraph (1), for “£15,050” substitute “£15,276”.

Amendment of Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations

3. In Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations (Modifications of the Income Support (General)
Regulations 1987), in column 2 of Table A, in the entry relating to regulation 53, for “£19,000”
substitute “£20,750”.

16 March 2009

Edwina Hart
Minister for Health and Social Services, one of

the Welsh Ministers

(1) S.I.2007/1104 (W.116); relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2008/1480 (W.153), 1879 and 2568 (W.226).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2007/1104
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2008/1480
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1879
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/wsi/2008/2568

