Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

WELSH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2008 No. 3170

The Assembly Learning Grants and Loans (Higher
Education) (Wales) (No.2) Regulations 2008

PART 14
AMENDMENT OF THE 2008 REGULATIONS

Amendment of the 2008 Regulations

112.—(1) The 2008 Regulations are amended in accordance with the following paragraphs.
(2) Inregulation 2, for the definition of “contribution”, substitute—

contribution” (“cyfraniad”) means, in relation to—

(a) an eligible student, the student’s contribution calculated pursuant to regulation 53 and
Schedule 5;

(b) an eligible part-time student, the student’s contribution calculated pursuant to
regulation 831 and Schedule 6;”.

(3) Inregulation 2, for the definition of “household income”, substitute—

““household income” (“incwm yr aelwyd, incwm aelwyd ac incwm sydd gan yr aelwyd”) in
relation to—

(a) an eligible student, has the meaning given in Schedule 5;
(b) an eligible part-time student, has the meaning given in Schedule 6;”.
(4) In regulation 16(9), for “paragraph (1) or (2)” substitute “paragraph (7) or (8)”.
(5) Paragraph (6) of regulation 18 is omitted.
(6) In regulation 33, for “regulations 30 to 32”, substitute “regulations 31 and 32”.
(7) In paragraph (1)(g) of regulation 67, for “£2.00”, substitute “£1.99”.
(8) In paragraph (5)(g) of regulation 82, for “£2.00”, substitute “£1.99”.
(9) In sub-paragraph (5) of paragraph 1 in Schedule 1, for “sub-paragraph (3)”, substitute “sub-
paragraph (4)”.
(10) In sub-paragraph (4) of paragraph 3 in Schedule 6, for “paragraph (b)”, substitute
“paragraph (a)”.
(11) In sub-paragraph (1)(a) of paragraph 7 in Schedule 6, for “paragraph 77, substitute
“paragraph 6”.

(12) In sub-paragraph (1)(b) of paragraph 7 in Schedule 6, for “paragraph 77, substitute
“paragraph 6.



